


LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

(NAF / PAF)

ACCIDENT INVOLVING i 40 SHC7211B  ,  SMJ7843G  ON 29-Sep-22 18:25

ALONG KEPPLE BAY VIEW (CONDO REFLECTION)

I / We CHIA HAN CHOON   (Hirer) NRIC No.: SXXXX875D

and/or GOBINATHAN S/O SIN…   (Relief) NRIC No.: SXXXX477E

Taxi Number SHC7211B

hereby authorise ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd(CDGE):

1. To submit my/our claims for damages, costs and expense, including loss of earning 

   (Pending successful recovery),  loss of rental,medical fee and legal costs.

2. To have absolute discretion to agree to any settlement or compensation amount in respect of my/our claim

     against third party (except personal injuries and medical claims).

3. To sign Discharge Voucher on my/our behalf.

4. To accept any payment (claim proceeds) in respect of the claim against third party and payment by cheque 

    shall be forward directly to CDGE in accordance with CDGE's instruction and made in favour of

    "ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd".

Date 30-Sep-2022

Name of Hirer CHIA HAN CHOON

Hirer NRIC SXXXX875D Signature :

Address 69 BEDOK SOUTH AVENUE 3 #07-4…

460069

Contact No. 97820489

Name of Relief GOBINATHAN S/O SINNASAMY

Relief NRIC SXXXX477E Signature :

Address 68 BEDOK SOUTH AVENUE 3 20-516

460068

Contact No.
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Our Ref: CC22090519

Date: 10 October 2022

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT ON 29/09/2022 @ 18:25 hrs
ALONG KEPPLE BAY VIEW (CONDO REFLECTION)
INVOLVING SMJ7843G

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717           Mainline +65 6555 1188           Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 16 February 2023 9:23 AM
To: Kazali Haji Selahudin
Cc: Admin A; CS A Team
Subject: RE: ALLIANZ - SHC7211B AND SMJ7843G ON 29.09.22 *** LKK REF: 

CC4/AIS22009799/Tpa3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
Dear Sirs 
 
Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at S$2,329.85(all in) in full and 
final settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their insured 
arising out of this incident.  
 
If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of your Bank details for us to process 
payment.   
 
Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of 
liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore 
and/or our insured as a result of the accident on 29 SEPT 2022.  
 
Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or 
payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability. 
 
Thank you.  
 
 
 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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From: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, February 8, 2023 4:47 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ALLIANZ - SHC7211B AND SMJ7843G ON 29.09.22 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22009799/Tpa3  
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 

Your proposed offer below is accepted. Kindly let us have your principal's DV for our execution and early 
return. Thank you.  

  

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any 
personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver or his passenger/s. This condition shall apply even if 
medical expenses are claimed herewith and part of the settlement reached.  

 
 
Best Regards 
Kazali Hj Selahudin (Mr) 
Claims Department / ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd 
DID: 6214 8736 

 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, 8 February 2023 9:26 am 
To: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ALLIANZ - SHC7211B AND SMJ7843G ON 29.09.22 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22009799/Tpa3  
  

CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links or open attachment 
unless you know the sender.  

 
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
We propose settlement as follows: - 
  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 1,765.50 
2. Loss of Rental (3.5days x $110.67) $     387.35 
3. Loss of Income (3.5days x $50.00) $     175.00 
4. LTA/GIA Search Fee $         2.00 

Total $ 2,329.85 
  
PLEASE CONFIRM ACCEPTANCE. 
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Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 30 January 2023 10:00 AM 
To: Sabrina Tan Quee Ping <SabrinaTan@cdge.com.sg>; Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong 
(LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Allianz - Claims Banca (AGCS) <claims@allianz.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-
a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ALLIANZ - SHC7211B AND SMJ7843G ON 29.09.22 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22009799/Tpa3  
  
Dear Sir / Madam, 
  
Thank you for your email. 
  
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 
  
Hi HT, 
  
Kindly assist. 
  
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
  
Thank you. 
Best Regards, 
Mei Kwan | Admin  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Sabrina Tan Quee Ping <SabrinaTan@cdge.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, January 25, 2023 2:06 PM 
To: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg> 
Cc: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Allianz - Claims Banca (AGCS) <claims@allianz.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ALLIANZ - SHC7211B AND SMJ7843G ON 29.09.22 
  
  
  

  

Dear Kazali - fyi 
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Thank you. 

  

Best Regards 

Sabrina Tan  

Claims Department / ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd  

 

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Sent: Sunday, 22 January 2023 9:45 pm 
To: Sabrina Tan Quee Ping <SabrinaTan@cdge.com.sg>; admin-a@lkkauto.com <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Yan (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: ALLIANZ - SHC7211B AND SMJ7843G ON 29.09.22  
  

CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links or open attachment 
unless you know the sender.  

  

Internal 

  
“Without Prejudice” 
  
Dear Sir/Madam 
  
Your Claim Ref: CC0922/SHC7211B/KS(st) 
Our Claim Ref: 2022 22007155JK-SMJ7843G 
  
We acknowledge receipt of your Letter of Demand dated  , January 10, 2023 received via email. 
  
Our Direct settlement Partner  LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  , is in the midst of reviewing your claim matter and will keep 
you informed once there is any update.  
  
Should you require any clarification or assistance, please do not hesitate to contact our Claims Department at 
claims@allianz.com.sg 
  
Thank you. 
  
  
Claims & Performance Management Department 
 Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 
79 Robinson Road #09-01 Singapore 068897 
www.allianz.sg  
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Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain 
confidential and / or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or 
disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail 
and any copies of it. Thank you. 
P Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 
  
  
  
  

From: Sabrina Tan Quee Ping <SabrinaTan@cdge.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, January 10, 2023 10:34 AM 
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Cc: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXT] ALLIANZ - SHC7211B AND SMJ7843G ON 29.09.22 
  
  
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Sirs 
M/s Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd 
  
Attached are our LOD documents for the above subject matter. 
  
Kindly review and settle our claims amicably with our Mr Kazali who is copied herein. 
Tel: 6214 8736          Email: kazali@cdge.com.sg 
  
Thank you 
  
Best Regards 

Sabrina Tan 
Claims Department / ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd  

 

  

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify 
us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents 
therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation 
Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein 
shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a 
written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.  
 
ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you 
to print this only if necessary.  
 
ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]  
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This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify 
us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents 
therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation 
Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein 
shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a 
written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.  
 
ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you 
to print this only if necessary.  
 
ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]  
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 16 February 2023 9:59 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A; CS A Team
Subject: Re: ALLIANZ - SHC7211B AND SMJ7843G ON 29.09.22 *** LKK REF: 

CC4/AIS22009799/Tpa3

Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Please refer to our email of 08/02/2023 accepting your offer at $2,329.85. Please refer below the bank 
details as requested. Kindly get your principal to effect payment. Thank you. 
 

Account Name  ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd  
Bank Name  The Development Bank of Singapore Limited  

Branch Name  MBFC Branch  

Bank Address  
12, Marina Boulevard  

#46-00, DBS Asia Central, MBFC Tower 3,  
Singapore 018982  

Account No  001-069544-4  
Bank Code  7171  

Branch Code  001  
Swift Code  DBSSSGSG (Overseas Remittance)  

 
Email confirmation of payment to Cdgear@cdge.com.sg  
 
 
Best Regards 
Kazali Hj Selahudin (Mr) 
Claims Department / ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd 
DID: 6214 8736 

 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Thursday, 16 February 2023 9:22 am 
To: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ALLIANZ - SHC7211B AND SMJ7843G ON 29.09.22 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22009799/Tpa3  
  
CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links or open attachment 
unless you know the sender.  

 
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
  
Dear Sirs 
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Claim Notification - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMJ7843G(ALLIANZ) AND SHC7611B
ALONG KEPPEL BAY VIEW ON 29/09/2022

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Sun 9/10/2022 6:11 PM
To: AXEL.BADER@GMAIL.COM <AXEL.BADER@GMAIL.COM>;GABYROCATTI@GMAIL.COM <GABYROCATTI@GMAIL.COM>

AXEL BADER                                                    [Email only]
Driver: GABRIELA ALEYANDRA ROCATTI
 
Dear Sirs,
 
OUR REF              : CC4/AIS22009799/Tpa3
YOUR REF            : SMJ7843G
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMJ7843G(ALLIANZ) AND SHC7611B ALONG KEPPEL BAY VIEW ON 29/09/2022
 
We refer to the above subject matter.  We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your
motor insurer, Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.
 
We have received a third party claim(s) from SHC7611B against your motor insurance policy.
 
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your driver's
favour. We shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third party claim at best to avoid
further litigation, which would escalate to even more cost.
 
Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against your
policy.
 
As Insurers, they shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the
rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take
conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to
us within 7 days from the date of this letter. Your intent must be formally expressed to Allianz and
acknowledged by Allianz.
 
Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following
to chewht@lkkauto.com within 7 days from the date of this letter if not provided at our reporting centre. The
list below is not all inclusive and further document may be required:
 

Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any)
Driver’s driving license or foreign driving license (if any)
Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)
Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)
Copy of the letter of authorization to confirm that the driver is allowed to drive the vehicle.
Video footage of accident (if any)
Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)
If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to keep
us informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim.

 
To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third
Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without our prior
knowledge and consent. If you receive any correspondence or legal document such as a Writ of Summons in
connection with this accident, please forward it to us immediately. You may email it
to customerservice@allianz.com.sg or deliver it by hand to Allianz Customer Care Centre.

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:customerservice@allianz.com.sg
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This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by Allianz of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any
breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.
 
In the event of receiving and handling of any third-party injury claim(s), we shall keep you informed of the
final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s). 
 
If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact as at 6742 3197 or chewht@lkkauto.com.
 
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: -
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
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Claim Audit

 

  AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
04 Oct
2022
19:00

Clm Dtl Modified Insured Name: -> AXEL BADER. Insured ID: -> G3391069Q. Claimant's Name: -> CITYCAB P
TE LTD. Claimant's ID: -> 199502839G.

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

2
04 Oct
2022
19:00

Clm Veh Model
Changed (204577) HYUNDAI I40 1.7 D CRDI F/L ABS AIRBAG 4DR (A). [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

3
04 Oct
2022
19:00

Clm Created
Reg No: SHC7211B. Acct Date: 2022/09/29. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: Allianz Insurance Singap
ore Pte. Ltd. (HQ). TP Insurer: AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ). Workshop: ComfortDelGro Engine
ering Pte Ltd (Loyang)

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

4
04 Oct
2022
19:00

Adj Co Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

5
04 Oct
2022
19:00

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/10/13 [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

6
04 Oct
2022
19:00

Adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

7
04 Oct
2022
19:01

Adj Adjuster
Assigned [None] -> MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

8
06 Oct
2022
12:30

Clm Registration
Modified Pol No:->SP2001207703. [I] Faiz Rosli

9
06 Oct
2022
12:30

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/10/13. Mandate Remarks: Proceed with Direct Settlment. [I] Faiz Rosli

10
06 Oct
2022
12:30

Adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00:Proceed with Direct Settlment. [I] Faiz Rosli

11
06 Feb
2023
12:02

Adj Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:2410.18:Liability: 100%.BOLA 24. We seek your mandate at $2,410.18(ALL-IN). TP-
Mandate IA had been uploaded in Merimen.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

12
06 Feb
2023
13:52

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Cur Rpt:Final Rpt. Cur Due Date:2022/10/13. Mandate Remarks: Proceed with Offer [I] Faiz Rosli

13
06 Feb
2023
13:52

Adj Mandate Set Approved:2410.18:Proceed with Offer [I] Faiz Rosli

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go

ACTIVITY
No record

Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2851794 04 Oct 2022
19:00:49

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

SHC7211B AXEL BADER xx.xx

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=104447190&CFTOKEN=c6ec29f2599bd9be-40B79C02-F4E9-B52E-6D44F5E3FB747502&USID=3251&RID=8731594
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=104447190&CFTOKEN=c6ec29f2599bd9be-40B79C02-F4E9-B52E-6D44F5E3FB747502&USID=3251&RID=8731594
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=104447190&CFTOKEN=c6ec29f2599bd9be-40B79C02-F4E9-B52E-6D44F5E3FB747502&USID=3251&RID=8731594
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=104447190&CFTOKEN=c6ec29f2599bd9be-40B79C02-F4E9-B52E-6D44F5E3FB747502&USID=3251&RID=8731594&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D1144848%26extid%3D396893%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=104447190&CFTOKEN=c6ec29f2599bd9be-40B79C02-F4E9-B52E-6D44F5E3FB747502&USID=3251&RID=8731594
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