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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 15 March 2023 11:42 AM

To: alicechau@kanfs.net

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: SLG1485Z (OD) - Finalization & photo (1-20)

Dear Alice, 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of $12,327.25 with 5 days of repair, subject to their approval. 
 

Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: alicechau <alicechau@kanfs.net>  

Sent: Thursday, March 2, 2023 1:14 PM 

To: Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SLG1485Z (OD) - Finalization & photo (1-20) 

 

Hi, 

 

Please refer to the attached. 

 

Actually, it is all provided in previous emails. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

Regards, 

Alice 

Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop 

Tel:6747 9560 

Fax:6748 1006 

 

---------- Original Message ----------- 

From:Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com> 

To:"alicechau@kanfs.net" <alicechau@kanfs.net> 

Cc:"Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)" <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Sent:Wed, 1 Mar 2023 10:14:02 +0000 

Subject:SLG1485Z (OD) - Finalization & photo (1-20) 

 

> Hi Alice, 

> 

> Kindly provide supplier bill and before spray. 

> 

> Thanks. 

> Case Handler 

 

 

> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

 

> Phone: 6256-3561  fax: 6256-4315  Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

> 

>  

 

> From: alicechau <alicechau@kanfs.net> 

> Sent: Wednesday, March 1, 2023 6:09 PM 

> To: Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

> Subject: Re: SLG1485Z (OD) - Finalization & photo (1-20) 

>   

> Dear All, 

> 

> Please note that the repair is part by part basic. 

> 

> Thank you. 

> 

> Regards, 

> Alice 

> Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop 
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> Tel:6747 9560 

> Fax:6748 1006 

> 

> ---------- Original Message ----------- 

> From:Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com> 

> To:"Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)" <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

> Cc:alicechau <alicechau@kanfs.net> 

> Sent:Wed, 1 Mar 2023 09:53:50 +0000 

> Subject:SLG1485Z (OD) - Finalization & photo (1-20) 

> 

> > Hi Shiau Chan, 

> > 

> > Kindly seek mandate of the supplementary. And advise is repair lump-sum basis.  

> > 

> > Thanks. 

> > 

> >   

> > Best Regards, 

 

> > Case Handler 

 

> > LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

> >   Phone: 6256-3561 fax: 6256-4315  

> >   Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

> >  

 

> > From: alicechau <alicechau@kanfs.net> 

> > Sent: Wednesday, March 1, 2023 4:32 PM 

> > To: Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com> 

> > Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

> > Subject: Re: SLG1485Z (OD) - Finalization & photo (1-20) 

> >   

> > Dear Shiau Chan, 

> > 

> > Please refer to the below list-: 

> > 

> >    

• front brace panel - pic 3 

• front grille top beam - pic 24 

• front headlamp lh - pic 27 

• front bumper carrier rh - pic 20 

• front bumper foam - pic 30 

• air buffler top - pic 19 

• air con condenser & radiator - pic 12-17 

 

> >   

> > Thank you. 

> >   

> > Regards, 

> > Alice 

> > Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop 

> > Tel:6747 9560 

> > Fax:6748 1006 

> > 

> > ---------- Original Message ----------- 

> > From:Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com> 

> > To:alicechau <alicechau@kanfs.net> 

> > Cc:"Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)" <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

> > Sent:Mon, 27 Feb 2023 09:37:54 +0000 

> > Subject:SLG1485Z (OD) - Finalization & photo (1-20) 

> > 

> > > Hi Alice, 

> > > 

> > > Kindly assist marked at the estimate which items ? damaged, based on the photo.  

> > > 

> > > Thanks 

> > > 

> > >   

> > > 

> > > Best Regards, 

> > >  Case Handler 

> > > LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

> > > Phone: 6256-3561 fax: 6256-4315 

> > 

> > > Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

> > 

> > >   

> > > 

> > > From: alicechau <alicechau@kanfs.net> 
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> > > Sent: Friday, February 24, 2023 11:34 AM 

> > > To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

> > > Subject: Fw: SLG1485Z (OD) - Finalization & photo (1-20) 

> > >   

> > > Dear Sir, 

> > > 

> > > Please refer to the attached photos for your kind attention. 

> > > 

> > > Thank you. 

> > > 

> > > Regards, 

> > > Alice 

> > > Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop 

> > > Tel:6747 9560 

> > > Fax:6748 1006 

> > >  

 

> > > 

> > > ---------- Forwarded Message ----------- 

> > > From:"alicechau" <alicechau@kanfs.net> 

> > > To:"Survey (LKK AUTO)" <sur@lkkauto.com> 

> > > Sent:Fri, 24 Feb 2023 11:32:48 +0800 

> > > Subject:SLG1485Z (OD) - Finalization & photo (1-20) 

> > > 

> > > Dear Sir, 

> > > 

> > >   

> > > 

> > > With reference to the mentioned vehicle, please confirm and finalise. 

> > > 

> > >   

> > > 

> > > Thank you. 

> > > 

> > >  

> > > 

> > >   

> > > 

> > > Regards, 

> > > 

> > > Alice 

> > > 

> > > Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop 

> > > 

> > > Tel:6747 9560 

> > > 

> > > Fax:6748 1006 

> > > 

> > > ------- End of Forwarded Message ------- 

> > ------- End of Original Message ------- 

> ------- End of Original Message ------- 

------- End of Original Message ------- 


