Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Thursday, 6 October 2022 5:23 PM

Catherine Chong Kai Ling

Ramesh; Liew Si Ming; assignments; Admin A

RE: TP claim against AIG - Accident case between SMC3058U & SKT9605K (your
insured) on 23/09/2022 @ 17:15hrs Near 163 Bedok South Avenue 3 *** LKK REF:
CC6/AIG22009614/pa3

Please be informed that our insured is denying liability as she was driving along main driveway while your client was
coming out from parking lot. Your client should exercise caution while coming out from parking lot.

In view of this, we regret to inform you that we are unable to look into your client’s claim.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 3 October 2022 11:56 AM

To: Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Liew Si Ming <LiewSiMing@goldbell.com.sg>; assignments
<assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP claim against AIG - Accident case between SMC3058U & SKT9605K (your insured) on 23/09/2022 @
17:15hrs Near 163 Bedok South Avenue 3 *** LKK REF: CC6/A1G22009614/pa3

Dear Sir / Madam,



We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI's sketch plan and statement.

Open Car Park Blk 155172
fedok South Road/Avenue 3 -
B&S

Junction at comer of block 163
where accident occurred.

On 23 Sep 2022 ot about 17080
| 'was diveing my cor SKTH05K out of the car park of my residence at Blk 171 Bedok South Road

S4B01 T, | woas driving along the car park read between block 162 and 183 and intending S0 turn lefl ot the end of the road to ext the
cal park. There were 2 cars in front af my car whech turmed lefl. Thas urning = a 90 degrees wan. Just as | was navgabing my kel ium

i falt @ slight bumg. | note from my rear meros that a black car SMCMSEU was juttng out of the parking lot. | stopped my car bo check. |
ot the lower ke hand mmqummmimwmmmmm.Tha»mumﬂdbemmm
easily. There were no other damages to my car SKTO805K. From nvy dash cam video

il can be chearly deen Bhal the ack eai SMCINSEL had moved forward out of its car paik kot st 83 My cof was Fervigabing the lefl turn
i e cormer

causang the left sade of my cor 1o brush agamst s fronl nghl sade bumper. The car SMCISEL had #s front bumger Shobily dslodged
and e were some scraich marka on A8 bumpar Apart from thst thers wene na vidibls demage s o the car SMCI0S8U. The dives of
SMCI05EU closmed he was pariong hes car. | fownd that guste difcult to understand since 2 cars had just turned kel & few seconds
bafore me. The dives of SMCI0SEL identified himsed as Mr Tan Chuan Jin HEIEEK | told him | would make a report 1o the
IMESUNSNCE Compan Yy

Please provide us the following and arrange for survey.
e evidencei.e. video and scene photo

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 29 September 2022 4:23 PM




To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Liew Si Ming <LiewSiMing@goldbell.com.sg>

Subject: RE: TP claim against AIG - Accident case between SMC3058U & SKT9605K (your insured) on 23/09/2022 @
17:15hrs Near 163 Bedok South Avenue 3

Dear Mei Kwan,

As spoken, kindly assist for this TP claim.
Please advise liability for this claim.
Thank you.

NOTICE:
Due to the current COVID-19 situation, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delays are to be expected.
All correspondence should be done via email instead. Thank you for staying safe with us!
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