Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 1 November 2022 1:50 PM
To: claim@abengineering.sg

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: [E18: SMZ9699) Supplier Bill

Hi Janelle,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair $10574.31 before GST/- with 4 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Regards,
Guo Qiang

RN claim@abengineering.sg <claim@abengineering.sg>

RIEmE]: 2022 % 11 A 1 H 13:23
ek A : Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ikkauto.com>
F: RE: SMZ9699) Supplier Bill

Dear Guo Qiang,

Refer to earlier on tele-conversation, as per mentioned by you that vehicle SMZ9699J finalised amount will be ready
today.

Kindly send us once ready.
Thanks & Best Regards,
Janelle.

Tel : 8858 6282

AB Engineering Pte Ltd

From: claim@abengineering.sg <claim@abengineering.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 4 October 2022 12:22 pm

To: 'GuoQiang@lkkauto.com' <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SMZ9699)J Supplier Bill

Dear Mr Guo Qiang,

Please refer to the attached file for your perusal.

Thanks & Best Regards,
San Mya Aye
Tel : 8858 6282



AB Engineering Pte Ltd



