Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Revo Performance <revoperformance@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 7 February 2023 2:47 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: Re: MT00015358 is Approved

Dear Huey Yon,

We accept the L/S $4,200 (before GST) with 4 days of repair.

Thanks & Regards

Joey Chong

Revo Performance Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #02-51 & 53 Singapore 417883 (Autobay@KakiBukit)
Tel: (65) 6745 6706

Fax: (65) 6484 3653

www.revoperformance.com.sg

Think Green - Please consider your environmental responsibility before printing this email.

NOTE: This message is from Revo Performance Pte Ltd and may contain confidential business information. It is intended solely for the use of the individual to whom it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient (or responsible for delivery of the
message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. Kindly notify the sender and please delete this message and any attachment from your system. All opinions, conclusions and other information expressed in this message not
of an official nature shall not be deemed as given or endorsed by Revo Performance Pte Ltd or any of its subsidiaries unless otherwise indicated by an authorised representative independent of this message.

Revo Performance Pte Ltd

Reg No. 201200256H

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 7, 2023 5:48 AM

To: Revo Performance <revoperformance@hotmail.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: MT00015358 is Approved

Dear Joey,
Without prejudice

As spoken with you, We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of LS $4,200 with 4 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | case handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315 email: hueyyon@Ilkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933

From: Revo Performance <revoperformance@hotmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 3 November 2022 2:55 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Fw: MT00015358 is Approved



Dear Huey Yon,
Kindly refer attached as your reference.

Please send me the finalize of vehicle SLZ8811U so that we can submit the LOD.

Thanks & Regards
Joey Chong

Revo Performance Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #02-51 & 53 Singapore 417883 (Autobay@KakiBukit)
Tel: (65) 6745 6706

Fax: (65) 6484 3653

www.revoperformance.com.sg

Think Green - Please consider your environmental responsibility before printing this email.

NOTE: This message is from Revo Performance Pte Ltd and may contain confidential business information. It is intended solely for the use of the individual to whom it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient (or responsible for delivery of the
message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. Kindly notify the sender and please delete this message and any attachment from your system. All opinions, conclusions and other information expressed in this message not
of an official nature shall not be deemed as given or endorsed by Revo Performance Pte Ltd or any of its subsidiaries unless otherwise indicated by an authorised representative independent of this message.

Revo Performance Pte Ltd

Reg No. 201200256H

From: Caroline Cabrera <Caroline@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, September 23, 2022 7:32 AM

To: assignments@Ilkkauto.com <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; revoperformance@hotmail.com <revoperformance@hotmail.com>
Subject: FW: MT00015358 is Approved

Dear Sir,

Attached documents for survey assignment.

Thank you & Regards,
Caroline Cabrera
Motor Claims

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd
36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House| Singapore 068877 | D: 6507 3848 | F: 6507 3849 | Reg. No. 195000106C

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www.first-insurance.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.
If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.
If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system



and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.

From: support@msfirstcapital.com.sg <support@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, September 23, 2022 3:26 PM

To: Caroline Cabrera <Caroline@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: MT00015358 is Approved

Insured Vehicle No : SBS6535K

TP Vehicle No  :SLZ8811U

Claim No : D22002920MFBP

Workshop Name  : REVO PERFORMANCE PTE LTD
Our Surveyor : LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Instructions  : Without Prejudice

Created By : CAROLINE

Verified By : RACHELWU
Approved By : RACHELWU

This is a computer generated mail. Do not reply to this mail.



