Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 23 September 2022 8:34 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR; assignments

Cc: Teo Jie Yang; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10017649/JY || OI-SJU267T (White) TP-GW5563E || Est: $0.00 ||
Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Attachments: C10017649.zip

Hi Team

We wish to appoint LKK to conduct survey for the TP vehicle number: GW5563E

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd
Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195

Contact: Jouis Seow - 62898126

Please find attached GIA reports for your reference.

Best regards,

Salizawati Haizar
Admin Executive, Claims

F +65 6725 0853
E salizawati.h@budgetdirect.com.sg

It pays to choose | Platinum
Trusted
Service

Budget
Direct
msurance 2022 _ jgefo’f

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 22 September 2022 4:54 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Teo Jie Yang <jieyang.teo@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: jin@jinauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: PRI Request on 22.09.2022 || Our ref: C10017649/JY | | ACCIDENT INVOLVING GW5563E & SJU267T DATED
22/9/2022

Dear Salizawati,

Pease assign LKK

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow
Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd



Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg

From: Claims [mailto:claims@budgetdirect.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 22 September 2022 4:45 PM

To: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>; Teo Jie Yang <jieyang.teo@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: jin@jinauto.com.sg

Subject: PRI Request on 22.09.2022 || Our ref: C10017649/JY || ACCIDENT INVOLVING GW5563E & SJU267T DATED
22/9/2022

Dear Jouis,

Kindly furnish us the full GIA report for GW5563E.
Dear @Teo Jie Yang,

Kindly assist to advise on the liability.

Best regards,

Salizawati Haizar
Admin Executive, Claims

F +65 6725 0853
E salizawati.h@budgetdirect.com.sg

It pays to choose | Platinum
i Trusted

Budget | Avard
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Direct | ausan

INsSurarice | oz fesio™

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 22 September 2022 3:57 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: jin@jinauto.com.sg

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GW5563E & SJU267T DATED 22/9/2022 | | Budget Direct

Without Prejudice

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam,



ACCIDENT INVOLVING GW5563E & SJU267T DATED 22/9/2022

We are assisting owner of GW5563E handling their third party claim recovery against SJU267T
Please arrange third party survey at our workshop.

Kindly establish liability for this case.

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg




