Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 31 January 2023 11:26 AM
To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fw: SLQ8082D - Finalize

CASE FINALISED

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

=] Save the ELarth- FPrint only when necessary-

From: daud mohamad <mddaudn731@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 27 January 2023 11:59 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SLQ8082D - Finalize

Hi Rasul,
please proceed to close. thank you.

regards
daud

On Thu, Jan 26, 2023 at 12:23 PM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Daud,

refer to attachment
We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $4,300.00./- with 06 days of repair, subject to their approval.
Kindly forward again the resurvey after repair photos.

Kindly acknowledge

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth- Print only when necessary-



From: MY CAR CONSULTANT <admin@mycar.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 19 January 2023 9:31 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: SLQ8082D - Finalize

Hi Rasul,

Kindly finalize the above vehicle.

Thanks.

Best Regards,
Jackson

+65 8344 7681

My Car Consultant Pte Ltd
W: Mycar.sg | E: Admin@mycar.sg
60 Jalan Lam Huat, Carros Centre #05-21 S(737869)
UEN No.: 2016058787
GST Registration No.: 2016058787



