Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 22 September 2022 5:00 PM

To: ‘Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore)’; Admin A

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: TP DS claim [EXT] Re: FW: Arrangement for Pre-Repair Survey - Peg Ref :

VSR22-20396 ; ALLIANZ Ref: TBA ; Accident Involving SLK4212D (GRAB) &XD6242Z
(ALLIANZ) on 13/09/2022 2305HRS

Categories: HMK

Dear Shanti,
Thank you for the assignment.

Repairer arrange on 23.9.22.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 22 September 2022 3:42 PM

To: Yan (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>; admin-a@lkkauto.com

Cc: Eric Hii <eric.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>

Subject: TP DS claim [EXT] Re: FW: Arrangement for Pre-Repair Survey - Peg Ref : VSR22-20396 ; ALLIANZ Ref: TBA ;
Accident Involving SLK4212D (GRAB) &XD6242Z (ALLIANZ) on 13/09/2022 2305HRS

Internal

Your ref: SLK4212D
Our ref: 2022 22006749FR-XD62427

Dear Sirs,
We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (Mr Steve) to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Please download the documents from this link below (For Survey)

File: XD6242Z Ol.pdf, SLK4212D TP GIA.pdf



Link: https://ffilexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=30f4a89b-b645-453f-b855-4e33d3fd53ff-
8243c1c55de04c3f
Size: ~ 2 MByte, Download available until: 9/27/2022

Passwords will be sent in a separate email.

Thank you.

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

QQL | Altianz @ | (.

Warldwide Olymplt gnd Parolympdc Portnar

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.

&2 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Eric Hii <eric.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, September 22, 2022 2:49 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] Re: FW: Arrangement for Pre-Repair Survey - Peg Ref : VSR22-20396 ; ALLIANZ Ref: TBA ; Accident
Involving SLK4212D (GRAB) &XD62427 (ALLIANZ) on 13/09/2022 2305HRS

Without Prejudice
Dear Shanti,
We would like to appoint Mr Steve from LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct the survey.

Thanks & Best Regards,
Eric
Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

Tel : 6513 7748 | Fax : 6251 3161
Add : 74 Kian Teck Road Singapore 628800

Make Life a Beautiful Ride

On Thu, Sep 22, 2022 at 2:41 PM Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> wrote:
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Internal

Your ref: SLK4212D
Our ref: 2022 22006749FR-XD6242Z7

Dear Sirs
Enclosed is the list of surveyors for your consideration for Single Joint Expert (SJE):-

AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd
A-PAC Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd
Form Team Consultancy Pte Ltd
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Please let us know who you are agreeable to appoint from the list.

Best regards,

Shanti.R
Claims Service
Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte.Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 Singapore 068897
Phone: +65 63958973 | www.allianz.sg

OQP | Allianz @) | (.

Warldwide Oymplc ond Porolymplc Porbnaer

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain
confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or
disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-
mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Eric Hii <eric.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, September 22, 2022 10:28 AM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: Vivian Tan <vivian.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>; Hua Teng <tenghua.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>;
sharon.pegasusengrg@gmail.com

Subject: [EXT] Arrangement for Pre-Repair Survey - Peg Ref : VSR22-20396 ; ALLIANZ Ref: TBA ; Accident Involving
SLK4212D (GRAB) &XD62427 (ALLIANZ) on 13/09/2022 2305HRS




Without Prejudice

Dear Motor Claim Department,

We refer to the above matter.

Pursuant to paragraph 2.3 of Pre-Action Protocol for NIMA Cases, please let us have a list of

10 motor surveyors for our selection and please let us know within 2 working days whether you would like
to conduct a pre-repair survey of our client’s vehicle. If we do not hear from you within the stipulated timeline,
our client shall proceed to repair the vehicle without further reference to you.

In the event that you request for post-repair inspection pursuant to paragraphs 4.1 and 7.4 under the NIMA
Protocol, you must compensate our client for the loss of use of his/her vehicle for the day that the inspection
is conducted.

Our client's vehicle will be grounded at our workshop at 74 Kian Teck Road Singapore
628800 on 23.09.2022. As such, please do the needful.

We will forward our client's GIA report as well as our estimated cost of repair to you in due course.

We await your urgent response in this matter.

Thanks & Best Regards,
Eric

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

Tel : 6513 7748 | Fax : 6251 3161
Add : 74 Kian Teck Road Singapore 628800

Make Life a Beautiful Ride



