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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 15 February 2023 2:16 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: Re: SLM6373Z CLAIMING AGAINST SJZ9695E DOA:19.09.2022 *** LKK REF: 

CC4/AIS22009306/Aea3 

Without Prejudice 
 
Hi Tong Tong 
 
Fyi. In 2022 Allianz started the Giro system and they have our company bank account details. 
 
Company Name SM Automotive 
Contact Number 6747 9241 

Contact Email (for payment advice to be sent to) sm_automotive@hotmail.com 
  
Beneficiary's Bank's Details 
Bank Name UOB 
Bank Branch Hougang Central 
Bank Address 80 Hougang Central #01-01 Hougang MRT Station (S) 538758 
Bank Code 7375 
Branch Code 448 
SWIFT Code UOVBSGSG 
  
Beneficiary's Details 
Beneficiary's Name SM Automotive 
Beneficiary's Account No. 3963065270 
Beneficiary's Registered Address 756 Jurong West St 74 #12-60 (S) 640756 
Beneficiary's Mailing Address 756 Jurong West St 74 #12-60 (S) 640756 
 
 

Regards, 

Sukyi Chong  
SM AUTOMOTIVE 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
Blk C #01-43 
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6747 9241  Fax: 6741 7276  

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, February 15, 2023 2:09 PM 
To: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SLM6373Z CLAIMING AGAINST SJZ9695E DOA:19.09.2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22009306/Aea3  
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WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Sirs, 
  
Please provide bank details. 
  
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, February 15, 2023 11:44 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SLM6373Z CLAIMING AGAINST SJZ9695E DOA:19.09.2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22009306/Aea3  
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Hi Tong Tong 
  
Thanks for the email. 
  
Kindly expedite the necessary submission to Allianz for them to process the payment, thanks. 
  
  
*** Kindly note that this settlement is purely for Property Damage Claim only without 
prejudice to any injury claims *** 
  
*** Kindly note that this settlement is purely for Property Damage Claim without admission 
of liability *** 
  
  
  
  
Regards, 

Sukyi Chong  
SM AUTOMOTIVE 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
Blk C #01-43 
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6747 9241  Fax: 6741 7276  
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, February 15, 2023 11:35 AM 
To: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SLM6373Z CLAIMING AGAINST SJZ9695E DOA:19.09.2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22009306/Aea3  
  
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
  
Dear Sirs 
  
Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at S$14,000.00(all in) in full and 
final settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their insured 
arising out of this incident.  
  
If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of the Letter of Authorization / 
Warrant to Act  and your Bank details for us to process payment.   
  
Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of 
liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore 
and/or our insured as a result of the accident on 19 SEPT 2022.  
  
Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or 
payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability. 
  
Thank you.  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, February 9, 2023 5:08 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SLM6373Z CLAIMING AGAINST SJZ9695E DOA:19.09.2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22009306/Aea3  
  
Without Prejudice  
  
Hi Tong Tong 
  
We accepted your offer at a global sum of $14,000 
  
Kindly expedite the necessary submission to Allianz for them to process the payment, thanks.  
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*** Kindly note that this settlement is purely for Property Damage Claim only without 
prejudice to any injury claims ***  
  
*** Kindly note that this settlement is purely for Property Damage Claim without admission 
of liability *** 
  
  
Regards, 

Sukyi Chong  
SM AUTOMOTIVE 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
Blk C #01-43 
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6747 9241  Fax: 6741 7276  

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Thursday, February 9, 2023 2:52 PM 
To: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SLM6373Z CLAIMING AGAINST SJZ9695E DOA:19.09.2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22009306/Aea3  
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs, 
  
We refer to your below email. 
We propose settlement at a global sum of $14,000.00(all-in). 
Please confirm acceptance. 
  
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 9 February 2023 11:56 AM 
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To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SLM6373Z CLAIMING AGAINST SJZ9695E DOA:19.09.2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22009306/Aea3  
  
Without Prejudice - gentle reminder   
  
Hi Tong Tong 
  
We found out there was an error of the cost of repair as your good surveyor Adrian finalized with us the 
cost of repair is $13,500 before gst. 
  
Moreover, we are using an Allianz appointed surveyor panel. 
  
Lor + LTA search ok. 
  
Our counter proposal as following:- 
  
Cost of Repair     : $ 14,445.00 ($13,500 + gst) 
  
Loss of Rental     : $    1,000.00 ($100 x 10 days) 
  
LTA Search          : $            2.00 
  
Total                    :  $ 15,447.00 
  
Kindly consider our counter proposal and revert for a close case. 
  
We look forward to hearing from you soon of the revised offer, thanks. 

  
Regards, 

Sukyi Chong  
SM AUTOMOTIVE 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
Blk C #01-43 
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6747 9241  Fax: 6741 7276  

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, January 12, 2023 11:23 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SLM6373Z CLAIMING AGAINST SJZ9695E DOA:19.09.2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22009306/Aea3  
  
Without Prejudice - gentle reminder   
  
Hi Tong Tong 
  
We found out there was an error of the cost of repair as your good surveyor Adrian finalized with us the 
cost of repair is $13,500 before gst. 
  
Moreover, we are using an Allianz appointed surveyor panel. 
  
Lor + LTA search ok. 
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Our counter proposal as following:- 
  
Cost of Repair     : $ 14,445.00 ($13,500 + gst) 
  
Loss of Rental     : $    1,000.00 ($100 x 10 days) 
  
LTA Search          : $            2.00 
  
Total                    :  $ 15,447.00 
  
Kindly consider our counter proposal and revert for a close case. 
  
We look forward to hearing from you soon of the revised offer, thanks. 

  
Regards, 

Sukyi Chong  
SM AUTOMOTIVE 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
Blk C #01-43 
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6747 9241  Fax: 6741 7276  

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, December 30, 2022 4:22 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SLM6373Z CLAIMING AGAINST SJZ9695E DOA:19.09.2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22009306/Aea3  
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Hi Tong Tong 
  
We found out there was an error of the cost of repair as your good surveyor Adrian finalized with us the 
cost of repair is $13,500 before gst. 
  
Moreover, we are using an Allianz appointed surveyor panel. 
  
Lor + LTA search ok. 
  
Our counter proposal as following:- 
  
Cost of Repair     : $ 14,445.00 ($13,500 + gst) 
  
Loss of Rental     : $    1,000.00 ($100 x 10 days) 
  
LTA Search          : $            2.00 
  
Total                    :  $ 15,447.00 
  
Kindly consider our counter proposal and revert for a close case. 
  
We look forward to hearing from you soon of the revised offer, thanks. 
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Regards, 
  
Sukyi Chong  
SM AUTOMOTIVE 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
Blk C #01-43 
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6747 9241  Fax: 6741 7276  

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, December 28, 2022 9:29 AM 
To: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SLM6373Z CLAIMING AGAINST SJZ9695E DOA:19.09.2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22009306/Aea3  
  
Without prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs, 
  
We propose settlement as follows: - 
  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 12,150.00 
2. Loss of Rental (10days x $100.00) $   1,000.00 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $          2.00 

Total $ 13,152.00 
  
Please confirm acceptance. 
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 22 December 2022 5:24 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SLM6373Z CLAIMING AGAINST SJZ9695E DOA:19.09.2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22009306/Aea3  
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Without Prejudice 
  
Hi Tong Tong 
  
Enclosed after repair photos for your reference. 
  
We look forward to hearing from you soon of the offer for a close case, thanks. 
  
  
Regards, 

Sukyi Chong  
SM AUTOMOTIVE 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
Blk C #01-43 
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6747 9241  Fax: 6741 7276  

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Thursday, December 22, 2022 5:14 PM 
To: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SLM6373Z CLAIMING AGAINST SJZ9695E DOA:19.09.2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22009306/Aea3  
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs, 
  
Please provide after repair photos for SLM6373Z. 
  
Thanks. 
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 22 December 2022 10:49 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SLM6373Z CLAIMING AGAINST SJZ9695E DOA:19.09.2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22009306/Aea3  
  
Without Prejudice  
  
Hi Tong Tong 
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Kindly update us on the status and revert as I need to prepare the year-end report to my boss.  
  
We look forward to hearing from you soon as I start on leave on 24.12.2022 - 28.12.2022, thanks. 
  
  
Regards, 
  
Sukyi Chong  
SM AUTOMOTIVE 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
Blk C #01-43 
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6747 9241  Fax: 6741 7276  

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, December 1, 2022 10:50 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SLM6373Z CLAIMING AGAINST SJZ9695E DOA:19.09.2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22009306/Aea3  
  
Without Prejudice  
  
Hi Tong Tong 
  
Kindly advise your offer and revert for a close case. 
  
We look forward to hearing from you soon, thanks. 

  
Regards, 

Sukyi Chong  
SM AUTOMOTIVE 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
Blk C #01-43 
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6747 9241  Fax: 6741 7276  

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, November 17, 2022 10:47 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SLM6373Z CLAIMING AGAINST SJZ9695E DOA:19.09.2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22009306/Aea3  
  
Without Prejudice - gentle reminder  
  
Hi Tong Tong 
  
Kindly advise if your Surveyor Adrian already passes his marked estimate to you? 
  
We look forward to hearing from you soon, thanks. 
  
  
  
Regards, 
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Sukyi Chong  
SM AUTOMOTIVE 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
Blk C #01-43 
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6747 9241  Fax: 6741 7276  

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, November 8, 2022 4:48 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SLM6373Z CLAIMING AGAINST SJZ9695E DOA:19.09.2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22009306/Aea3  
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Hi Tong Tong 
  
Kindly advise if your Surveyor Adrian already passes his marked estimate to you? 
  
We look forward to hearing from you soon, thanks. 
  
  
  
Regards, 

Sukyi Chong  
SM AUTOMOTIVE 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
Blk C #01-43 
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6747 9241  Fax: 6741 7276  

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, November 8, 2022 2:33 PM 
To: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SLM6373Z CLAIMING AGAINST SJZ9695E DOA:19.09.2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22009306/Aea3  
  
Dear Sir / Madam, 
  
Thank you for your email. 
  
Our respective team will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 
  
Hi CS team, 
  
Kindly assist. 
  
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
  

Thank you. 
Best Regards, 
Mei Kwan | Admin 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com 
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, 8 November 2022 1:46 pm 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: SLM6373Z CLAIMING AGAINST SJZ9695E DOA:19.09.2022  
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Hi all 
  
Enclosed LOD and supporting documents for your reference. 
  
We look forward to hearing from you soon of the offer to close the case, thanks. 
  
  
Regards, 

Sukyi Chong  
SM AUTOMOTIVE 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
Blk C #01-43 
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6747 9241  Fax: 6741 7276  
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 23 September 2022 11:49
To: liujiangzzz@gmail.com
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJZ 9695E & SLM 6373Z ALONG SERANGOON NORTH ROAD 

ON 19/09/2022

23 September 2022 
 
SAID JALAL BIN SAID MAHAMED 
 
Dear Sir, 
 
OUR REF              : CC4/AIS22009306/ea3 
YOUR REF            : SJZ 9695E 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJZ 9695E & SLM 6373Z ALONG SERANGOON NORTH ROAD ON 19/09/2022 
 
We refer to the above subject matter.  We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.  
 
We have received a third party claim(s) from CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD acting on behalf of the owner of SLM 6373Z 
against your motor insurance policy. 
 
Basing on the circumstances of the accident reported by both parties, where your vehicle was involved in a three (3) 
vehicle chain collision and was the 3rd vehicle and rear-ended the Third Party Vehicle SLM 6373Z which in turn had rear-
ended the first vehicle which is a motorcycle and we are of the opinion that we cannot be absolved from liability.  
 
As Insurers, they shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights 
afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third 
party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the date of 
this letter. Your intent must be formally expressed to Allianz and acknowledged by Allianz.  
 
Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to ashersng@lkkauto.com 
within 7 days from the date of this letter if not provided at our reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive and 
further document may be required: 
 

 Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any) 
 Driver’s driving license or foreign driving license (if any) 
 Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any) 
 Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any) 
 Copy of the letter of authorization  
 Video footage of accident (if any) 
 Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any) 
 If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to keep us 

informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim. 
 
To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s) 
and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without our prior knowledge and consent. If 
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you receive any correspondence or legal document such as a Writ of Summons in connection with this accident, please 
forward it to us immediately. You may email it to Allianz or deliver it by hand to Allianz Customer Care Centre.  
 
This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by Allianz of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach of 
policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.  
 
In the event of receiving and handling of any third-party injury claim(s), we shall keep you informed of the final 
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).   
 
If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact as at 6841 6051 or ashersng@lkkauto.com. Please quote 
our claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively. 
 
 
Yours sincerely, 
 
Asher Sng 
Case Handler 
DID: 6841 6051 
Email: ashersng@lkkauto.com 
 
 
cc  Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd 
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Claim Audit

 

  AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
21 Sep
2022
16:32

Clm Dtl Modified Claimant's Name: -> MUHAMAD SALIHIN BIN MOHAMED ALI. Claimant's ID: -> S7600940F. [A] HOW
MEI KWAN

2
21 Sep
2022
16:32

Clm Veh Model
Changed (204482) TOYOTA SIENTA 1.5 G CVT (A). [A] HOW

MEI KWAN

3
21 Sep
2022
16:32

Clm Created
Reg No: SLM6373Z. Acct Date: 2022/09/19. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: Allianz Insurance Singapo
re Pte. Ltd. (HQ). TP Insurer: Income Insurance Limited (HQ). Workshop: Cheng Hoe Motor Pte
Ltd (Yishun)

[A] HOW
MEI KWAN

4
21 Sep
2022
16:32

Adj Co Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW
MEI KWAN

5
21 Sep
2022
16:32

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/09/30 [A] HOW

MEI KWAN

6
21 Sep
2022
16:32

Adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW
MEI KWAN

7
21 Sep
2022
16:33

Adj Adjuster
Assigned [None] -> Asher Sng Rong Yi [A] HOW

MEI KWAN

8
05 Oct
2022
13:54

Clm Registration
Modified Rep:200126->202715. [A] HOW

MEI KWAN

9
22 Dec
2022
17:33

Adj Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:15447.00:Liability: 100%. BOLA 28. 3 vehicles chain collision whereby OI was the last
car. We have uploaded OI LOA in Merimen. We seek your mandate at $15,447.00(all-in). TP-Ma
ndate IA had been uploaded in Merimen.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

10
23 Dec
2022
13:04

Adj Next Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/09/30. Mandate Remarks: cor 12150 lor 1000 lta 2 total 13,
152

[I] Chan
Kian Chuan

11
23 Dec
2022
13:04

Adj Mandate Set Approved:13152.00:cor 12150 lor 1000 lta 2 total 13,152 [I] Chan
Kian Chuan

12
05 Jan
2023
11:40

Adj Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:15447.00:Please be informed that 3rd party rejected our offer at $13,152.00(all-in) an
d proposed $15,447.00(all-in). Please review and advise further mandate. Thanks.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

13
08 Feb
2023
17:29

Adj Next Rpt
Changed

Cur Rpt:Final Rpt. Cur Due Date:2022/09/30. Mandate Remarks: Counter at $14,002.50(less 1
0% of L/S), else approved to resolve at $15,447.00 [I] Faiz Rosli

14
08 Feb
2023
17:29

Adj Mandate Set Approved:15447.00:Counter at $14,002.50(less 10% of L/S), else approved to resolve at $15,4
47.00 [I] Faiz Rosli

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go

ACTIVITY
[05/10/2022 13:55] HOW MEI KWAN:
TP CLAIMANT CHANGED WKSP FROM : CHENG HOE MOTOR PL --- >>> SM AUTOMOTIVE

Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2846056 21 Sep 2022
16:32:49

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

SLM6373Z xx.xx

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=104016494&CFTOKEN=4388bda27de1cea1-A02F698A-F74D-9A90-409EBA130D876B25&USID=3251&RID=7728955
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=104016494&CFTOKEN=4388bda27de1cea1-A02F698A-F74D-9A90-409EBA130D876B25&USID=3251&RID=7728955
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