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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 1 December 2022 7:46 AM
To: 'Khim Goh'
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 16/09/22 INVOLVED SBP20J AND SGU3668K *** LKK REF: 

CC4/AIS22009264/Uea3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
Dear Sirs 
 
Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at S$2,547.45 (all in) in full and 
final settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their insured 
arising out of this incident.  
 
If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of the Letter of Authorization / 
Warrant to Act  and your Bank details for us to process payment.   
 
Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of 
liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore 
and/or our insured as a result of the accident on 16 Sept 2022.  
 
Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or 
payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability. 
 
Thank you.  
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 

From: Khim Goh <sinhweemotor@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, 21 November 2022 10:45 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT ON 16/09/22 INVOLVED SBP20J AND SGU3668K *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22009264/Uea3 
 
Ok, 
 
Please kindly forward us the DV. 
 
Thanks 
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On Sun, Nov 20, 2022 at 6:27 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sirs, 

 

We propose settlement as follows: -  

   

1. Cost of Repair  $  2,300.00 
2. Loss of Use (4days x $60.00)  $     240.00 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee  $         7.45 

Total  $ 2,547.45 

   

Please confirm acceptance.  
 
Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: - 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Monday, 10 October 2022 11:15 am 
To: Khim Goh <sinhweemotor@gmail.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 16/09/22 INVOLVED SBP20J AND SGU3668K *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22009264/Uea3  
  

Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

Thank you for your email. 

  

Our respective team will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 

  

Hi CS team, 

  

Kindly assist. 
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To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Khim Goh <sinhweemotor@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, 10 October 2022 10:57 AM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: ACCIDENT ON 16/09/22 INVOLVED SBP20J AND SGU3668K 

  

Dear Officer In Charge, 

Our client requested to claim the following :- 

  

1) Cost Of Repair - $ 2340.00 

2) LTA Fee - $ 7.45 

3) LOU - $ 400.00 (4 days) 

  

Total amount: $ 2747.45 

  

Please kindly get back to us soon. 

Thank you 

  

--  

Warmest Regards 

 
Sin Hwee Motor Pte Ltd 
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Khim Hp : 9766 6672 

Tel: 6745 5783   Fax : 6744 9582 

E-mail: sinhweemotor@gmail.com 

 
 
 
--  
Warmest Regards 
 
Sin Hwee Motor Pte Ltd 
Khim Hp : 9766 6672 
Tel: 6745 5783   Fax : 6744 9582 
E-mail: sinhweemotor@gmail.com 


