MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
BLK 3023A UBI ROAD 1 # 01 - 61

SINGAPORE 408717

GST REG. NO : 200501102H

TEL: 6748 4422 | 6745 4422 FAX : 6747 6720
Email: chin@modernautomotive.com.sg

YOUR REF : SKV5351H
OUR REF :SJX2888Y

Date : 25.10.20222

ALLIANZ INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD
79 Robinson Road #09-01

Singapore 068897

Attn: Hsiao Tong

RE : ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJX2888Y & SKV5351H ON 13.09.2022
TRAFFIC LIGHT ALONG GEYLANG RD BEFORE TANJONG KATONG RD JUNCTION

We refer to the above matter.

We have been authorized by our client Mr Lin Feng to make claim against your
insured vehicle No.SKV5351H in respect of the above accident for the following:

Repair Cost $ 2,911.74 (Incl GST)
Loss of use ($80 x 3 days) $ 240.00
Search fee $ 2.00

Total: $ 3,153.74

Enclosed herewith a copy each of the supporting documents for your perusal.
Kindly process the above and remit the payment to us asap.

oY,

MoS&n Altomotive Pte Ltd




LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION

Date: ’3l£ljl7,

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN
Dear Sir,

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE

ON ’gm’m/ALONGT‘”‘“C(:‘CL‘Y‘MMM(‘S@"jH‘ﬁ
o Rd Bedoe Taujong ety Pod TuadOWN

This letter is to authorize MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD (UEN 200501102H) to act on
my/our behalf with respect to the third-party claim.

In respect of this authorization, MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD is authorized to accept any
offer of settlement from the third-party insurer. I/We also agree that all payments include

compensation for Loss of Use shall be made in favor of MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD.

MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD is authorized to sign all the required documents include
Discharge Voucher from the third-party insurer.

Yours Faithfully

Signature of Owner

U U F< uj

Name/NRIC % 7’063 wle



MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

BLK 3023A UBI ROAD 1 #01-58 / 61 SINGAPORE 408717
TEL : 6747 4422, 6745 4422 FAX : 6747 6720

GST REG. NO : 200501102H

ALLIANZ INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD
79 Robinson Road #09-01
068897

Attention : Motor Claim Department

Tax Invoice : TP001798

Date : 19/10/2022
Vehicle Num. : SJX 2888Y
Make/Model : BMW 118i-2019

Chassis/Eng#

Accident Date : 13/09/2022
Claim No. :
Reference :

Policy No. : 5124037560

S/N  Quantity Particular Unit Price Amount S$
LABOUR :

ACCIDENT REPAIR (PART BY PART) 2,721.25

Labour Total S$ : 2,721.25

Total S$ : 2,721.25

GST@ 7% S$ : 190.49

Amount Due S$ : 2,911.74

MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD



> Back to OneMotoring

Land Transport Authority

Land Transport Authority

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time :
Receipt Date/Time :

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-220915-003222
Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/
Business Transaction Reference
No.

Result of Insurance Enquiry - SKV5351H
As at 13 Sep 2022/11:30:00
Insurance Co: ALLIANZ INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE. LTD.
1 Insurance Enquiry - SKV5351H
Enquiry Fee
20220915173210167528

Sub-Total
Total Before Rounding
Rounding Difference

Total Amount Payable

Paid By
452419XXXXXX8646
Total

Cash Change
Tendered Amount

Excess Refundable Amount

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

15 Sep 2022/ 17:33:33
15 Sep 2022/ 17:33:33

Amount GST
Before Amount
GST (S$) (S$)
7.00 0.49

7.00 0.49

7.00 0.49
eNETS Credit Card

Amount
After GST
(S9$)

7.49

7.49
7.49
0.04
7.45

7.45
7.45
0.00
7.45
0.00

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.



Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: chin <chin@modernautomotive.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 28 February 2023 5:52 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Re: TP Settlement SJX2888Y (Allianz)
Attachments: SCAN_20230228_175130355.pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong
We refer to your email.

We attached herewith our client LOA attention and below is our Company bank details.

Payee : Modern Automotive Pte Ltd
Bank : OCBC
Account 1686394255001

Bank branch :686
Bank Code :7339

Please let us have your payment asap.

Thank you

Regards,

Grace Chin

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd
Blk 3023-A, Ubi Road 1 #01-61
Singapore 408717

Tel: 6748 4422
Fax: 6747 6720

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Sunday, 26 February 2023 2:00 pm

To: chin <chin@modernautomotive.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Re: TP Settlement SJX2888Y (Allianz)

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICFE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sirs
Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at $$3,063.74(all in) in full and
final settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their insured

arising out of this incident.

If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of the Letter of Authorization /
Warrant to Act and your Bank details for us to process payment.

1



Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of
liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore
and/or our insured as a result of the accident on 13 Sept 2021.

Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or
payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: -

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: chin <chin@modernautomotive.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 22 February 2023 1:44 pm

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Re: TP Settlement SJX2888Y (Allianz)

Dear Hsiao Tong
We accept your offer of amount $3,063.74 in settlement of the above claim.
Thank you

Regards,

Grace Chin

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd
Blk 3023-A, Ubi Road 1 #01-61
Singapore 408717

Tel: 6748 4422
Fax: 6747 6720

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 22 February 2023 12:43 pm

To: chin <chin@modernautomotive.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Re: TP Settlement SJX2888Y (Allianz)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sirs,

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $2,911.74
2. Loss of USE (3Days x $50.00) S 150.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee S 2.00

2



Total | $3,063.74

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: chin <chin@modernautomotive.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, February 14, 2023 1:37 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Re: TP Settlement SJX2888Y (Allianz)

Dear Hsiao Tong
We are waiting for settlement of the above claims, please revert asap.
Thank you

Regards,

Grace Chin

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd
Blk 3023-A, Ubi Road 1 #01-61
Singapore 408717

Tel: 6748 4422
Fax: 6747 6720

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 3 February 2023 10:27 am

To: chin <chin@modernautomotive.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Re: TP Settlement SJX2888Y (Allianz)

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs,



We are still pending mandate approval from Allianz.

We will follow up and get back to you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: chin <chin@modernautomotive.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 19 January 2023 3:33 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Re: TP Settlement SJX2888Y (Allianz)

Dear Hsiao Tong

We refer to our email on 05 Jan 2023.
Please confirm settlement asap.
Thank you

Regards,

Grace Chin

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd
Blk 3023-A, Ubi Road 1 #01-61
Singapore 408717

Tel: 6748 4422
Fax: 6747 6720

From: chin <chin@modernautomotive.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 5 January 2023 11:43 am

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Re: TP Settlement SJX2888Y (Allianz)

Dear Hsiao Tong
Please let us have the settlement for above claim asap.

Thank you



Regards,

Grace Chin

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd
Blk 3023-A, Ubi Road 1 #01-61
Singapore 408717

Tel: 6748 4422
Fax: 6747 6720

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 15 December 2022 11:34 am

To: chin <chin@modernautomotive.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Re: TP Settlement SJX2888Y (Allianz)

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs,
We are pending mandate approval from AlIS.

We will follow up and get back to you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: chin <chin@modernautomotive.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 13 December 2022 5:05 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Re: TP Settlement SJX2888Y (Allianz)

Dear Hsiao Tong
Please let us have your settlement asap.
Thank you

Regards,
Grace Chin
Modern Automotive Pte Ltd



Blk 3023-A, Ubi Road 1 #01-61
Singapore 408717

Tel: 6748 4422
Fax: 6747 6720

From: chin <chin@modernautomotive.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 26 October 2022 1:48 pm

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: TP Settlement SJX2888Y (Allianz)

Dear Hsiao Tong
We refer to the above matter.
Kindly confirm settlement as follow:

Repair Cost: $2,911.74 (Incl GST)
Loss of use : ($80 x 3 days): $240.00
Search fee: $2.00

Total: $3,153.74

We enclosed herewith our LOD for your perusal.

Thank you

Regards,

Grace Chin

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd
Blk 3023-A, Ubi Road 1 #01-61
Singapore 408717

Tel: 6748 4422
Fax: 6747 6720



Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 September 2022 9:23 AM

To: 'GOLEASEPTELTD@GMAIL.COM'

Subject: Claim Notification - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV535TH(ALLIANZ) AND SJX2888Y

ALONG CHANGI ROAD ON 13/09/2022

GO-LEASE PTE LTD [Email only]
Driver: YEW CHEE KEONG

Dear Sirs,
OUR REF : CC4/AI1S22009243/pa3
YOUR REF : SKV5351H

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV5351H(ALLIANZ) AND SJX2888Y ALONG CHANGI ROAD ON 13/09/2022

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your
motor insurer, Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a third party claim(s) from SJX2888Y against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your driver’s favour.
We shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third party claim at best to avoid further litigation,
which would escalate to even more cost.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against your policy.
We also wish to inform you that there is Section Il excess of $2,500.00(Before GST) for third party claim settlements.

As Insurers, they shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights
afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third
party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the
date of this letter. Your intent must be formally expressed to Allianz and acknowledged by Allianz.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to
chewht@lkkauto.com within 7 days from the date of this letter if not provided at our reporting centre. The list
below is not all inclusive and further document may be required:

e Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any)

e Driver’s driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

e Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

e Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

e Copy of the letter of authorization to confirm that the driver is allowed to drive the vehicle.

e Video footage of accident (if any)

e Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

e If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to keep us
informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim.

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s)
and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without our prior knowledge and
consent. If you receive any correspondence or legal document such as a Writ of Summons in connection with this
accident, please forward it to us immediately. You may email it to customerservice@allianz.com.sg or deliver it by
hand to Allianz Customer Care Centre.




This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by Allianz of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach
of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third-party injury claim(s), we shall keep you informed of the final
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact as at 6742 3197 or chewht@Ikkauto.com. Please
quote our claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)




3/1/23, 8:06 AM Merimen e-Claims

Claim Audit

=] AUDIT TRAIL

No. On Audit Remarks By
) ggzszep Cim Dtl Insured Name: -> GO-LEASE PTE LTD. Claimant's Name: -> LIN FENG. Claimant's ID: -> S70634 [A] HOW MEI
‘ Modified 64C. KWAN
17:14
20 Sep
Clm Veh Model [A] HOW MEI
2 1(7)2124 Changed (207225) BMW 118I 1.5 MSPT LED HL LED FL (A). KWAN
20 Sep Reg No: SJX2888Y. Policy No: SPMF1000000540. Acct Date: 2022/09/13. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: [A] HOW MEI
3 2022 Clm Created Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. (HQ). TP Insurer: Income Insurance Limited (HQ). Worksho KWAN
17:14 p: Modern Automotive Pte Ltd (HQ)
4 ggzszep Adj Co LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEL
Assigned D (Gl s A (HQ): KWAN
17:14
20 Sep .
Adj Next Rpt - . [A] HOW MEI
5 §92124 Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/09/29 KWAN
20 Sep .
6 2022 gdj Rlandate Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. IAIRLICHVIIES
et KWAN
17:14
20 Sep q -
Adj Adjuster [A] HOW MEI
7 20'22 Assigned [None] -> ADRIAN LING KWAN
17:14
22 Sep
TP Ins ) ) [A] HOW MEI
8 §22124 Updated TPRegNo0:201939769N -> SKV5351H. KWAN
26 Sep .
9 2022 Adj Next Rpt . pot:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/09/29 [1] Faiz Rosli
Changed
19:25
26 Sep -
10 2022 2:: Mandate ), oroved:0.00. [1] Faiz Rosli
19:25
11 %gzgd Adj Mandate Cur.Req:3347.19:Liability : 100%. Insured rear-ended third party. We seek your mandate at $3,1 [A] CHEW
10:33 Request 59.19(if claim LOU) / $ 3,347.19(if claim LOR). Kindly let us have your approval/instruction. HSIAO TONG
24 Feb :
12 2023 2:: Mandate  roved:3347.19. [1] Faiz Rosli
07:37
Date From 4] 75 =] pate To 4|75 | Audit Type None v
ACTIVITY
No record

Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

: : : Co Name

Allianz Allianz
20 Sep 2022 TP Case Insurance Insurance GO-LEASE PTE
ARSI 17:14:34 (Insurer) ety Singapore Pte. | Singapore Pte. SbAAEINT LTD xXXx
Ltd. (HQ) Ltd. (HQ)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_viewhistory&caseid=1139472&extid=395699&CFID=10... 1/2


https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=104256143&CFTOKEN=1b0a38d9e80afb8c-0892EA64-A9AA-7FE6-7C9EA912A74F64E2&USID=3251&RID=1769563
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=104256143&CFTOKEN=1b0a38d9e80afb8c-0892EA64-A9AA-7FE6-7C9EA912A74F64E2&USID=3251&RID=1769563
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=104256143&CFTOKEN=1b0a38d9e80afb8c-0892EA64-A9AA-7FE6-7C9EA912A74F64E2&USID=3251&RID=1769563
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=104256143&CFTOKEN=1b0a38d9e80afb8c-0892EA64-A9AA-7FE6-7C9EA912A74F64E2&USID=3251&RID=1769563&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D1139472%26extid%3D395699%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=104256143&CFTOKEN=1b0a38d9e80afb8c-0892EA64-A9AA-7FE6-7C9EA912A74F64E2&USID=3251&RID=1769563

	5fc1532cc37086259e3ea7a3c58538b85c5675115aa92335b67f2e5a3f63f454.pdf
	5fc1532cc37086259e3ea7a3c58538b85c5675115aa92335b67f2e5a3f63f454.pdf
	5fc1532cc37086259e3ea7a3c58538b85c5675115aa92335b67f2e5a3f63f454.pdf
	Microsoft Outlook - Memo Style
	Microsoft Outlook - Memo Style
	15e92333b47b6cfaade85a2bc8f8caca62403956d97bc575335c689d9073dcd2.pdf

