Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Erofia Motor - LeelLee Tan <erofia@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 4 July 2023 10:55 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: AIS REF: SVRAISCL2022-00053 - LOD & Final Invoice for accident involving
GBF4162) and FBU1688A on 13 September 2022 *** LKK REF:
CC4/A1S22009239/Upa3

Without Prejudice

Dear Hsiao Tong

We confirm accept your offer of $55,450.00 (all-In) being cost of repair and loss of use for FBU1688A
Kindly arrange payment to

EROFIA MOTOR TRADING PTE LTD

ACCOUNT NO: 378-302-644-7

UOB BANK

PAYNOW: 201202259N

Thank you

Thank you

Regards

LeelLee Tan

Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd
Tel: 67527740

Fax: 67528669

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@I|kkauto.com]

Sent: 04 July, 2023 10:53 AM

To: erofia@singnet.com.sg

Subject: RE: AIS REF: SVRAISCL2022-00053 - LOD & Final Invoice for accident involving GBF4162) and FBU1688A on
13 September 2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/AlS22009239/Upa3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sirs

Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at $$5,450.00(all in) in full and
final settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their insured
arising out of this incident.

If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of your Bank details for us to process
payment.



Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of
liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore
and/or our insured as a result of the accident on 13 SEPT 2022.

Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or
payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)




