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We refer to the above mentioned. 
 
SGW4461Y  repair job completed we submit our claim as follow : 
 

1) Repair cost                                                S$  2714.37 
2)  rental @$160 per day                             S$  480.00  

                                         Total  :              S$  3194.37 
 
Please let us have your offer to settle . 
 
Thank you & Best  Regards, 
Jouis Seow  
Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd 

 

From: jouis [mailto:jouis@jinauto.com.sg]  
Sent: Tuesday, 27 September 2022 11:47 AM 
To: 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)' <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>; 'Asher Sng 
(LKKAuto)' <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: 'jordan@jinauto.com.sg' <jordan@jinauto.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Accident involving SGW4461Y (Toyota Harrier) & GBK4421K (Aig) on 16/09/2022 *** LKK REF: 
CC6/AIG22009183/ea3  
Importance: High 
 
Without Prejudice  
 
 
Dear Sir/Mdm , 
 
Accident involving  SGW4461Y &   GBK4421K on   16/09/2022 
 
We were informed by GBK4421K driver that he has already file his accident report last week  , 
Please let us have your expedite reply for the establishment of liability for  
Direct settlement .  
 
Thank you & Best  Regards, 
Jouis Seow  
Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd 
Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10  
Singapore 539195. 
  
Tel        : (65) 62898126 
Fax       : (65) 62870590 
Email    : jouis@jinauto.com.sg  
  
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 20 September 2022 2:11 PM 
To: JIN AUTO SERVICES <jin@jinauto.com.sg> 
Cc: jouis@jinauto.com.sg; jordan@jinauto.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) 
<AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
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