Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: MY CAR CONSULTANT <admin@mycar.sg>
Sent: Friday, 27 January 2023 11:52 AM

To: Finalization

Subject: RE: SMX5719Y - Finalize

Hi,

Please proceed to close. Thank you.

Regards
Daud

From: "Finalization" <finalization@lkkauto.com>

Sent: 1/24/23 11:02 PM

To: MY CAR CONSULTANT <admin@mycar.sg>

Cc: "Veron Chen (LKKAuto)" <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SMX5719Y - Finalize

Hi Jackson/Daud,

We will be advising our principal for the costs of repairs in $3850.00 (P/P, before GST), 6 days. Subject to their
approval.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



