Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Ong Hock Kong <hk.ong@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 26 October 2022 9:18 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: ‘Suann’; ‘jiayu'; Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SNC 1212S Finalize calculation and discharge photos

Dear Steve,
We accept your offer @ $13,411.30 P/P with 5 days.
Thank You.

Best Regards,
Ong

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) [mailto:SteveChen@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 26 October 2022 8:59 AM

To: Ong Hock Kong

Cc: 'Suann'; 'jiayu’; Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: SNC 1212S Finalize calculation and discharge photos

Hi Ong,

Can we close the finalize at below amount

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 October 2022 9:52 am

To: Ong Hock Kong <hk.ong@mova.com.sg>

Cc: 'Suann' <suann@mova.com.sg>; ‘jiayu' <jiayu@mova.com.sg>; Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: SNC 1212S Finalize calculation and discharge photos

Hi Ong,



Kindly refer our finalize $13,411.30 (P/P, before GST). 5 days.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ong Hock Kong <hk.ong@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 15 October 2022 3:16 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Suann' <suann@mova.com.sg>; 'jiayu' <jiayu@mova.com.sg>
Subject: SNC 1212S Finalize calculation and discharge photos

Dear Steve,

Attached finalize calculation and discharge photos for your attention.
Kindly assist to finalize as vehicle been discharged.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Ong



