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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 9 May 2023 5:03 PM
To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
Cc: SUR
Subject: Re: Estimate for SKA8044K

Dear Celine, 
 
We confirmed COR at a lump sum of $6,650 before GST and 8 days. 
 
Warmest regards, 
Steven 
Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd 
82636295 
 
 
On Tuesday, 9 May 2023 at 04:59:54 pm SGT, Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> wrote:  
 
 

Dear Steven, 

  

“Without Prejudice”        

  

We will be advising our Principal cost of repair of Lump Sum $6,650.00 with 8 days of repair, subject to 
their approval.  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, September 23, 2022 10:22 AM 
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To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: 转发: Estimate for SKA8044K 

  

  

发件人: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com> 

已发送: 2022年9月23日 10:21:50 (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 

收件人: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

主题: Re: Estimate for SKA8044K 

Dear Guo Qiang, 

  

Supplementary estimate for your kind attention. 

  

Warmest regards, 

Steven 

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd 

82636295 

  

  

On Tuesday, 20 September 2022 at 09:46:06 am SGT, Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com> wrote:  

  

  

Dear Guo Qiang, 

  

Please see documents attached. 

  

Warmest regards, 

Steven 

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd 

82636295 


