Yan (LKK Auto)

From: MTPRI <MTPRI@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 15 September 2022 12:14 PM

To: assignments; YAN

Cc: MTPRI; Magnaye Ana Margie Marasigan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd)

Subject: FW: Accident involved with vehicle SGZ6505B & SHD6140Z(MSFCI) on 14/09/2022
along Bukit Batok West Ave 2

Attachments: receipt-20220914-203621.pdf; GIA.pdf

Ref: TAX/09/22/2031

Dear Yan,

Kindly survey on “ Without Prejudice” basis.
TP: SGZ6505B

Insured: SHD6140Z

Workshop: Auto Wheels Motorworks PTE LTD
Thank you.

Regards,

Hua Yen
Claim Department

Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd | 60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4 Singapore 757705
DID: 6866 2650 | Fax: 6368 7421 | Email: HuaYen.Ong@strides.com.sg

From: Louis Ong <louisongautowheels@yahoo.com>

Sent: Thursday, 15 September 2022 10:51 am

To: MTPRI <MTPRI@smrt.com.sg>

Subject: Fw: Accident involved with vehicle SGZ6505B & SHD6140Z(MSFCI) on 14/09/2022 along Bukit Batok West Ave 2

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of SMRT. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender and
are expecting the content or attachment.

Hi,

We would like to do a Direct Settlement with you if our liability is 100%.
Kindly advice us the liability and arrange for survey.

Thanks

Auto Wheels Motorworks PTE LTD

Louis Ong
91928963



----- Forwarded message -----

From: Louis Ong <louisongautowheels@yahoo.com>

To: MTPRI@STRIDES.COM.sg <mtpri@strides.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 15 September 2022 at 10:45:22 am SGT

Subject: Fw: Accident involved with vehicle SGZ6505B & SHD6140Z(MSFCI) on 14/09/2022 along Bukit Batok West Ave
2

Hi,
We would like to do a Direct Settlement with you if our liability is 100%.
Kindly advice us the liability and arrange for survey.

Thanks

Auto Wheels Motorworks PTE LTD
Louis Ong
91928963

----- Forwarded message -----

From: Louis Ong <|ouisongautowheels@yahoo.com>

To: Harminder Kaur <harminder@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; motorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg
<motorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; mtpri@strides.com.sg <mtpri@strides.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 15 September 2022 at 10:41:22 am SGT

Subject: Accident involved with vehicle SGZ6505B & SHD6140Z(MSFCI) on 14/09/2022 along Bukit Batok West Ave 2

Hi,

We would like to do a Direct Settlement with you if our liability is 100%.
Kindly advice us the liability and arrange for survey.

Thanks

Auto Wheels Motorworks PTE LTD

Louis Ong
91928963



