Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 15 September 2022 1:24 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR; assignments

Cc: Charandeep Singh; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10017284/CD || Ol- SLE6054L (Brown) TP- GBJ7058L || Est:
$0.00 || KT MOTORWERK

Attachments: C10017284.zip

Hi Team

We wish to appoint LKK to conduct survey for the TP vehicle number: GBJ7058L

KT MOTORWERK
Blk 3012 Bedok Industrial Park E, #01-2020 S489978

Contact: John Tee
HP: 98287487

Please find attached GIA reports for your reference.

Best regards,

Salizawati Haizar
Admin Executive, Claims

F +65 6725 0853
E salizawati.h@budgetdirect.com.sg
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From: John Tee <ktmotorwerk@hotmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 15 September 2022 10:52 am

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PRI Request on 14.09.2022 || Our ref: C10017284/CD | | ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBJ7058L AND SLE6054L
ON 02/09/2022

Dear Team,
We would like to appoint 3. LKK.
Thank you.
Regards,

John Tee,
HP:98287487



KT MOTORWERK
ADD: Blk 3012 Bedok Industrial Park E, #01-2020 S489978

From: John Tee <ktmotorwerk@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 September 2022 6:53 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBJ7058L AND SLE6054L ALONG UPPER BUKIT TIMAH ROAD ON 02/09/2022 @1550HRS

To the officer in charge,
We are the appointed workshop for GBJ7058L. The other party SLE6054L (BUDGETDIRECT).
Please arrange for inspection at the following address:

KT MOTORWERK
ADD: Blk 3012 Bedok Industrial Park E, #01-2020 S489978

Once the date and time is firm, please inform us and look for John Tee, 98287487 during the inspection.

Regards,

John Tee,

HP:98287487

KT MOTORWERK

ADD: Blk 3012 Bedok Industrial Park E, #01-2020 S489978



