
        

22nd December 2022 

 
Our reference: SMN9551P 
Your reference: SLC4897U 
  
Allianz Global Corporate & Specialty SE, Singapore Branch                 BY HAND 
12 Marina View 
#14-01 Asia Square Tower 2 
Singapore018961 
Attn: Motor Claims Department 
 
Dear Sir/ Madam, 
 
Claimant : FOCUS RENTALS PTE LTD   
Address : 20 SIN MING LANE #03-64 MIDVIEW CITY S573968 
 
We are instructed by the above named to claim damages against your insured/your 

insured’s driver in connection with a road accident on 13/09/2022 along involving our 

client’s vehicle registration number SMN9551P and vehicle registrations number 

SLC4897U driven by you/your insured’s driver at the material time. 

 As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle was damaged and our client has been 

put to loss and expense, particulars of which are as follows:- 

 

Cost of Repair : $3,852.00  

Loss of Use ($150 X 06 DAYS) : $900.00  

LTA Search : $2.00  

GIA Search : $31.00  

Total : $4,785.00  

 

 

MY CAR CONSULTANT PTE LTD 
 
Address: 60 Jalan Lam Huat, Carros Centre #05-21 S(737869) 
Email: Admin@mycar.sg  
(Company Registration No: 201605878Z) 
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PAYMENT ADVICE
To: My Car Consultant Pte. Ltd.

60 Jalan Lam Huat 05-21
Carros Center
737869
SINGAPORE

Customer ALLIANZ GLOBAL CORPORATE &
SPECIALITY SE

Invoice Number MCC2022-5033

Amount Due 3,852.00
Due Date 22 Dec 2022

Amount Enclosed  

Enter the amount you are paying above

Registered Office: 60 Jalan Lam Huat 05-67, Carros Center, 737869, Singapore.

TAX INVOICE
ALLIANZ GLOBAL CORPORATE & SPECIALITY SE
12 Marina View, Asia Square Tower 2
SINGAPORE 018961

Invoice Date
22 Dec 2022

Invoice Number
MCC2022-5033

Reference
SMN9551P

201605878Z
201605878Z

My Car Consultant Pte. Ltd.
60 Jalan Lam Huat 05-21
Carros Center
737869
SINGAPORE

Description Quantity Unit Price Tax Amount SGD

Cost of Repair 1.00 3,600.00 7% 3,600.00

Subtotal 3,600.00

TOTAL  LOCAL SUPPLY OF GOODS AND
SERVICES 7%

252.00

TOTAL SGD 3,852.00

Due Date: 22 Dec 2022
GST REG NO. - 201605878Z
DBS CURRENT A/C - 018-904614-2
PAYNOW UEN - 201605878Z
CHEQUE PAYABLE TO - MY CAR CONSULTANT PTE LTD
INTEREST OF 1.5% PER MONTH WILL BE CHARGEABLE FOR OVERDUE PAYMENTS.

Winnie
Stamp



TAX INVOICE

Date of Request: 13/09/2022
Your Ref No: SMN9551P

Dear Sir/Madam,

Date of Accident: 13/09/2022 00:00 (SGT)
Vehicle No: SMN9551P
Place of Accident: Singapore

With reference to your application for the accident report, we have attached the following accident report as requested:

DOCUMENTS ACCIDENT LOCATION PER DOC (S$) QTY AMOUNT (S$)

SLC4897U Singapore (31.00 ) 1 (28.97 )

GST Amount (2.03 )

Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) (31.00 )

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General
Insurance Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no
liability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

Thank you.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: MY CAR CONSULTANT <admin@mycar.sg>
Sent: Sunday, 25 June 2023 7:29 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A; CS A Team; Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
Subject: LOD - SMN9551P - YOUR REF : 2022 22006735KC-SLC4897U *** LKK REF: 

CC4/AIS22009062/Rea3
Attachments: MCC Giro.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
  
Please find our bank details as attached. 
 

Best Regards, 
Jackson Ho  
Claim Handler | Motor Claims Department  
 
My Car Consultant Pte Ltd  
M: 8344 7681 | F: 6925 5219 
W: Mycar.sg | E: admin@mycar.sg 

60 Jalan Lam Huat, Carros Centre #05-21 S(737869)  
UEN No.: 201605878Z 
 

From: "Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)" <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: 6/23/23 2:56 PM 
To: "admin@mycar.sg" <admin@mycar.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>, CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>, "Celine Fong (LKKAuto)" <celinefong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: SPAM-LOW: RE: LOD - SMN9551P - YOUR REF : 2022 22006735KC-SLC4897U *** LKK REF: 
CC4/AIS22009062/Rea3 
 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

  

Dear Sirs 

  

Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at S$4,365.00(all in) in full and final 
settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their insured arising out of this 
incident.  

  

If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of your Bank details for us to process payment.   

  

Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of liability and 
waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or our insured as a result 
of the accident on 13 SEPT 2022.  
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Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or payments 
constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability. 

  

Thank you.  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: MY CAR CONSULTANT <admin@mycar.sg>  
 Sent: Monday, March 20, 2023 12:47 PM 
 To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
 Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> 
 Subject: LOD - SMN9551P - YOUR REF : 2022 22006735KC-SLC4897U *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22009062/Rea3 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  

Dear Sirs, 
  
We accept your offer. 

  

Best Regards, 

Jackson Ho  

Claim Handler | Motor Claims Department  
 
My Car Consultant Pte Ltd  
 M: 8344 7681 | F: 6925 5219 
 W: Mycar.sg | E: admin@mycar.sg 

60 Jalan Lam Huat, Carros Centre #05-21 S(737869)  
 UEN No.: 201605878Z 
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From: "Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)" <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
 Sent: 3/20/23 12:30 PM 
 To: "admin@mycar.sg" <admin@mycar.sg> 
 Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>, CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>, "Celine Fong (LKKAuto)" <celinefong@lkkauto.com> 
 Subject: SPAM-LOW: RE: LOD - SMN9551P - YOUR REF : 2022 22006735KC-SLC4897U *** LKK REF: 
CC4/AIS22009062/Rea3 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

We propose settlement as follows: - 

  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 3,852.00 
2. Loss of Use (6days x $80.00) $    480.00 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $      33.00 

Total $ 4,365.00 
  

Please confirm acceptance. 

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the 
sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of 
liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially 
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation 
terms/settlement.” 

  

  

  



  
 
Company Name  MY CAR CONSULTANT PTE LTD 

Company Reg No.   201605878Z 

Address 
 60 JALAN LAM HUAT, 05-21 
CARROS  CENTRE 

Contact No.  83447681 

    

Bank Transfer Details   

Beneficiary   MY CAR CONSULTANT PTE LTD 

Bank Name  DBS BANK 

Bank Branch  DBS AMK HUB 

Bank Address 
 53 ANG MO KIO AVENUE 3 , B1-01 AMK 
HUB 

Bank Code  7171 

Branch Code  018 

SWIFT Code  DBSSSGSG 

Bank Account No.   018-904614-2 

Currency SGD  
Remittance Attention To 
Email  ADMIN@MYCAR.SG 
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 20 March 2023 12:28 PM
To: 'Admin@secretgarage.sg'
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLC4897U(ALLIANZ) AND SMN9551P AT/ALONG CTE 

TOWARDS SLE AFTER EXIT 1B ON 13/09/2022

SECRET AUTO TRADING PTE LTD                            [By Email Only] 
DRIVER: NG WEI ZEI 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
You Ref: SLC4897U 
Our Ref: CC4/AIS22009062/Rea3 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLC4897U(ALLIANZ) AND SMN9551P AT/ALONG CTE TOWARDS SLE AFTER EXIT 1B ON 
13/09/2022 
  
We refer to the above subject matter.  We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your 
motor insurer, Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy. 
  
We have received a claim from SMN9551P against your insurance policy. 
                
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your driver’s favour. 
Therefore, we shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third-party claim at best to avoid further 
litigation, which would escalate to even more cost.  
  
Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against your policy. 
  
As Insurers, they shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights 
afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third 
party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the 
date of this letter. Your intent must be formally expressed to Allianz and acknowledged by Allianz. 
  
To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s) 
and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without our prior knowledge and 
consent. If you receive any correspondence or legal document such as a Writ of Summons in connection with this 
accident, please forward it to us immediately. You may email it to customerservice@allianz.com.sg or deliver it by 
hand to Allianz Customer Care Centre. 
  
This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by Allianz of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach 
of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed. 
  
In the event of receiving and handling of any third-party injury claim(s), we shall keep you informed of the final 
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).  
  
If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact as at 6742 3197 or chewht@lkkauto.com. 
  
Thank you. 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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Claim Audit

 

  AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
14 Sep
2022
18:39

Clm Dtl
Modified

Insured Name: -> SECRET AUTO TRADING PTE LTD. Insured ID: -> 202208936C. Claimant's Nam
e: -> FOCUS RENTALS PTE LTD. Claimant's ID: -> 201836450G.

[A] HOW
MEI KWAN

2
14 Sep
2022
18:39

Clm Veh
Model
Changed

(207048) TOYOTA VOXY HYBRID 1.8 V CVT (A). [A] HOW
MEI KWAN

3
14 Sep
2022
18:39

Clm Created
Reg No: SMN9551P. Policy No: SP2002119964. Acct Date: 2022/09/13. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: Alli
anz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. (HQ). TP Insurer: India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ). Wo
rkshop: My Car Consultant Pte Ltd ( Jalan Lam Huat ) (HQ)

[A] HOW
MEI KWAN

4
14 Sep
2022
18:39

Adj Co
Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW

MEI KWAN

5
14 Sep
2022
18:39

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/09/23 [A] HOW

MEI KWAN

6
14 Sep
2022
18:39

Adj Mandate
Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW

MEI KWAN

7
14 Sep
2022
18:39

Adj Adjuster
Assigned [None] -> MOHD RASUL [A] HOW

MEI KWAN

8
27 Feb
2023
16:45

Adj Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:5000.00:The total claim amount is less than $5,000.00. Pls assist to approve mandate up t
o $5,000.00 for our necessary action. Thanks.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO
TONG

9
28 Feb
2023
13:13

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/09/23 [I] Chan

Kian Chuan

10
28 Feb
2023
13:13

Adj Mandate
Set Approved:5000.00. [I] Chan

Kian Chuan

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go

ACTIVITY
No record

Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2843226 14 Sep 2022
18:39:12

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

SMN9551P
SECRET AUTO
TRADING PTE

LTD
xx.xx

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=107895649&CFTOKEN=11c5efaca39c6992-61782D09-0575-12B0-482AF871414C4CEC&USID=3251&RID=3579352
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=107895649&CFTOKEN=11c5efaca39c6992-61782D09-0575-12B0-482AF871414C4CEC&USID=3251&RID=3579352
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=107895649&CFTOKEN=11c5efaca39c6992-61782D09-0575-12B0-482AF871414C4CEC&USID=3251&RID=3579352
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=107895649&CFTOKEN=11c5efaca39c6992-61782D09-0575-12B0-482AF871414C4CEC&USID=3251&RID=3579352&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D1137247%26extid%3D395263%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=107895649&CFTOKEN=11c5efaca39c6992-61782D09-0575-12B0-482AF871414C4CEC&USID=3251&RID=3579352
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