Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 14 September 2022 12:28 PM
To: Yan (LKK Auto); admin-a@lkkauto.com
Cc: annatan@visionlawllc.com
Subject: TP DS claim: [EXT] PRE REPAIR FOR VEHICLE NO. SMM7814A
Attachments: image001.wmz

Internal

Your ref: SMM7814A

Our ref: 2022 22006702SL-SIN3879U

Dear Sirs,

We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Please download the documents from this link below (For Survey)

File: SMM7814A[TP-INCOME].pdf, SIN3879U-Ol.pdf

Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=dd14a909-147e-4abe-8119-c5a3bae5dc93-9acca264409eb004

Size: ~ 3 MByte, Download available until: 9/19/2022

Passwords will be sent in a separate email.

Thank you.

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

QQ | Alianz @ | (.

Werldwide Olympl ond Parolympic Postner

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.



P Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Anna Tan <annatan@visionlawllc.com>

Sent: Wednesday, September 14, 2022 9:59 AM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Subject: [EXT] PRE REPAIR FOR VEHICLE NO. SMM7814A

OUR REF: AM-atv-INS-N63-118281-22

NAME OF CLAIMANT: NG YEW KIAN AARON

VEHICLE NUMBER: SMM 7814 A

YOUR INSURED VEHICLE NUMBER: SJN 3879 U

ACCIDENT ON 10 SEPTEMBER 2022 ALONG PIE TOWARDS TUAS AT ABOUT 1240HOURS
Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

Our client confirmed appointment of LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD as the Single Joint Expert for this matter.
Please be informed that the said vehicle can be inspected at :

N-51 AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

Kaki Bukit Autohub

2 Kaki Bukit Avenue 2

#01-17/18

SINGAPORE 417921

Contact Person: Melody Direct line : 6932 4863, Office : 6842 0051

If you fail to conduct the pre-repair inspection within the next 2 working days excluding any intervening Saturday, Sunday
or Public Holiday, the said workshop will commence repairs thereafter without further reference to you.

KIND REGARDS,

MS ANNA TAN
Secretary

VISION LAW LLC

Tel: 65342811 ext 124

FORS.REYCR

Heeseinitid here ater carpleion o pregpair inspection. Therk you
From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) )
[mailto:claims@allianz.com.sg] Appainted suveyar
Sent: Tuesday, 13 September, 2022 6:44 PM (Nare &Sgreure)
To: annatan@Uvisionlawllc.com

Subject: FW: PRE REPAIR FOR VEHICLE NO.
SMM7814A we&'ﬁrredlrs;mﬁm .

Importance: High




Internal

Your ref: SMM7814A
Our ref: 2022 22006702SL-SJN3879U

Dear Sirs
Enclosed is the list of surveyors for your consideration for Single Joint Expert (SJE):-

AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd
A-PAC Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd
Form Team Consultancy Pte Ltd
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Please let us know who you are agreeable to appoint from the list.

Best regards,

Shanti.R
Claims Service
Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte.Ltd. | UEN 201903913C

79 Robinson Road #09-01 Singapore 068897
Phone: +65 63958973 | www.allianz.sg

OQL | Allianz @ | (.o

Worldwide Olympic and Porolympic Portner

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain
confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or
disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-
mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Anna Tan <annatan@visionlawllc.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September 13, 2022 3:05 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Cc: 'Kah Hui' <kahhui@visionlawllc.com>

Subject: [EXT] PRE REPAIR FOR VEHICLE NO. SMM7814A

Importance: High

OUR REF: AM-atv-INS-N63-118281-22

Dear Shanti,



We refer to the above matter and your email of 12 September 2022.
As requested, we enclose herewith LTA search and GIA report of our client’s vehicle for your attention.
We will proceed accordingly if we do not hear from you by 12pm, 14 September 2022.

Regards,

Anna Tan
Secretary
Vision Law LLC

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) [mailto:claims@allianz.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 12 September, 2022 2:07 PM

To: Anna Tan

Cc: 'Kah Hui'

Subject: RE: PRE REPAIR FOR VEHICLE NO. SMM7814A

Internal

Dear Sir/ Madam,
Kindly provide us the LTA Search results and GIA report.
Thank you.

Should you require any clarification or assistance, please do not hesitate to contact our Claims Department at
claims@allianz.com.sg

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

OQP | Alianz @) | (.o

Worldwide Olympit and Porolympic Portraer

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.

From: Anna Tan <annatan@visionlawllc.com>

Sent: Monday, September 12, 2022 10:24 AM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Cc: 'Kah Hui' <kahhui@visionlawllc.com>

Subject: [EXT] PRE REPAIR FOR VEHICLE NO. SMM7814A




DATE OF ACCIDENT: 10 SEPTEMBER 2022
NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 3 WORKING DAYS PURSUANT TO
PARAGRAPH 2.2 OF PRE-ACTION PROTOCOL FOR NIMA CASES

We are instructed by N-51 AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD to notify you of a road traffic accident on 10 SEPTEMBER
2022 at about 1240HOURS ALONG PIE TOWARDS TUAS involving our client’s vehicle SMM 7814 A and SIN
3879 U driven by your insured and/or your insured’s driver at the material time.

As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle has been damaged. Before our client proceed to repair the
damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you or your
insurer would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply from you within
the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair the vehicle without further reference to you.

KIND REGARDS,

MS ANNA TAN
Secretary

VISION LAW LLC

Tel: 65342811 ext 124

VISION LAW LLC

Advocates & Solicitors

(Incorporated with limited liability)

Unique Entity No. 200721148H

Address : 133 New Bridge Road #18-01/02 Chinatown Point, Singapore 059413

DISCLAIMER:

The contents of this email (including any attachments) are confidential and privileged and only intended for the
recipient(s) addressed above. If you received this email

by error, please notify the sender immediately and destroy it (and all attachments) without reading, storing and/or
disseminating any of its contents (in any form) to any

person. Email communication is not secure. Vision Law LLC is not liable for any losses arising out of any errors or
omissions in the contents resulting from email

transmission or any illegal or unauthorised usage or tampering of its email system.

VISION LAW LLC
Advocates & Solicitors
(Incorporated with limited liability)



Unique Entity No. 200721148H
Address : 133 New Bridge Road #18-01/02 Chinatown Point, Singapore 059413

DISCLAIMER:

The contents of this email (including any attachments) are confidential and privileged and only intended for the
recipient(s) addressed above. If you received this email
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transmission or any illegal or unauthorised usage or tampering of its email system.

VISION LAW LLC

Advocates & Solicitors

(Incorporated with limited liability)

Unique Entity No. 200721148H

Address : 133 New Bridge Road #18-01/02 Chinatown Point, Singapore 059413

DISCLAIMER:

The contents of this email (including any attachments) are confidential and privileged and only intended for the
recipient(s) addressed above. If you received this email
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disseminating any of its contents (in any form) to any
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omissions in the contents resulting from email
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