Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 16 September 2022 12:11 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'

Cc: '‘MT_Claim_SG'; Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY - THIRD PARTY CLAIM FOR VEHICLE NO XE3935Y *** LKK
REF: CC4/LPC22009053/Epa3

Attachments: LKK SURVEY PHOTO.pdf; TP ESTIMATE - MARKED.pdf; Preliminary Advice.pdf

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice
- Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 September 2022 11:30 AM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY - THIRD PARTY CLAIM FOR VEHICLE NO XE3935Y

Dear Gerald,
Thank you for the assignment.

Repairer arrange on 15.9.22.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 September 2022 7:23 AM

To: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: FW: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY - THIRD PARTY CLAIM FOR VEHICLE NO XE3935Y

Lonpac External - General

Our Ref 1 21/22/22/VC00/026219
Dear Yan,

FYNA. Attached copy of insured report.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Customer Service (Poh Seng Group) <tuascustsvs@psgroup.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 September 2022 5:52 pm

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@|onpac.com>; 'Poh Seng Group, Singapore' <kpsmotor@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: 'Boon Chiao Loo' <boonchiao.loo@panunited.com.sg>; 'Chin Sern Phang' <chinsern.phang@panunited.com.sg>
Subject: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY - THIRD PARTY CLAIM FOR VEHICLE NO XE3935Y

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Good afternoon,

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO: XE3935Y AND XD7945Y ON 26/08/2022 AT ADMIRALTY
ROAD W BESIDE CONSTRUCTION SITE.

Please kindly find the attached of the quotation and accident report for your reference, so as to arrange your surveyor to
study the damaged of our vehicle no: XE3935Y at our Tuas Workshop located at 1 Tuas South St 13 Singapore 637084.

May you need more clarification, please feel free to contact Mr Koh @ 68983113

Thank you, till wait for your early reply.

Best Regards
Xin Ya
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Poh Seng Enterprises Pte Ltd

Ping Siong International Pte Ltd

Blk 3 Pioneer Road North #01-13 Singapore 628457 (HQ)

1 Tuas South Street 13 Singapore 637084 (Branch)

Tel: (65) 62657826 (Pioneer) / (65) 68983113 (Tuas) Fax: (65) 62665874
www.facebook.com/pohsengintl

G-CERT?) (SSERTY) SR

B0 B39 Jee Oehhl L0 DT 5 T -{ﬁ R

Cartl Mg GICMI-SLO-C Caet P G 08 3000-OHE

CONFIDENTIALITY: This e-mail (including any attachments) is confidential and may contain proprietary information. If
you are not the intended recipient, be advised that you have received this e-mail in error. Any use, disclosure,
dissemination, printing or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error, please
immediately contact the sender by return e-mail and then irretrievably delete it from your system.



