Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 7 March 2023 12:08 PM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: OD Ergo Insurance GBK9340C RE: item 35 missing on my estimate marked
GBK9340C RE: GBK9340C-OD-ERGO

Attachments: SKM_C250i23030711530.pdf

From: William Auto <waplsp21@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 7 March 2023 12:07:28 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: OD Ergo Insurance GBK9340C RE: item 35 missing on my estimate marked GBK9340C RE: GBK9340C-OD-
ERGO

Dear Mr Rasul

Enclosed Final Bill ( Ergo Insurance O/D ) of GBK9340C for your kind perusal
Thank you

William Ang

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) [mailto:Rasul@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 22 February 2023 9:01 am

To: William Auto <waplsp21@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: Re: item 35 missing on my estimate marked GBK9340C RE: GBK9340C-OD-ERGO

Hi William,
Kindly acknowledge

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

iy Save the ELarth: Frint only wher necessary-

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 13 February 2023 10:26 am

To: William Auto <waplsp21@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: Re: item 35 missing on my estimate marked GBK9340C RE: GBK9340C-OD-ERGO

Hi Mr William,
As spoken, the finalised amount is P/P $ 6,287.81/ 5 days of repair

Kindly acknowledge

Best Regards,



Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Eil Save the ELarth- Print only when necessary-

From: William Auto <waplsp21@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 10 February 2023 11:00 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: item 35 missing on my estimate marked GBK9340C RE: GBK9340C-OD-ERGO

Dear Rasul

Please check the missing Item 35 on estimate marked S. Nett $20.00,
The correct amounts should be $6,287.81.

Please revert to me ASAP

Thank you

William Ang

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) [mailto:Rasul@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 10 February, 2023 8:35 AM

To: William Auto <waplsp21@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: Re: GBK9340C-OD-ERGO

Hi Mr William,
refer to attachment

Audit checked some parts prices required verification.We will be advising our principal
a cost of repair P/P $6,267.81./- with 05 days of repair subject to their approval.

Kindly acknowledge

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

=] Save the ELarth: Frint only wher necessary-

From: William Auto <waplsp21@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 September 2022 5:07 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: GBK9340C-OD-ERGO




From: waplsp21@singnet.com.sg [mailto:waplsp21@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 14 September, 2022 3:34 PM

To: waplsp21l@singnet.com.sg
Subject: Message from KM_C250i




