Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 16 September 2022 11:45 AM

To: Cecilia Lee

Cc: Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SNM22D206547/C02/SMN4495B/LEEPG / RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving
SMN4495B (Ol : CTI - TBA) and SKX5223J (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI22008995/Kea3) on
12/09/2022

Attachments: Preliminary Advice.pdf; LKK SURVEY PHOTO.pdf; TP ESTIMATE - MARKED.pdf

Dear Cecilia,

We refer to the above matter.

Enclosed for your perusal is:

- TP estimated cost of repair

- Preliminary advice

- Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Cecilia Lee <cecilia.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 September 2022 6:26 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SNM22D206547/C02/SMN4495B/LEEPG / RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SMN4495B (Ol : CTI -
TBA) and SKX5223J (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI22008995/ea3) on 12/09/2022

Hi Sir/Madam
Attached SAS. Same password

Thanks & Regards
Cecilia Lee

Without Prejudice
Save As To Costs

Dear Sir/Madam



Strictly on a without prejudice basis and without admission of any liability, we offer to settle your client’s claim as
follows:

We have assessed your client’s claim and would like to highlight that he was given 6 days of MC and was treated with
the usual medications to relief pains.

Further, your client sought medical treatment only TWICE and as such, it is safe to assume that she has achieved full
recovery without any residual disabilities.

Purely to reach a settlement, we are proposing offer as follows:

Please note that our offer of settlement is full and final, if there be any injury claims by your client, please combine it in
one Letter of Demand as a cause of action shall not be divided for the purpose of bringing 2 or more actions.

Attached herewith our Discharge Voucher for your client’s execution. Please return the duly signed DV, together with a
copy of the Final Repair Bill and Authorization To Act via email.

However, if the repair cost cannot be agreed upon, we would like to request for re-inspection.

Please note that we will contest the cost of repairs as recommended by MC-Coy vigorously. In the event that the case
cannot be resolved amicably, and that the court held the view that our offer on cost of repair is reasonable, we reserve
all our rights to claim costs from your client.

Our 50% offer is simply with a view to to bring this matter to end. Kindly do not construe as an admission of liability on
the part of our insured and shall not in any way jeopardize our client’s rights against the responsible party.

Please note that our offer is strictly made on a without prejudice basis and without admission of any liability, it shall not
in any way jeopardize our client’s rights against the responsible party.

Please note that our offer of settlement is solely for an amicable basis and shall not be construed as any admission of
liability on the part of our insured and/or driver. This settlement shall not be cited in any other related action suit that
may arise out from this accident.

We look forward to your favorable reply.
Please hold hands while negotiation is in progress.

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to be
expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Thanks & Best Regards,
Cecilia Lee

Senior Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6530 | F:(65) 6224 7175



W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: A0, Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain
confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial,
is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and
any copies of it thereafter.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 September 2022 6:00 pm

To: Cecilia Lee <cecilia.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SNM22D206547/C02/SMN4495B/LEEPG / RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SMN44958B (Ol : CTI -
TBA) and SKX5223J (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI22008995/ea3) on 12/09/2022

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Cecilia,
Kindly assist to upload a copy of insured GIA report with driver full NRIC number to check on OID's DL status.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Cecilia Lee <cecilia.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 September 2022 4:04 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SNM22D206547/C02/SMN4495B/LEEPG / RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SMN44958B (Ol : CTI -
TBA) and SKX5223J (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI22008995/ea3) on 12/09/2022

This is a Secure PDF message. This email has been protected as an encrypted PDF document.

Please retrieve the PDF password from https://apc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fse-
password.secureage.com%2F%23%2F%3Fid%3D1326fc54-4cd4-4192-a271-
40297944789b&amp;data=05%7C01%7Ccecilia.lee%40sg.cntaiping.com%7C891f18072e71439b4e4108da9637ec4d%7C
52fbc9ef9a574c5badcad6f2633868e5%7C0%7C0%7C637987464189784152%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiM
CAwLjAwMDAILCJQljoiV2IuMzliLCJBTil61k1haWwiLCIXVCI6EMNn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&amp;sdata=qNOGk2VP2%2F
6NKgjTbHgvrK9yEMOt6ct3294xTgsadUg%3D&amp;reserved=0 and open the encrypted PDF attachment to view your
secure message. If you have problem accessing the encrypted message, please contact the sender of the message.



