Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Subject:
Attachments:

Follow Up Flag:
Flag Status:

Categories:

Dear Mei Kwan,

karen Seah <weileemotorworks@gmail.com>

Thursday, 15 September 2022 10:17 AM

Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Re: SKX5223) / SMN4495B *** LKK REF: CC6/CTI22008995/Kea3
WhatsApp Video 2022-09-13 at 10.52.01 AM.mp4

Follow up
Flagged

HMK

attached is the On site photo for your reference
also attached is the video shared to us by vehicle












regards,
Jack

On Wed, Sep 14, 2022 at 5:58 PM Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI’s sketch plan and statement.



Skewch Plan
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Describe Circumsiances of the Acscident
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Please provide us the following.
e evidence i.e. video and scene photo

o Police investigation result (if any)

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Asher.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 September 2022 5:43 PM

To: weileemotorworks@gmail.com; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SKX5223) / SMN44958B

Dear Jack,

Noted with thanks.

We will arrange survey accordingly.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 13 September 2022 4:54 PM

To: assignments <assignments@l|kkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SKX5223) / SMN44958B

Hi

Kindly assist.



To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: karen Seah <weileemotorworks@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 13 September 2022 2:58 PM

To: Admin-B <admin-b@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SKX5223) / SMN44958B

Dear LKK,

Accident involve: SKX5223J) / SMN4495B
Your insured: SMN4495B, China Taiping

As the car is at our premises already, please arrange to survey the car tomorrow asap

Thanks
Jack

Wei Lee Motor Works
Block 9 Sin Ming Industrial Estate

#01-32 Singapore 575644



Tel: 6456 9830

Company registration: 269436,/00)

Wei Lee Motor Works

Block 9 Sin Ming Industrial Estate
#01-32 Singapore 575644

Tel: 6456 9830

Company registration: 269436,/00)



