
1

Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Maya N <vmo1@bigfoot.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 28 September 2022 6:00 PM
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore)
Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto); Admin A; Roslee Puasa; Management
Subject: Re: TP DS CLAIM [EXT] Re: Invite for PRS of Vehicle No. YM7103B; ACCIDENT 

INVOLVING YM7103B and YM7126K on 05/09/2022 ALONG AYE NEAR CLEMENTI AVE 
6 EXIT

Attachments: BF STOCK DAMAGE - YM7103B  DOA 050922.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Categories: HMK

Dear Shanti, 
 
Please be informed that, besides the claim for the cost of repair to our vehicle YM7103B, we are also claiming for the 
cost of goods which were damaged at the time of the accident. 
 
These damaged goods were subsequently rejected by our client. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
On Tue, Sep 13, 2022 at 10:45 AM Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> wrote: 

Internal 

 

  

Your ref:   YM7103B 
Our ref: 2022 22006675KC-YM7126K 

  

  

Dear Sirs,  

  

We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd. to conduct survey. 

  

Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.  
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Please download the documents from this link below (For Survey) 

  

File: YM7126K-OI.pdf, YM7103B-TP1.pdf 

Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=dcd5aa4f-53cb-4023-8482-8ef825992f09-

a3f8d89ec0bfb815 

Size: ~ 3 MByte, Download available until: 9/18/2022 

  

Passwords will be sent in a separate email. 

  

  

Thank you.  

  

Best regards, 

  

  

   Shanti. R 

   Claims Service  

   Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 

   79 Robinson Road #09-01 I Singapore 068897 

   Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg 

  

    

 

  

  

    This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /   

    or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of  
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    this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.    

    Thank you. 

  

 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 

  

  

From: Maya N <vmo1@bigfoot.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, September 12, 2022 7:14 PM 
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Cc: Roslee Puasa <roslee@bigfoot.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXT] Re: Invite for PRS of Vehicle No. YM7103B; ACCIDENT INVOLVING YM7103B and YM7126K on 
05/09/2022 ALONG AYE NEAR CLEMENTI AVE 6 EXIT 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

We are agreeable to using LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd. 

  

Thank you. 

  

On Mon, Sep 12, 2022 at 4:42 PM Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> wrote: 

Internal 

  

Your ref:   YM7103B 
Our ref: 2022 22006675KC-YM7126K 
  
  
 Dear Sirs  
  
Enclosed is the list of surveyors for your consideration for Single Joint Expert (SJE):- 
  
AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd 
A-PAC Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd 
Form Team  Consultancy  Pte Ltd  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd    
  
 Please let us know who you are agreeable to appoint from the list. 
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Best regards, 
  
Shanti.R 
Claims Service 
Claims & Performance Management 
  
Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte.Ltd. | UEN 201903913C  
79 Robinson Road #09-01 Singapore 068897  
Phone: +65 63958973 | www.allianz.sg 
  
   
  
  

 
  
  
  
Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may 
contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, 
use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please 
delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 
  
Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 

  

  

From: Maya N <vmo1@bigfoot.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, September 12, 2022 2:00 PM 
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Cc: Roslee Puasa <roslee@bigfoot.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXT] Invite for PRS of Vehicle No. YM7103B; ACCIDENT INVOLVING YM7103B and YM7126K on 05/09/2022 
ALONG AYE NEAR CLEMENTI AVE 6 EXIT 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

We refer to the above-mentioned subject matter and our GIA report is attached herewith for your attention. 

  

We invite your in-house surveyor to conduct the pre-repair survey on our vehicle YM7103B at the location below: 

  

8, Joo Koon Road 

Singapore 628972 
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Kindly let us know the date and time for the PRS. 

  

   
Survey Type 

(Please indicate New or Resurvey) 

 

NEW  

 

Vehicle to be surveyed :  YM7103B  

Allianz Insured Vehicle :  YM7126K  

Date of Accident :  05/09/2022   

Date of Survey :   TBA  

Name of Workshop :  BIG-FOOT ENGINEERING 
PTE LTD  

 

Address of Survey Location :  8, JOO KOON ROAD, S 
(628972)  

 

Name of Contact Person :   MR. ROSLEE PUASA / MS 
MAYA  

 

Contact Number :  97481150/ 63505050   

Any Undercarriage involved : 

(Please indicate Yes or No)           NO 

   

  

  

Thank you. 

  

  

--  

 


