Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: admin@ltm.sg

Sent: Tuesday, 18 October 2022 5:10 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: ‘Mandy Lim'; 'venus'; Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Checking Liability - Our Client : GX 7688 K Your Insured :SLJ 1342 LD.O.A :

10.9.2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22008980/pa3

Categories: HMK

Hi Mei Kwan,

Client had revert to OD claim already.
Regards,

Quek Zixiang

Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd

www. LTM.sg

+65 6452 0893 (Office)
+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile)

Like us in Facebook!!

www.facebook.com/LTMsg
www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore
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From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, October 18, 2022 5:02 PM

To: admin@Itm.sg

Cc: 'Mandy Lim' <Mandy@ltm.sg>; 'venus' <venus@Itm.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Checking Liability - Our Client : GX 7688 K Your Insured :SLJ 1342 L D.O.A : 10.9.2022 *** LKK REF:
CC4/A1522008980/pa3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise whether your client still would like to pursue with TP claim.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 September 2022 1:57 PM

To: admin@ltm.sg

Cc: 'Mandy Lim' <Mandy@ltm.sg>; 'venus' <venus@ltm.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Checking Liability - Our Client : GX 7688 K Your Insured :SLJ 1342 L. D.O.A : 10.9.2022 ***
LKK REF: CC4/A1S22008980/pa3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Please be informed that liability is unclear as our driver reported that traffic light was green in his favour. We
would like to request for police investigation result for further review.

You may advise your client to claim OD if necessary.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from
this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: admin@ltm.sg <admin@Itm.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 September 2022 4:25 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@]lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Mandy Lim' <Mandy@Itm.sg>; 'venus' <venus@ltm.sg>

Subject: RE: Checking Liability - Our Client : GX 7688 K Your Insured :SLJ 1342 L. D.O.A : 10.9.2022 ***
LKK REF: CC4/A1S22008980/pa3

Hi Hsiao Tong,

To add on to my earlier email, pls see attached evidence of scene photos.
Regards,

Quek Zixiang

Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd

www. LTM.sg

+65 6452 0893 (Office)
+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile)

Like us in Facebook!!
www.facebook.com/LTMsg
www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore
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From: admin@]ltm.sg [mailto:admin@Itm.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, September 13, 2022 3:54 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Mandy Lim' <Mandy@Itm.sg>; 'venus' <venus@ltm.sg>

Subject: FW: Checking Liability - Our Client : GX 7688 K Your Insured :SLJ 1342 L D.O.A : 10.9.2022 ***
LKK REF: CC4/A1S22008980/pa3

Without Prejudice

Hi Hsiao Tong,

We are assisting our mutual client the vehicle owner of GX 7688 K to submit a claim against your insured, :SLJ 1342 L
which we understand that you are insurer at the material time of the accident.

We now enclosed the following documents for your easy reference.
- Our mutual client GIA report.

Please advised on the liability urgently.

Regards,

Quek Zixiang

Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd

www. LTM.sg

+65 6452 0893 (Office)
+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile)

Like us in Facebook!!
www.facebook.com/LTMsg




www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore
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From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, September 13, 2022 3:31 PM

To: admin@ltm.sg; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Mandy' <mandy@ltm.sg>; venus@ltm.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Checking Liability - Our Client : GX 7688 K Your Insured :SLJ 1342 L D.O.A : 10.9.2022 ***
LKK REF: CC4/AIS22008980/pa3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI's sketch plan and statement.

- :G,-,(‘_?{\E'EBL




CIRCUMSTANCES OF ACCIDENT

| TOOK THIS PAX BOOKING REFERENCE NO RB191620-7271919 (GOJEK) MAME MISS PATSY CONTACT NUMBER: SR
FROM TAXI STAND 109, BEDOK NORTH TO 10 SENGAKANG SQUARE, PICK UP @ 0505AM AND PROCEED TO THE
DESTONATION. | WAS TRAVELLING TOWARDS SENGKANG EAST MEAR SHELL STATION AND | TOOK OM THE RIGHT LANE
A5 | AM TURNING TO SENGLANG SQUARE, THE TRAFFIC LIGHT WAS GREEN AND | GAVE SIGNAL, THE ROAD IS CLEAR
BEFORE TURNIMNG SUDDEMLY A VAN VEHICLE NUMBER GX7688K HIT THE LEFT SIDE OF THE CAR AS | ALMOST COMPLETE
MY TURNING, PROBABLY THE VAN DID NOT SWITCH THE LIGHT WHILE CROSSING THE JUNCTION QR IT COULD THE RED
LIGHT ON THE OTHER SIDE OF THE ROAD, BOTH OF US WERE SHOCKED AND | ATTENDED TO THE PAX AND AS IF SHE
HAD ANY INJURY, HER HEAD WAS GIDDY AND HER LEFT LEG MINOR ABRASSION, THE AMBULANCE ARRIVED AND TOOK
HER TO THE NEAREST HOSPITAL. | HAD A MINOR ABRASION ON MY FINGER AND ELBOW. GOJEK DEPARTMENT WERE
INFORM IMMEDIATELY V1A EMAIL THRU THE APP

Please provide us the following.
e evidence i.e. video and scene photo
e Police investigation result (if any)

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: admin@ltm.sg <admin@Itm.sg>

Sent: Monday, September 12, 2022 11:11 AM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: 'Mandy Lim' <Mandy@Itm.sg>; 'venus' <venus@ltm.sg>

Subject: [EXT] Checking Liability - Our Client : GX 7688 K Your Insured :SLJ 1342 L D.O.A : 10.9.2022

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We are assisting our client, GX 7688 K to file a claim against your insured, SLJ 1342 L in connection to the
above accident.

We hereby now enclosed the GIA report for your necessary action.
Please advised liability before we arrange survey as instructed by our client.
Please advise OIC as well

Thank you and regards,



Regards,

Quek Zixiang

Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd
www. LTM.sg

+65 6452 0893 (Office)
+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile)

Like us in Facebook!!

www.facebook.com/LTMsg
www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore
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