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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Kaitlyn Chio <kaitlyn.chio@ow.sg>
Sent: Monday, 12 December 2022 9:21 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Victor Seng; Ary Chua; Adeline Lim; Ling Ting An; Ngai Kar Kit; Mohamed Nashik; 

Admin A; Joseph Low
Subject: RE: (ACCEPT OFFER) LOD - TP DS claim PRI - SLR962L CLAIMING AGAINST 

SMN9496R (ALLIANZ), DOA: 09/09/2022
Attachments: SLR962L LOA.pdf; OPTIMA WERKZ DIRECT CREDIT.pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Enclosed LOA and our bank details for your perusal. 
Kindly proceed the payment to us. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Kaitlyn Chio (Ms.) 
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department 
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 
 

 
www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 
 
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any 
purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content 
immediately after which.  

 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Sunday, 11 December 2022 4:02 pm 
To: Kaitlyn Chio <kaitlyn.chio@ow.sg> 
Cc: Victor Seng <victor.seng@ow.sg>; Ary Chua <ary.chua@ow.sg>; Adeline Lim <adeline@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An 
<tingan.ling@ow.sg>; Ngai Kar Kit <karkit.ngai@ow.sg>; Mohamed Nashik <mohamed.nashik@ow.sg>; Admin A 
<admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Joseph Low <joseph@ow.sg> 
Subject: Re: (ACCEPT OFFER) LOD - TP DS claim PRI - SLR962L CLAIMING AGAINST SMN9496R (ALLIANZ), DOA: 
09/09/2022 
 
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’  
  SAVE AS TO COSTS  
   
Dear Sirs  
   
Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at S$17,014.50 (all in) in full 
and final settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their 
insured arising out of this incident.  
   
If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of the Letter of Authorization / 
Warrant to Act  and your Bank details for us to process payment.   
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Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of 
liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore 
and/or our insured as a result of the accident on 09 SEPT 2022.  
   
Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or 
payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability.  
   
Thank you.  

 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: - 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Kaitlyn Chio <kaitlyn.chio@ow.sg> 
Sent: Tuesday, 6 December 2022 9:40 am 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Victor Seng <victor.seng@ow.sg>; Ary Chua <ary.chua@ow.sg>; Adeline Lim <adeline@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An 
<tingan.ling@ow.sg>; Ngai Kar Kit <karkit.ngai@ow.sg>; Mohamed Nashik <mohamed.nashik@ow.sg>; Admin A 
<admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Joseph Low <joseph@ow.sg> 
Subject: RE: (ACCEPT OFFER) LOD - TP DS claim PRI - SLR962L CLAIMING AGAINST SMN9496R (ALLIANZ), DOA: 
09/09/2022  
  
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
  
We accept your offer at $17,014.50/- 
Kindly let us have your DV 
  
Thank you. 
  
Best Regards, 
  
Kaitlyn Chio (Ms.) 
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department 
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 
  

 
www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 
  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any 
purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content 
immediately after which.  
  

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 5 December 2022 12:08 pm 
To: Joseph Low <joseph@ow.sg> 
Cc: Kaitlyn Chio <kaitlyn.chio@ow.sg>; Victor Seng <victor.seng@ow.sg>; Ary Chua <ary.chua@ow.sg>; Adeline Lim 
<adeline@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An <tingan.ling@ow.sg>; Ngai Kar Kit <karkit.ngai@ow.sg>; Mohamed Nashik 
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<mohamed.nashik@ow.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: LOD - TP DS claim PRI - SLR962L CLAIMING AGAINST SMN9496R (ALLIANZ), DOA: 09/09/2022 
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We propose settlement as follows: - 
  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 15,782.50 
2. Loss of Use (14days x $80.00) $   1,120.00 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $          2.00 
4.  Towing Fee $      110.00 

Total $ 17,014.50 
  
Please confirm acceptance. 
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

From: Joseph Low <joseph@ow.sg>  
Sent: Saturday, 29 October 2022 2:40 PM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) 
<Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Kaitlyn Chio <kaitlyn.chio@ow.sg>; Victor Seng <victor.seng@ow.sg>; Ary Chua <ary.chua@ow.sg>; Adeline Lim 
<adeline@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An <tingan.ling@ow.sg>; Ngai Kar Kit <karkit.ngai@ow.sg>; Mohamed Nashik 
<mohamed.nashik@ow.sg> 
Subject: LOD - TP DS claim PRI - SLR962L CLAIMING AGAINST SMN9496R (ALLIANZ), DOA: 09/09/2022 
  
Our Ref: SLR962L / TP#1757 
Your Ref: SMN9496R 
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Motor Claim Department, 
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We refer to the above mentioned accident. 
  
We are claiming as below: 
  
- Cost of Repair (incl. of GST)                       S$ 15,782.50    
- Loss of Use                                                   S$   1,920.00 ($120.00 x 16 Days) 
- Towing Fee                                                   S$      110.00 
- GIA/LTA Search Fees                                   S$         2.00    
  
Grand Total                                                   S$ 17,814.50 
                                                                       ============      
  
Your prompt attention is most grateful and look forward to your speedy settlement. 
  
  
Thank you. 
  
Best Regards, 
  
  
Joseph Low (Mr.) 
Motor Claim Officer 
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 
  

 
www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 
  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any 
purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person.  
Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content immediately after which. 
  

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: 20 September 2022 16:29 
To: Kaitlyn Chio <kaitlyn.chio@ow.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) 
<Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: CHECK LIABILITY - TP DS claim PRI - SLR962L CLAIMING AGAINST SMN9496R (ALLIANZ), DOA: 
09/09/2022 
  
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
  
Hi Sir/Mdm,   
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under 
BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement)  and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned 
case. 
  
Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to 
your client’s vehicle.  
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The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the 
days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor. 
  
In order to expedite the claim process, please forward all relevant documents to us (LKK) to proceed on negotiate 
settlement. 
  
•             Please do not send the LOD to our principal for direct settlement. 
  
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 6051 
  
Thank You.  
  
Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  

From: Kaitlyn Chio <kaitlyn.chio@ow.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 20 September 2022 09:46 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) 
<Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: CHECK LIABILITY - TP DS claim PRI - SLR962L CLAIMING AGAINST SMN9496R (ALLIANZ), DOA: 
09/09/2022 
Importance: High 
  
Dear Asher, 
  
Any updates on the liability for this case ? 
  
Thank you. 
  
Best Regards, 
  
Kaitlyn Chio (Ms.) 
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department 
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 
  

 
www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 
  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any 
purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content 
immediately after which.  
  

From: Kaitlyn Chio  
Sent: 19 September 2022 09:01 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Admin A 
<admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: CHECK LIABILITY - TP DS claim PRI - SLR962L CLAIMING AGAINST SMN9496R (ALLIANZ), DOA: 
09/09/2022 
Importance: High 
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Dear Asher, 
  
Any updates on the liability for this case ? 
  
  
Thank you. 
  
Best Regards, 
  
Kaitlyn Chio (Ms.) 
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department 
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 
  

 
www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 
  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any 
purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content 
immediately after which.  
  

From: Kaitlyn Chio  
Sent: 16 September 2022 09:21 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: CHECK LIABILITY - TP DS claim PRI - SLR962L CLAIMING AGAINST SMN9496R (ALLIANZ), DOA: 
09/09/2022 
Importance: High 
  
Dear Asher, 
  
Any updates on the liability for this case ? 
  
Thank you. 
  
Best Regards, 
  
Kaitlyn Chio (Ms.) 
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department 
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 
  

 
www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 
  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any 
purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content 
immediately after which.  
  

From: Kaitlyn Chio  
Sent: 14 September 2022 11:54 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: CHECK LIABILITY - TP DS claim PRI - SLR962L CLAIMING AGAINST SMN9496R (ALLIANZ), DOA: 
09/09/2022 
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Dear Asher, 
  
Enclosed marked estimate and scene photos for your perusal. 
Vehicle was surveyed by Kenneth today. 
Has your insured reported ? 
Would like to check on the liability for this case. 
  
  
Thank you. 
  
Best Regards, 
  
Kaitlyn Chio (Ms.) 
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department 
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 
  

 
www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 
  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any 
purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content 
immediately after which.  
  

From: Kaitlyn Chio  
Sent: 13 September 2022 10:35 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Summer Lee (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) 
<AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: CHECK LIABILITY - TP DS claim PRI - SLR962L CLAIMING AGAINST SMN9496R (ALLIANZ), DOA: 
09/09/2022 
  
Dear LKK, 
  
Enclosed marked estimate and scene photos for your perusal. 
Vehicle was surveyed by Kenneth today. 
Has your insured reported ? 
Would like to check on the liability for this case. 
  
Thank you. 
  
Best Regards, 
  
Kaitlyn Chio (Ms.) 
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department 
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 
  

 
www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 
  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any 
purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content 
immediately after which.  
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From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>  
Sent: 13 September 2022 10:04 
To: Yan (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; admin-a@lkkauto.com 
Cc: Kaitlyn Chio <kaitlyn.chio@ow.sg> 
Subject: TP DS claim PRI - SLR962L CLAIMING AGAINST SMN9496R (ALLIANZ), DOA: 09/09/2022 
  

Internal 

  

Your ref:  SLR962L 

Our ref: 2022 22006663KC-SMN9496R 

  

  

Dear Sirs,  

  

We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners  LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  to conduct survey. 

  

Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.  

  

Please download the documents from this link below (For Survey) 

File: SMN9496R OI.pdf, SLR962L(TP).pdf 

Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=c4292421-206e-4a9f-a647-560c5f16acae-

c4d6efd9617c7b19 

Size: ~ 2 MByte, Download available until: 9/18/2022 

  

Passwords will be sent in a separate email. 

  

  

Thank you.  

  

Best regards, 
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   Shanti. R 

   Claims Service  

   Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 

   79 Robinson Road #09-01 I Singapore 068897 

   Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg 

  

    

 

  

  

    This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /   

    or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of  

    this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.    

    Thank you. 

  

 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 

  
  

From: Kaitlyn Chio <kaitlyn.chio@ow.sg>  
Sent: Monday, September 12, 2022 5:26 PM 
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXT] RE: PRI - SLR962L CLAIMING AGAINST SMN9496R (ALLIANZ), DOA: 09/09/2022 
  

Internal 

  
Dear Motor Claims Department, 
  
We appointed LKK Auto Consultants. 
  
Thank you. 
  
Best Regards, 
  
Kaitlyn Chio (Ms.) 
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department 
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 
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www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 
  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any 
purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content 
immediately after which.  
  

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>  
Sent: 12 September 2022 17:24 
To: Kaitlyn Chio <kaitlyn.chio@ow.sg> 
Subject: FW: PRI - SLR962L CLAIMING AGAINST SMN9496R (ALLIANZ), DOA: 09/09/2022 
  

Internal 

  

Your ref:  SLR962L 

Our ref: 2022 22006663KC-SMN9496R 

  

  

 Dear Sirs  

  

Enclosed is the list of surveyors for your consideration for Single Joint Expert (SJE):- 

  

AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd 

A-PAC Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd 

Form Team  Consultancy  Pte Ltd  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd    

  

 Please let us know who you are agreeable to appoint from the list. 

  

  

Best regards, 

  

Shanti.R 

Claims Service 
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Claims & Performance Management 

  

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte.Ltd. | UEN 201903913C  

79 Robinson Road #09-01 Singapore 068897  

Phone: +65 63958973 | www.allianz.sg 

  

   

  

  

 

  

  

  

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may 
contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, 
use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please 
delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 

  

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 

  
  

From: Kaitlyn Chio <kaitlyn.chio@ow.sg>  
Sent: Monday, September 12, 2022 2:13 PM 
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Cc: Ary Chua <ary.chua@ow.sg>; Joseph Low <joseph@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An <tingan.ling@ow.sg>; Mohamed Nashik 
<mohamed.nashik@ow.sg>; Ngai Kar Kit <karkit.ngai@ow.sg>; Victor Seng <victor.seng@ow.sg> 
Subject: [EXT] PRI - SLR962L CLAIMING AGAINST SMN9496R (ALLIANZ), DOA: 09/09/2022 
  
Dear Motor Claims Department, 
  
Kindly arrange PRI at 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A #01-05 AMK Autopoint S568047. 
  
Thank you. 
  
Best Regards, 
  
Kaitlyn Chio (Ms.) 
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department 
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 
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www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 
  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any 
purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content 
immediately after which.  
  





12/13/22, 9:07 AM Merimen e-Claims

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_viewhistory&caseid=1136549&extid=395077&CFID=10… 1/2

 

Claim Audit

 

  AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
13 Sep
2022
11:50

Clm Dtl Modified Claimant's Name: -> KINETIC HOLDINGS PTE LTD. Claimant's ID: -> 201618392N. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

2
13 Sep
2022
11:50

Clm Veh Model
Changed (206158) TOYOTA PRIUS HYBRID 1.8 S CVT (A). [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

3
13 Sep
2022
11:50

Clm Created
Reg No: SLR962L. Acct Date: 2022/09/09. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: Allianz Insurance Singapor
e Pte. Ltd. (HQ). TP Insurer: China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ). Workshop: O
ptima Werkz Pte Ltd (HQ)

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

4
13 Sep
2022
11:50

Adj Co Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

5
13 Sep
2022
11:50

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/09/22 [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

6
13 Sep
2022
11:50

Adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

7
13 Sep
2022
11:50

Adj Adjuster
Assigned [None] -> KENNETH KONG [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

8
13 Sep
2022
12:07

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

9
05 Nov
2022
09:25

Adj Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:17494.50:Liability: 100%. B:28 5 VEH CC OID 4TH VEH. We seek your mandate at $1
7,494.50(ALL-IN). Kindly let us have your approval/instruction.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

10
23 Nov
2022
14:44

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Faiz Rosli

11
23 Nov
2022
14:46

Adj Next Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/09/22. Mandate Remarks: Chain Collision - MCF - Proceed
w Offer [I] Faiz Rosli

12
23 Nov
2022
14:46

Adj Mandate Set Approved:17494.50:Chain Collision - MCF - Proceed w Offer [I] Faiz Rosli

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go

ACTIVITY
No record

Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2842475 13 Sep 2022
11:50:33

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

SLR962L xx.xx

2842486 13 Sep 2022
12:06:59 Video Upload Motor

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

SLR962L HOW MEI
KWAN xx.xx

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=101987940&CFTOKEN=30147be0636403ca-5784B820-D297-EBE9-C6D1C71CD8EF7CA8&USID=3251&RID=9625650
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=101987940&CFTOKEN=30147be0636403ca-5784B820-D297-EBE9-C6D1C71CD8EF7CA8&USID=3251&RID=9625650
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=101987940&CFTOKEN=30147be0636403ca-5784B820-D297-EBE9-C6D1C71CD8EF7CA8&USID=3251&RID=9625650
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=101987940&CFTOKEN=30147be0636403ca-5784B820-D297-EBE9-C6D1C71CD8EF7CA8&USID=3251&RID=9625650&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D1136549%26extid%3D395077%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=101987940&CFTOKEN=30147be0636403ca-5784B820-D297-EBE9-C6D1C71CD8EF7CA8&USID=3251&RID=9625650
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