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Re: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 8197 S & GBD 174 L ON 5 SEPTEMBER 2022 *** LKK REF:
CC4/LPC22008956/Upa3

2ND AUTO <accident.2ndauto@gmail.com>
Sat 15/10/2022 9:51 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>;Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

5 attachments (1 MB)
SKV8197S_RepairInvoice.pdf; SKV8197S_MarkedEstimate.pdf; SKV8197S_LTASearch.pdf; SKV8197S_RentalInvoice_Agreement.pdf; SKV8197S_GIA.pdf;

Your Ref: CC4/LPC22008956/Upa3
Our Ref: SKV 8197 S

15 Oct 2022

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD                                                 
300 Beach Road                                                                      
#17-04/06                                                                              
The Concourse                                                                        
Singapore 199555  

PROPERTY CLAIM (WITHOUT PREJUDICE TO: Any Personal Injury Claims)

Via Email

Attn: LKK, Ms Chew Hsiao Tong

Dear Sir/Mdm,

LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 8197 S & GBD 174 L ON 5 SEPTEMBER 2022

Thank you for responding to our call for Pre-Repair Inspection and your subsequent correspondences with us regarding the above-mentioned accident.

We are pleased to inform that we are agreeable to SJE proposed lump sum repair for our client's vehicle SKV 8197 S.  As such, kindly find below a
breakdown of the total demand amount:

Cost of Repair:         $   4,800.00 (as agreed with SJE)
Loss of Rental:         $    1,500.00
LTA search fee:          $          7.45

Total:                $   6,307.45

Please also find attached the GIA report (from our client), marked estimate (as agreed with SJE), replacement vehicle rental invoice, LTA search receipt and
our repair invoice.

We look forward to receiving your Discharge Voucher and hearing from you soonest.

Thank you.

Regards,
Mr Loo
96220160
2ND Auto Pte Ltd
37A Everitt Road Singapore 428586


accident.2ndauto@gmail.com

On Fri, Oct 7, 2022 at 4:40 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:


Without Prejudice

 

Dear Sirs,

 

Please submit LOD and relevant claim documents for our necessary action.

 

Thank you.

 

 

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties
resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.
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In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is
not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

 

 

 

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 

 

From: 2ND AUTO <accident.2ndauto@gmail.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, 14 September 2022 12:50 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 8197 S & GBD 174 L ON 5 SEPTEMBER 2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC22008956/Upa3

 

Hi,

 

Attached is the accident report and scene photos/videos.

 

Thank you

Mr Ng

98370300

2ND Auto Pte Ltd

accident.2ndauto@gmail.com

 

Get Outlook for Android

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September 13, 2022 6:21:16 PM

To: accident.2ndauto@gmail.com <accident.2ndauto@gmail.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 8197 S & GBD 174 L ON 5 SEPTEMBER 2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC22008956/Upa3

 

Dear Sir / Madam,

 

We refer to the above matter.

 

Please provide us the following.

evidence i.e. video and scene photo (if any)
PIR result (if any)
GIA / police report
Estimated cost of repair

 

Our respective case handler, Hsiao Tong will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
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To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

 

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: 2ND AUTO <accident.2ndauto@gmail.com> 

Sent: Thursday, 8 September 2022 7:16 pm

To: Customer SG <customer_sg@lonpac.com>

Subject: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 8197 S & GBD 174 L ON 5 SEPTEMBER 2022

 

2ND AUTO <accident.2ndauto@gmail.com>

to motor_claims

Your Ref:                             

Our Ref: SKV 8197 S                    
                              

8 September 2022



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD                                                PROPERTY CLAIM 
300 Beach Road                                                                      (WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
#17-04/06                                                                              TO: Any Personal Injury 
The Concourse                                                                        Claims) 
Singapore 199555
 

Attn: Claims Department                                                           Via Email                             
                              
Dear Sir/Mdm,



                               
NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 8197 S & GBD 174 L ON 05 SEPTEMBER 2022                             
                              
We are instructed to notify you of a road traffic accident on 05 SEPTEMBER 2022 at about 1900H at KJE TOWARDS BKE(SLE) BAHRU involving our client's
vehicle registration number SKV 8197 S and vehicle registration number GBD 174 L driven by your insured at the material time.                             
                              
As a result of the accident, our client's vehicle has been damaged.  Before our client/we proceed to repair the damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working
days of your receipt of this notice and your proposed list of 10 recommended motor surveyors for our appointment.                             
                              
Kindly note that if we do not hear from you by 12 SEPTEMBER (Monday), 1300H, we will be forwarding our proposed list of 10 motor surveyors for your
appointment, in accordance with the new regulations.                             
                             
Our client's damaged vehicle is at 15 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #01-05/53 Bartley Biz Centre Singapore 417808                            
                     
Please reply via email. Our email address is accident.2ndauto@gmail.com                       
                              
Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.                             


                             
Regards,
 
Mr Ng
98370300                            
2ND Auto Pte Ltd
accudent.2ndauto@gmail.com
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ReplyForward

 

 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt practices.

 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt practices.


