10/29/22, 10:48 AM Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 8197 S & GBD 174 L ON 5 SEPTEMBER 2022 *** LKK REF:
CC4/LPC22008956/Upa3

2ND AUTO <accident.2ndauto@gmail.com>

Sat 15/10/2022 9:51 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>;Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com>

[ﬂJ 5 attachments (1 MB)
SKV8197S_Repairlnvoice.pdf; SKV8197S_MarkedEstimate.pdf; SKV8197S_LTASearch.pdf; SKV8197S_Rentallnvoice_Agreement.pdf; SKV8197S_GIA.pdf;

Your Ref: CC4/LPC22008956/Upa3
Our Ref: SKV 8197 S

15 Oct 2022

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
300 Beach Road

#17-04/06

The Concourse

Singapore 199555

PROPERTY CLAIM (WITHOUT PREJUDICE TO: Any Personal Injury Claims)
Via Email

Attn: LKK, Ms Chew Hsiao Tong

Dear Sir/Mdm,

LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 8197 S & GBD 174 L ON 5 SEPTEMBER 2022

Thank you for responding to our call for Pre-Repair Inspection and your subsequent correspondences with us regarding the above-mentioned accident.

We are pleased to inform that we are agreeable to SJE proposed lump sum repair for our client's vehicle SKV 8197 S. As such, kindly find below a
breakdown of the total demand amount:

Cost of Repair: S 4,800.00 (as agreed with SJE)
Loss of Rental: $ 1,500.00

LTA search fee: S 7.45

Total: $ 6,307.45

Please also find attached the GIA report (from our client), marked estimate (as agreed with SJE), replacement vehicle rental invoice, LTA search receipt and
our repair invoice.

We look forward to receiving your Discharge Voucher and hearing from you soonest.

Thank you.

Regards,

Mr Loo

96220160

2ND Auto Pte Ltd

37A Everitt Road Singapore 428586

accident.2ndauto@gmail.com

On Fri, Oct 7, 2022 at 4:40 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs,

Please submit LOD and relevant claim documents for our necessary action.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of r

g the matter amicably without parties

resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, wi ver, should be d d / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.
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In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is

not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

From: 2ND AUTO <accident.2ndauto@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 September 2022 12:50 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 8197 S & GBD 174 L ON 5 SEPTEMBER 2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC22008956/Upa3

Hi,

Attached is the accident report and scene photos/videos.

Thank you

Mr Ng

98370300

2ND Auto Pte Ltd

accident.2ndauto@gmail.com

Get Outlook for Android

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September 13, 2022 6:21:16 PM

To: accident.2ndauto@gmail.com <accident.2ndauto@gmail.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 8197 S & GBD 174 L ON 5 SEPTEMBER 2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC22008956/Upa3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please provide us the following.

¢ evidence i.e. video and scene photo (if any)
o PIR result (if any)

® GIA / police report

o Estimated cost of repair

Our respective case handler, Hsiao Tong will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
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To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
From: 2ND AUTO <accident.2ndauto@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 8 September 2022 7:16 pm

To: Customer SG <customer_sg@lonpac.com>
Subject: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 8197 S & GBD 174 L ON 5 SEPTEMBER 2022

L]

2ND AUTO <accident.2ndauto@gmail.com>

to motor_claimsl]

Your Ref:

Our Ref: SKV 8197 S

8 September 2022

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD PROPERTY CLAIM
300 Beach Road (WITHOUT PREJUDICE
#17-04/06 TO: Any Personal Injury
The Concourse Claims)

Singapore 199555
Attn: Claims Department Via Email

Dear Sir/Mdm,

NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 8197 S & GBD 174 L ON 05 SEPTEMBER 2022

We are instructed to notify you of a road traffic accident on 05 SEPTEMBER 2022 at about 1900H at KJE TOWARDS BKE(SLE) BAHRU involving our client's
vehicle registration number SKV 8197 S and vehicle registration number GBD 174 L driven by your insured at the material time.

As a result of the accident, our client's vehicle has been damaged. Before our client/we proceed to repair the damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working
days of your receipt of this notice and your proposed list of 10 recommended motor surveyors for our appointment.

Kindly note that if we do not hear from you by 12 SEPTEMBER (Monday), 1300H, we will be forwarding our proposed list of 10 motor surveyors for your
appointment, in accordance with the new regulations.

Our client's damaged vehicle is at 15 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #01-05/53 Bartley Biz Centre Singapore 417808
Please reply via email. Our email address is accident.2ndauto@gmail.com

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,

Mr Ng

98370300

2ND Auto Pte Ltd
accudent.2ndauto@gmail.com
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ReplyForward

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt practices.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt practices.
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T F UNDERTAKING RISATI

To: 2ND AUTO PTE LTD WITHOUT PREJUDICE
37A Everitt Road TO: ANY PERSONAL INJURY
Singapore 428586 CLAIMS

In the matter of an accident involving vehicles_SKVg103S and GBDIH4L ON &

SEPTEMBER 2002 AT YJE TowARDS SCE(SLE)

1/We BU FU YAN TESSICA _the owner of vehicle registration no. Skvg€I03S
hereby do authorize you to commence repairs to my abovementioned vehicle.

I/We confirm that you are hereby authorized to handle the repairs of my vehicle and/or to
negotiate and settle any claims relating to the above accident which I/we may have against the
third party/parties or insurers and/or to instruct lawyers on my/our behalf to facilitate the third
party claim for me/us.

You are hereby authorized as my attorney to execute and/or sign any documents/discharge
vouchers/discharge agreement regarding my/our claim for my convenience.

In the event that [/we am/are required to attend at my/our solicitors’ office or to attend court in
connection with my/our claim, I/we shall render full co-operation.

I confirm that in the event of an unsuccessful claim against the negligent party and/or my own
insurer for the damages caused to my vehicle, I agree to pay all repair cost, survey fee and any
incidental expenses incurred by you or to lodge an own damage claim (only for comprehensive
cover) to cover the expenses incurred.

1 undertake not to independently make negotiate or settle any claim in respect of the above
accident without first giving you 7 days notice in writing and upon so doing, I further undertake
to pay to you immediately your administrative charges for work done and time expended in
managing my claim herein. For the purpose of clarification, the aforesaid administrative charges
shall not include any work done or sum expended towards repairs to my said vehicle and in the
event that repair work/s has commenced before the giving of the above notice, 1 hereby undertake
to pay to you the full sum of the costs of repairs as shall be recommended by a licensed surveyor.

Da 12 day of Sept 22

Ry 2
Owneﬁsiﬁu;B)\\ Witness (signatire)

gu FUL TESSICA Mgus NG
Owner (name) Witness (name)
. S7bb3eRAG SAU 6B

NRIC No. NRIC No.



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO :22/22/22/VC05/026261
DATE : 17 NOV 2022

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/'We, BU YU FAN JESSICA confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or owner of GBD174L the sum of Singapore Dollar Five
Thousand Three Hundred Only ($5,300.00) in full and final satisfaction, liquidation
and discharge of all property losses competent to me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses sustained by me/us whether now
or hereafter to become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from an accident
involving SKV8197S and GBD174L on 05/09/2022 along/at KJIE TWDS BKE (SLE).

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD/ LYC HARDWARE & ENGINEERING PTE LTD AND/OR SEDHU
MANI) against all claims and any claims whatsoever made by any person/persons on
our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to “2ND AUTO
PTE LTD”.

I/We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

17/11/2022

Signature of vehicle owner/Date

BU YU FAN JESSICA 17/11/2022

Name of vehicle owner /Date



2 N D A UTO PTE LTD Co. Reg. No.: 201929696G

37A Everitt Road Singapore 428586

BU YU FAN JESSICA INVOICE NO: 2A/22/015
DATE: 15/10/2022
VEHICLE NO.: SKV 8197 S

MAKE : MERCEDES BENZ ENGINE NO. : 27091031705460
MODEL : GLA180 URBAN (R18 LED) CHASSIS NO. - WDC15694221535469
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT

Total lump sum repair including supply of parts and labour

Adjusted total lump sum repair costs S$ 4,800.00
Total amount payable S$ 4,800.00
0P
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8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #01-47 Premier@Kaki Bukit $415875
68444640(0)  62425185(F)

Email: ckwong@mcwellventures.com
Co.Reg.No.53236451A

Name: BU YU FAN JESSICA linvoice No. 20221241

|Veh No: mxnwwhmm Model: wms,?. 520i |Date:  14.09.2022

~CAR RENTAL 08/09/2022 - 14/09/2022 (6 o><mv 3 1,500.00 |

1,500.00

Omgm EX FOHNYG n,amﬂoqsma Signature:

Cheque Should Be Crossed And Made Payment to: Mv Auto Bank: OCBC Account No. 712-773696-001
Paynow: 53236451A001
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Land Transport Authority

Land Transport Authority

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2
Print Date/Time : 06 Sep 2022 / 17:45:59
Receipt Date/Time : 06 Sep 2022/ 17:45:34

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-220906-003263

Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST (S9) (S%) (S%)

Result of Insurance Enquiry - GBD174L
As at 05 Sep 2022/19:00:00
Insurance Co: LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

1 Insurance Enquiry - GBD174L

Enquiry Fee 7.00 0.49 7.49
20220906174449603020
Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payable 7.45
Paid By
Direct Debit: eNETS
20220906174459157 7.45
Debit (Internet Banking)
Total 7.45
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amount 7.45
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD (SINGAPORE BRANCH)

GIRO AUTHORISATION FORM

Company Name: 9ND AuTD PTE LTD

Bank Account Details

aND AUTD PTE LTD
MAYBANK. SINGAPORE LIMITED

Beneficiary Name:

Bank Name / Branch Name:

Bank Account No.: QUO5)1086560
Bank Code / Branch Code: 3209 | 005
Swift Code M@BESL3Q

accident. andouto @gpranl-com

Email Address:
(For notification of payment details)

Name/Designation/Telephone/Email of Contact person.:

ANGUS JADMIN [ 0R330200 | accident - Ondovio @omail com

I hereby authorise Lonpac Insurance Bhd to remit all payment directly to the above nominated account.

IE. .
( a ~
Autiorised Signature a)»QW Stamp

Date:

Acknowledged by :

Name / Date;

Powered by @ CamScanner
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 25 November 2022 9:30 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A

Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] - NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 8197 S &

GBD 174 L ON 5 SEPTEMBER 2022

Dear Sirs,
For an update, we have settled the matter at a global sum of $5,300.00(all-in) with third party.
We will proceed to close file and submit all the relevant documents to your good office once it is ready.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 31 October 2022 10:49 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] - NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 8197 S & GBD 174 LON 5
SEPTEMBER 2022

Lonpac External - General

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Please proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

1



We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Saturday, 29 October 2022 11:08 am

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: [SEEK MANDATE] - NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 8197 S & GBD 174 L ON 5 SEPTEMBER
2022

Your ref: 22/22/22/VC05/026261
Our ref : CC4/LPC22008956/Upa3q2

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD174L(LONPAC) AND SKV8197S(TP) ON 05/09/2022

We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 21/09/2022 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

It is a head-to-rear collision. We are of the view that liability is not in our driver’ favour.

We seek your approval to offer repairer “2ND AUTO PTE LTD” at $5,407.45(all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair $17,027.50 S 4,800.00
2. Loss of RENTAL (6days x $250.00) $ 1,500.00 S 600.00 (6DAYS X $100)
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee S 7.45 S 7.45
Total | $ 18,534.95 $5,407.45

Surveyor recommended 4days for repair + 1PRS + 1Sunday = 6days.
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 05/10/2022 is only for mandate purpose.

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: -

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 21 September 2022 3:37 pm

To: geraldpoh@lonpac.com <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FW: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 8197 S & GBD 174 L ON 5 SEPTEMBER 2022

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Enclosed for your perusal is: -

e Estimated cost of repair.
e Preliminary advice.
e Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 9 September 2022 1:31 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FW: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 8197 S & GBD 174 L ON 5 SEPTEMBER 2022

Dear Gerald,
Thank you for the assignment.

Repairer arrange on 12.9.22.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Friday, 9 September 2022 12:06 PM
To: 'assignments' <assignments@l|kkauto.com>




Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>
Subject: FW: FW: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 8197 S & GBD 174 L ON 5 SEPTEMBER 2022

Lonpac External - General

Our Ref: 22/22/22/VC05/026261
Dear Yan,

FYNA. Attached copy of insured report.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: 2ND AUTO <accident.2ndauto@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 9 September 2022 11:38 am

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Subject: Re: FW: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 8197 S & GBD 174 L ON 5 SEPTEMBER 2022

Hi,
We would like to appoint Marcus Chua - LKK.

Thank you,

Mr Ng

98370300

2ND Auto Pte Ltd
accident.2ndauto@gmail.com

On Fri, 9 Sept 2022, 10:02 GERALD POH WEE BIN, <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> wrote:

Lonpac External - General

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Our Ref 1 22/22/22/VC05/026261
Dear Sirs,

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle and append below our list
of Motor surveyors for your attention:-

Jackson Quek —Appraisal
Nicholas Tey -Appraisal
Steve Chen - LKK

Lim Teow Guan - LKK

ARlWN|[F




Marcus Chua - LKK
Kenneth Kong- LKK
Thevan Thomas- LKK
Mohd Taufik - LKK
Adrian Ling-LKK
Mohd Rasul - LKK

OO IN|O |

Please let us hear from you within the next 2 working days.

For future motor related enquiries, please email to mt claim@Ionpac.com.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: 2ND AUTO <accident.2ndauto@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 8 September 2022 7:16 pm

To: Customer SG <customer_sg@Ilonpac.com>

Subject: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 8197 S & GBD 174 L ON 5 SEPTEMBER 2022

2ND AUTO <accident.2ndauto@gmail.com>

to motor_claims

Your Ref:

Our Ref: SKV 8197 S

8 September 2022

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD PROPERTY CLAIM
300 Beach Road (WITHOUT PREJUDICE
#17-04/06 TO: Any Personal Injury
The Concourse Claims)

Singapore 199555

Attn: Claims Department Via Email



Dear Sir/Mdm,

NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 8197 S & GBD 174 L ON 05 SEPTEMBER
2022

We are instructed to notify you of a road traffic accident on 05 SEPTEMBER 2022 at about 1900H at KJE
TOWARDS BKE(SLE) BAHRU involving our client's vehicle registration number SKV 8197 S and vehicle
registration number GBD 174 L driven by your insured at the material time.

As a result of the accident, our client's vehicle has been damaged. Before our client/we proceed to repair the
damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice and your proposed
list of 10 recommended motor surveyors for our appointment.

Kindly note that if we do not hear from you by 12 SEPTEMBER (Monday), 1300H, we will be forwarding our
proposed list of 10 motor surveyors for your appointment, in accordance with the new
regulations.

Our client's damaged vehicle is at 15 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #01-05/53 Bartley Biz Centre Singapore
417808

Please reply via email. Our email address is accident.2ndauto@gmail.com

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,

Mr Ng
98370300
2ND Auto Pte Ltd

accudent.2ndauto@gmail.com

|RepIyForwa rdl




We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.





