Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 December 2022 2:48 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: Re: TP SND 5761S / SNM22D206430/C02/IRENE / DOA: 08/09/2022

Dear Huey Yon, please proceed to close this case. Thank you.
If anything we could assist, please feel free to let us know, thank you.

Best Regards

Yi Xin

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23,

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875
T: 63340858 | E: xinyunautol@gmail.com

On Tue, Dec 13, 2022 at 2:46 PM Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> wrote:

As spoken to you.

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of final fig $1,988.00 with 4 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,
Huey Yon | case handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315 email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933

From: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunautol@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 December 2022 2:40 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@|kkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: TP SND 5761S / SNM22D206430/C02/IRENE / DOA: 08/09/2022




Dear Huey Yon, can you please send me a fresh email and we will proceed close this case, thanks.

Best Regards
Yi Xin

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23,

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875
T: 63340858 | E: xinyunautol@gmail.com

On Tue, Dec 13, 2022 at 2:04 PM Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Yi Xin,

As per your requested.

Best Regards,
Huey Yon | case handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315 email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933

From: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunautol@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 December 2022 2:02 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: TP SND 5761S / SNM22D206430/C02/IRENE / DOA: 08/09/2022

Dear Huey Yon, thanks for your email, can i have your surveyor marking, thank you.

Best Regards



Yi Xin
Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23,

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875
T: 63340858 | E: xinyunautol@gmail.com

On Tue, Dec 13, 2022 at 1:38 PM Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Yi Xin,

Any updates?

Best Regards,
Huey Yon | case handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315 email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 December 2022 5:09 PM

To: xinyunautol @gmail.com

Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP SND 5761S / SNM22D206430/C02/IRENE / DOA: 08/09/2022

Dear Yi Xin,

Any updates?



Best Regards,
Huey Yon | case handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315 email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 5 December 2022 2:06 PM

To: xinyunautol @gmail.com

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP SND 5761S / SNM22D206430/C02/IRENE / DOA: 08/09/2022

Dear Yi Xin,

Without prejudice

As spoken to you.

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of final fig $1,988.00 with 4 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,
Huey Yon | case handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315 email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933



