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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 7 March 2023 10:52 AM
To: Siow Szelin
Cc: Jason; Admin A
Subject: RE: FASTECH REF: SMD 560A  DOA: 04.09.2022  YOUR REF: SMQ 9014H 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
Dear Sirs 
 
Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at S$4,680.00 (all in) in full and 
final settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their insured 
arising out of this incident.  
 
If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of your Bank details for us to process 
payment.   
 
Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of 
liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore 
and/or our insured as a result of the accident on 04 Sept 2022.  
 
Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or 
payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability. 
 
Thank you.  
 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Siow Szelin <szelin.siow@fastechauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, March 6, 2023 5:17 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: FASTECH REF: SMD 560A DOA: 04.09.2022 YOUR REF: SMQ 9014H  
 
Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Hsiao Tong, 
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We are pleases to accept your offer of S$ 4,680.00 (all-in) for my client’s vehicle property 

claim. 

 

Thank you 

 
 
Best Regards, 

Szelin 

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd 

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48 

Autobay Singapore 417883 

Tel: 6746 5405 

Fax: 6745 8520 

 
Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any 

personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/ claimant. 

 
 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, March 6, 2023 15:44 
To: Siow Szelin <szelin.siow@fastechauto.com.sg> 
Cc: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: FASTECH REF: SMD 560A DOA: 04.09.2022 YOUR REF: SMQ 9014H  
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
DEAR SIRS, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We propose settlement at a global sum of $4,680.00(all-in). 
  
Please confirm acceptance. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Siow Szelin <szelin.siow@fastechauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, February 16, 2023 11:36 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
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Cc: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: FASTECH REF: SMD 560A DOA: 04.09.2022 YOUR REF: SMQ 9014H  
 
Without Prejuice 

 

Dear Hsiao Tong, 

 

We are unable to accept your global sum, therefore we are counter proposing at global sum of 

S$ 5,000.00(all-in) for our client’s vehicle property claim. 

 

Thank you. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Szelin 

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd 

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48 

Autobay Singapore 417883 

Tel: 6746 5405 

Fax: 6745 8520 

 
Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any 

personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/ claimant. 

 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, February 16, 2023 11:00 
To: Siow Szelin <szelin.siow@fastechauto.com.sg> 
Cc: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: FASTECH REF: SMD 560A DOA: 04.09.2022 YOUR REF: SMQ 9014H  
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
DEAR SIRS, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We propose settlement at a global sum of $4,440.00(all-in). 
  
Please confirm acceptance. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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From: Siow Szelin <szelin.siow@fastechauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, October 14, 2022 2:30 PM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg> 
Subject: FASTECH REF: SMD 560A DOA: 04.09.2022 YOUR REF: SMQ 9014H  
 
Without Prejudice 
 

Dear Asher, 

 

Enclosed with LOD documents to support the claim. 

 

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement as soon possible. 

 

Thank you 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Szelin 

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd 

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48 

Autobay Singapore 417883 

Tel: 6746 5405 

Fax: 6745 8520 

 
Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any 

personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/ claimant. 

 
 


