Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 8 September 2022 9:21 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR; assignments

Cc: Jared Liu Yaorong; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10017382/JL || OlI- SFT882U (Red) TP- ES7117S || Est: $0.00 ||
Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd

Attachments: C10017382.zip

Hi Team

We wish to appoint LKK to conduct survey for the TP vehicle number: ES7117S

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd
10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A
#03-11 Ang Mo Kio Auto Point
Singapore 568047

Contact: Jacqueline
Mobile : (65) 9740 0999
Tel :(65) 64819517

Please find attached GIA reports for your reference.
Ol yet to make the reporting.

Best regards,

Salizawati Haizar
Admin Executive, Claims

F +65 6725 0853
E salizawati.h@budgetdirect.com.sg
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From: Accord Auto(Claims) <claims@mycarworkshop.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 September 2022 6:10 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Jared Liu Yaorong <jared.liu@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Accord Auto Services <gilbert.ng@mycarworkshop.com.sg>
Subject: Re: PRI Request on 07.09.2022 || Our ref: C10017382/IL | | Accident Involving: ES7117S & SFT882U DOA
15.06.22

Dear Maybie,

We would like to appoint LKK.



Thank you.

Kind regards,

Jacqueline

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd
10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A
#03-11 Ang Mo Kio Auto Point
Singapore 568047

Mobile : (65) 9740 0999

Tel  : (65) 6481 9517
Fax : (65) 6481 9516

This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view, disseminate, use or
copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from your system. Thank you.

On Wed, 7 Sept 2022 at 15:36, Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Jacqueline,

Please find the list of our proposed surveyors.

1. FTA
2. A-PAC
3. LKK

4. IN-HOUSE

Kindly let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor surveyors.

Best regards,

Salizawati Haizar

Admin Executive, Claims

F +65 6725 0853

E salizawati.h@budgetdirect.com.sg
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From: Accord Auto(Claims) <claims@mycarworkshop.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 7 September 2022 2:59 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Accord Auto Services <gilbert.ng@mycarworkshop.com.sg>
Subject: Re: Accident Involving: ES7117S & SFT882U DOA 15.06.22

Dear Maybie,

Kindly see see file attached for your reference.

Thank you.

Kind regards,

Jacqueline

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd
10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A
#03-11 Ang Mo Kio Auto Point
Singapore 568047

Mobile : (65) 9740 0999
Tel  : (65) 6481 9517
Fax : (65) 6481 9516

This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view, disseminate, use
or copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from your system. Thank you.

On Wed, 7 Sept 2022 at 14:13, Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Sirs,



Kindly furnish us your GIA report for claim registration.

We shall review the case accordingly.

Thank you.

Best regards,

Maybie Chua

Admin Executive, Claims

F +65 6725 0853

E maybie.chua@budgetdirect.com.sg
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From: Accord Auto(Claims) <claims@mycarworkshop.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 7 September 2022 2:02 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Accord Auto Services <gilbert.ng@mycarworkshop.com.sg>
Subject: Fwd: Accident Involving: ES7117S & SFT882U DOA 15.06.22

Dear Person-IN-Charge,

Your insured had failed to report GIA (see file attachment), as our client wanted to contact you guys
directly. Possible that we can add into our client in a loop thru email correspondence.



Thank you.

Kind regards,

Jacqueline

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd
10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A
#03-11 Ang Mo Kio Auto Point
Singapore 568047

Mobile : (65) 9740 0999
Tel  : (65) 6481 9517
Fax : (65) 6481 9516

This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view, disseminate, use
or copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from your system. Thank you.



