Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 27 March 2023 5:46 PM

To: admin@Ilmautosolution.com

Cc: SUR; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: TP CLAIM : SND 8472G | DOA 27/08/2022 | BUDGET DIRECT INSURANCE

Dear Vincent,

Any update?

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, March 22, 2023 2:58 PM

To: admin@Imautosolution.com

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: TP CLAIM : SND 8472G | DOA 27/08/2022 | BUDGET DIRECT INSURANCE

Dear Vincent,

“Without Prejudice”

Attached marked estimate for vehicle SND 8472G.

We recommend cost of repair of Lump Sum $1,850.00 with 2 days of repair, subject to our Principal approval.

Please provide after repair photographs.

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



