Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 5 September 2022 3:49 PM

To: ‘Clement Chia Cher Yang'; Admin A; assignments

Cc: ‘Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore)'

Subject: RE: TP DS claim: AIS 2022 22006329: SKF910L TP Claim Against Allianz Ins (SJW2935A).
DOA:24.08.2022

Categories: HMK

Dear Clement,
As spoken, survey arrangement confirmed on 6.9.22 @ 12pm.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Clement Chia Cher Yang <clement.chia.cy@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 5 September 2022 2:40 PM

To: Yan (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; B © <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: RE: TP DS claim: AIS 2022 22006329: SKF910L TP Claim Against Allianz Ins (SJW2935A). DOA:24.08.2022

Dear LKK,
Please arrange survey on 6/9/2022 Tuesday at 9AM.
Thanks

Best Regards,
Clement Chia

Customer Service Advisor, Body & Paint

Vantage Automotive Limited

305 Alexandra Road, #02-01 Vantage Automotive Centre, Singapore 159942
T: 4659278 2710 F: +65 6477 7300 E: clement.chia.cy@simedarby.com.sg
www.simedarbymotors.com | www.vantageauto.com.sg




Embrace the Vantage ONE Experience

Discover the convenience of car ownership with the Vantage ONE App
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From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, September 5, 2022 2:28 PM

To: Yan (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; BIE © <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Clement Chia Cher Yang <clement.chia.cy@simedarby.com.sg>

Subject: TP DS claim: AIS 2022 22006329: SKF910L TP Claim Against Allianz Ins (SJW2935A). DOA:24.08.2022
Importance: High

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organisation. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender and know the
content is safe. Click “Report Phishing” if you think it is malicious.

Your ref: SKF910L

Our ref: 2022 22006329JK-SJW2935A-

Dear Sirs,

We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Please download the documents from this link below (For Survey)
File: SJIW2935A Ol GIA.pdf, SKF910L(TP).pdf

Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=82966bac-8d67-49f6-b5f8-9b74541aea38-dee84228cfb30eeb

Size: ~ 2 MByte, Download available until: 9/10/2022

Passwords will be sent in a separate email.

Thank you.

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg
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This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.

P Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Clement Chia Cher Yang <clement.chia.cy@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, September 2, 2022 10:38 AM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: Azman Abdullah <azman.abdullah@simedarby.com.sg>; Katherine Chong <katherine.chong@simedarby.com.sg>;
Andy Ooi Lee Keong <andy.ooi.leekeong@simedarby.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] SKF910L TP Claim Against Allianz Ins (SJW2935). DOA:24.08.2022

Importance: High

Dear Sirs,

Refer to the above matter.
Attached our client’s GIA report and supporting documents for your consideration.

Please advise if liability is clear for us to proceed with Direct Settlement.
Thank You.

Best Regards,
Clement Chia

Customer Service Advisor, Body & Paint

Vantage Automotive Limited

305 Alexandra Road, #02-01 Vantage Automotive Centre, Singapore 159942
T: 4659278 2710 F: +65 6477 7300 E: clement.chia.cy@simedarby.com.sg
www.simedarbymotors.com | www.vantageauto.com.sg
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“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the named
addressee ("the Recipient") and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or proprietary to the Sime
Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws. If you are not the intended
Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding and/or printing the Message. Please notify
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the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete all copies of the Message. Sime Darby disclaims all
liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the Message being infected by computer virus or other malicious

software. Any views and/or opinions expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and do not necessarily
represent those of Sime Darby's.”



