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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 19 September 2022 8:50 AM

To: Carine Yeo   TCBC

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SMY 789 Y - FINAL BILL

Hi Carine, 
  

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $4,782.00 before GST /- with 03 

days of repair, subject to their approval 

 

 
Best Regards,  

Rasul | Assessor  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  
The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct  
file and location.

Save the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessary....  

 

From: Carine Yeo TCBC <carine.yeo@borneomotors.com.sg> 

Sent: Friday, 16 September 2022 9:40 am 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: SMY 789 Y - FINAL BILL  

  

Good morning Rasul, 

  

With reference to the above-mentioned. 

  

I have attached a copy of the Final Bill for your immediate attention.  

  

Repair Amount            :           $4782.00 + GST $334.74 = $5116.74 

Days of Repair             :           03 working days  

  

  

  

Thank you and Best Regards  

  

Carine Yeo Carine Yeo Carine Yeo Carine Yeo  
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Motor Claims Assessor Motor Claims Assessor Motor Claims Assessor Motor Claims Assessor  

  

DIRECT LINE +65 6631 1505 | MOBILE  +65 9699 6192 | FAX +65 6476 6247  

EMAIL: carine.yeo@borneomotors.com.sg  

Inchcape – Borneo Motors  I  2 Pandan Crescent, S128462 

www.borneomotors.com.sg  I  www.lexus.com.sg 

  


