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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 12 October 2022 5:31 PM

To: Ganping; Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SMR4676A

Dear Gan Ping, 

 

The repair cost amount should be $4,783.20. 

 
Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Ganping <ganping@worldauto.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, 10 October 2022 4:35 PM 

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SMR4676A 

 

Hi Guo qiang 

We agree to finalise repair cost $4783.20 Part by Part, 5 repair days. 

 

Please refer to estimate Parts list items amount should be $2503.20  

 

Thanks & Regards, 

Gan Ping 

 
 5 Kim Chuan Lane, Singapore 537070 

 Tel:  6451 3933     Fax:  6455 7576 

 Email: enquiry@worldauto.com.sg 

 Website:  www.worldauto.com.sg 
 

----- Original Message ----- 

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) (GuoQiang@lkkauto.com) 

Date: 07/10/2022 18:00 

To: ganping@worldauto.com.sg 

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) (siewsc@lkkauto.com) 

Subject: SMR4676A 

 

Hi, 
“Without Prejudice” 
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We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair $4782.4 before GST- with 5 days of repair, subject to their 
approval. 
 

Regards, 
Guo Qiang 

 


