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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: raymond@bhh.com.sg
Sent: Wednesday, 28 December 2022 9:27 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A; CS A Team
Subject: RE: Accident involving FBL0633L and SMC3248M on 31/08/2020 LKK REF : 

CC6/AIG20010407/Ues3
Attachments: 11620_RV,LOA & Invoices.pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
We attached the Release Voucher, Authorisation To Act, Tax Invoice and GIA Search Invoice for your perusal. 
 
Repair cost(with GST) : $1,765.50 
Loss of Use(3days x $20): $60.00 
Seach Fee: $2.00 
Total: $ 1,827.50 
 
We look forward to receive your payment soon. 
 
Thanks 

Best Regards, 
Raymond 
Ban Hock Hin Co., Pte Ltd 
Tel: (65) 6281 6520 x 220 | Fax: (65) 6284 2969 
Visit us at http://www.bhh.com.sg  
Facebook: http://www.facebook.com/bhhsg  
  
This mail and/or attachments are confidential and may also be legally privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any review, 
dissemination, distribution or copying of this email and/or attachments is strictly prohibited. Please notify us immediately by email and delete this message and 
all its attachments. 

  

 

 

  
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 27 December 2022 11:37 AM 
To: raymond@bhh.com.sg 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident involving FBL0633L and SMC3248M on 31/08/2020 LKK REF : CC6/AIG20010407/Ues3 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 


