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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 9 March 2023 2:32 PM
To: 'TSR AUTOMOTIVE'
Cc: Admin A; CS A Team
Subject: RE: SGT9363E *** LKK REF: CC6/AIS22008574/Kea3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
Dear Sirs 
 
Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at S$4,050.00(all in) in full 
and final settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their 
insured arising out of this incident.  
 
If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of the Letter of Authorization / 
Warrant to Act, RENTAL INVOICE/RECEIPT  and your Bank details for us to process payment.   
 
Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of 
liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore 
and/or our insured as a result of the accident on 26 AUG 2022.  
 
Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or 
payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability. 
 
Thank you.  
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: TSR AUTOMOTIVE <tsrteamworks2022@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, March 7, 2023 11:10 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SGT9363E *** LKK REF: CC6/AIS22008574/Kea3 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
 
We accept the offer. 
 
Please forward us DV soon 
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Thank you 
 
Regards 
Ryan 
93825367 
 
On Tue, 7 Mar 2023 at 10:46, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We propose settlement at a global sum of $4,050.00(all-in). 

  

Please confirm acceptance. 

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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From: TSR AUTOMOTIVE <tsrteamworks2022@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, December 27, 2022 12:48 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SGT9363E *** LKK REF: CC6/AIS22008574/Kea3 

  

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

  

Attached herewith video footage and scene photos as requested. 

  

Kindly update us on the status soonest. 

  

  

Thank you 

  

Regards 

Ryan 

93825367 

  

On Fri, 23 Dec 2022 at 12:44, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

Please be informed that liability is unclear as our driver reported that no colllison. Attached is a copy of our 
insured accident report for your easy reference. 
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We would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) for our review. 

  

Appreciate an early reply. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 15 November 2022 2:39 PM 
To: TSR AUTOMOTIVE <tsrteamworks2022@gmail.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SGT9363E *** LKK REF: CC6/AIS22008574/Kea3 

  

Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

Thank you for your email. 

  

Our respective team will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 

  

Hi CS team, 

  

Kindly assist. 
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To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: TSR AUTOMOTIVE <tsrteamworks2022@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 15 November 2022 12:38 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SGT9363E *** LKK REF: CC6/AIS22008574/Kea3 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

  

Refer to the above matter. 

  

Kindly update us on the status. 

  

Thank you 

  

Regards 

Ryan 

93825367 
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On Tue, 25 Oct 2022 at 13:49, TSR AUTOMOTIVE <tsrteamworks2022@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Sirs, 

  

  

We refer to the above, 

  

Please update us on the status, any offer? 

  

Kindly check and revert soonest. 

  

  

Thank you 

  

Regards 

Ryan 

93825367 

  

  

  

  

On Tue, 4 Oct 2022 at 11:20, Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

Thank you for your email. 

  

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 

  

Hi Asher, 
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Kindly assist. 

  

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: TSR AUTOMOTIVE <tsrteamworks2022@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 4 October 2022 10:14 AM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: SGT9363E 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

  

Attached our Lod, repair and rental bill for SGT9363E. 

  

  

Thank you 

  

Regards 

Ryan 

93825367 
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: TSR AUTOMOTIVE <tsrteamworks2022@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 10 March 2023 9:41 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: SGT9363E *** LKK REF: CC6/AIS22008574/Kea3
Attachments: SGT 9363 E.pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong 
 
We accept the offer $4050.00 all in  
 
Attach LOA for SGT 9363 E, 
 
TSR AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD BANK DETAIL : 
 
UNITED OVERSEA BANK LIMITED 
ACCOUNT 353-311-747-1 
BANK CODE 7375 
BANK BRANCH 066 
SWIFT CODE UOVBSGSG 
NAME OF ACCOUNT HOLDER : TSR AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD 
 
 
Thank you regards 
Ryan Soh 90030857 /93825367 
TSR AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD 
 
 
 
 
 
 
On Thu, 9 Mar 2023 at 14:32, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

  

Dear Sirs 

  

Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at S$4,050.00(all in) in full 
and final settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their 
insured arising out of this incident.  

  

If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of the Letter of Authorization / 
Warrant to Act, RENTAL INVOICE/RECEIPT  and your Bank details for us to process payment.   
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Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of 
liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore 
and/or our insured as a result of the accident on 26 AUG 2022.  

  

Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or 
payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability. 

  

Thank you.  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: TSR AUTOMOTIVE <tsrteamworks2022@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, March 7, 2023 11:10 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SGT9363E *** LKK REF: CC6/AIS22008574/Kea3 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

  

We accept the offer. 

  

Please forward us DV soon 
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Thank you 

  

Regards 

Ryan 

93825367 

  

On Tue, 7 Mar 2023 at 10:46, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We propose settlement at a global sum of $4,050.00(all-in). 

  

Please confirm acceptance. 

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: TSR AUTOMOTIVE <tsrteamworks2022@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, December 27, 2022 12:48 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SGT9363E *** LKK REF: CC6/AIS22008574/Kea3 

  

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

  

Attached herewith video footage and scene photos as requested. 

  

Kindly update us on the status soonest. 

  

  

Thank you 

  

Regards 

Ryan 

93825367 

  

On Fri, 23 Dec 2022 at 12:44, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
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WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

Please be informed that liability is unclear as our driver reported that no colllison. Attached is a copy of our 
insured accident report for your easy reference. 

  

We would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) for our review. 

  

Appreciate an early reply. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 15 November 2022 2:39 PM 
To: TSR AUTOMOTIVE <tsrteamworks2022@gmail.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SGT9363E *** LKK REF: CC6/AIS22008574/Kea3 

  

Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

Thank you for your email. 
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Our respective team will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 

  

Hi CS team, 

  

Kindly assist. 

  

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: TSR AUTOMOTIVE <tsrteamworks2022@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 15 November 2022 12:38 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SGT9363E *** LKK REF: CC6/AIS22008574/Kea3 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

  

Refer to the above matter. 

  

Kindly update us on the status. 
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Thank you 

  

Regards 

Ryan 

93825367 

  

On Tue, 25 Oct 2022 at 13:49, TSR AUTOMOTIVE <tsrteamworks2022@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Sirs, 

  

  

We refer to the above, 

  

Please update us on the status, any offer? 

  

Kindly check and revert soonest. 

  

  

Thank you 

  

Regards 

Ryan 

93825367 

  

  

  

  

On Tue, 4 Oct 2022 at 11:20, Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir / Madam, 
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Thank you for your email. 

  

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 

  

Hi Asher, 

  

Kindly assist. 

  

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: TSR AUTOMOTIVE <tsrteamworks2022@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 4 October 2022 10:14 AM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: SGT9363E 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

  

Attached our Lod, repair and rental bill for SGT9363E. 
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 7 March 2023 10:44 AM
To: m city
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBL7371X(ALLIANZ) AND SGT9363E AT/ALONG FERNVALE 

LANE SLIP ROAD TURNING TO SENGKANG WEST ROAD ON 26/08/2022

MCT RENTALS PTE LTD                             [By Email Only] 
DRIVER: BAIN KRISHNA KANTO 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
You Ref: GBL7371X 
Our Ref: CC6/AIS22008574/Kea3 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBL7371X(ALLIANZ) AND SGT9363E AT/ALONG FERNVALE LANE SLIP ROAD TURNING TO 
SENGKANG WEST ROAD ON 26/08/2022 
  
We refer to the above subject matter.  We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your 
motor insurer, Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy. 
  
We have received a claim from SGT9363E against your insurance policy. 
                
We have reviewed the matter and we are of the view that we do not have a good defense towards the claim 
submitted by SGT9363E. Third party had submitted a copy of video footage to show that your vehicle rear-ended 
third party vehicle. Therefore, we shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third-party claim at 
best to avoid further litigation, which would escalate to even more cost. 
  
Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against your policy. 
  
As Insurers, they shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights 
afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third 
party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the 
date of this letter. Your intent must be formally expressed to Allianz and acknowledged by Allianz. 
  
To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s) 
and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without our prior knowledge and 
consent. If you receive any correspondence or legal document such as a Writ of Summons in connection with this 
accident, please forward it to us immediately. You may email it to customerservice@allianz.com.sg or deliver it by 
hand to Allianz Customer Care Centre. 
  
This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by Allianz of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach 
of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed. 
  
In the event of receiving and handling of any third-party injury claim(s), we shall keep you informed of the final 
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).  
  
If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact as at 6742 3197 or chewht@lkkauto.com. 
  
Thank you. 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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Claim Audit

 

  AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
02 Sep
2022
14:04

Clm Dtl Modified Claimant's Name: -> NEO SAYKIONG. Claimant's ID: -> SXXXX544Z. [A] HOW
MEI KWAN

2
02 Sep
2022
14:04

Clm Veh Model
Changed (201492) HONDA FIT 1.3 G (A). [A] HOW

MEI KWAN

3
02 Sep
2022
14:04

Clm Created
Reg No: SGT9363E. Acct Date: 2022/08/26. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: Allianz Insurance Singapore
Pte. Ltd. (HQ). TP Insurer: Income Insurance Limited (HQ). Workshop: TSR AUTOMOTIVE PTE LT
D (HQ)

[A] HOW
MEI KWAN

4
02 Sep
2022
14:04

Adj Co Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW
MEI KWAN

5
02 Sep
2022
14:04

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/09/13 [A] HOW

MEI KWAN

6
02 Sep
2022
14:04

Adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW
MEI KWAN

7
02 Sep
2022
14:04

Adj Adjuster
Assigned [None] -> KENNETH KONG [A] HOW

MEI KWAN

8
06 Feb
2023
11:01

Adj Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:4052.00:Liability: 100%. Insured driver rear-ended third party. We have uploaded a cop
y of 3rd party video footage in Merimen for your viewing. Please confirm policy coverage and adv
ise if we may proceed DS and any Section 2 Excess. I

[A] CHEW
HSIAO
TONG

9
06 Feb
2023
14:06

Video
Downloaded Downloaded 3RD PARTY VIDEO 1 [I] Faiz Rosli

10
06 Feb
2023
14:07

Video
Downloaded Downloaded 3RD PARTY VIDEO 2 [I] Faiz Rosli

11
06 Feb
2023
14:12

Adj Next Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/09/13. Mandate Remarks: Liability against OI, AVF impact can
be seen. Proceed w Offer. TP Excess : $1.5K [I] Faiz Rosli

12
06 Feb
2023
14:12

Adj Mandate Set Approved:4052.00:Liability against OI, AVF impact can be seen. Proceed w Offer. TP Excess : $1.
5K [I] Faiz Rosli

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go

ACTIVITY
No record

Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2838694 02 Sep 2022
14:04:19

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

SGT9363E xx.xx

2910296 06 Feb 2023
10:53:02 Video Upload Motor

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

SGT9363E CHEW HSIAO
TONG xx.xx

2910297 06 Feb 2023
10:53:03 Video Upload Motor

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

SGT9363E CHEW HSIAO
TONG xx.xx

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=104635655&CFTOKEN=5b8f4fedf326984b-7309EA82-A674-D9E1-003AC98E2E686783&USID=3251&RID=7282703
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=104635655&CFTOKEN=5b8f4fedf326984b-7309EA82-A674-D9E1-003AC98E2E686783&USID=3251&RID=7282703
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=104635655&CFTOKEN=5b8f4fedf326984b-7309EA82-A674-D9E1-003AC98E2E686783&USID=3251&RID=7282703
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=104635655&CFTOKEN=5b8f4fedf326984b-7309EA82-A674-D9E1-003AC98E2E686783&USID=3251&RID=7282703&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D1132805%26extid%3D394331%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=104635655&CFTOKEN=5b8f4fedf326984b-7309EA82-A674-D9E1-003AC98E2E686783&USID=3251&RID=7282703
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