Yan (LKK Auto)

From: MTPRI <MTPRI@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 1 September 2022 12:01 PM

To: assignments; YAN

Cc: MTPRI; Karen Chan Siau Chin (StridesASvcs/FM&SuppSvcs/Claims & 1A/Claims & |A);

Tan Wei Teck (StridesASvcs/FM&SuppSves/Claims & 1A/Claims & 1A); Foo Chit Yan
(Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd)

Subject: FW: NON REPORTING D22002767MFBP/STRIDES/KT SMU5308R & your insured
SG5802H/DOA:31/08/2022/Est $

Attachments: 2773_001.pdf

Ref: TBA

Dear Yan,

Kindly survey on “ Without Prejudice” basis.
TP: SMUS5308R

Insured: SG5802H
Workshop: Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd.

Thank you.
Regards,

Hua Yen
Claim Department

Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd | 60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4 Singapore 757705
DID: 6866 2650 | Fax: 6368 7421 | Email: HuaYen.Ong@strides.com.sg

From: Harminder Kaur <Harminder@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 1 September 2022 9:35 am

To: MTPRI <MTPRI@smrt.com.sg>

Cc: Ong Hua Yen (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <HuaYen.Ong@strides.com.sg>; Karen Tan
<karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: NON REPORTING D22002767MFBP/STRIDES/KT SMUS5308R & your insured SG5802H/D0OA:31/08/2022/Est $

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of SMRT. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender and
are expecting the content or attachment.

Dear Hua Yen,
PRI.
Thank You.

Best Regards,

Harminder Kaur
Motor Claims

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd



A Member of LAEEEEIM Insurance Group

36 Robinson Road, #16-01 City House, Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | Fax: 6507 3849 |Reg. No. 195000106C

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error,
please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.

From: Ng Sin Hai <shng@honda.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 31 August 2022 7:03 pm

To: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@mesfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: 3rd party direct settlement SMU5308R & your insured SG5802H/DOA:31/08/2022/Est $

Dear All,

Please refer to the attached pdf, we are assisting our insured vehicle SMU5308R to file a 3rd party claim against your
insured vehicle SG5802H and to request for direct settlement.

Kindly assist and expedite to check the claim liability soonest.

Thank you and have a nice day,©

Best Regards,

Ng Sin Hai

Senior Service Advisor
Mandai Body Repair & Paint

Honda Singapore

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd.

255 Alexandra Road, Singapore 159937
DID/Mobile: 6471 5419 / 9072 1769
Web: www.honda.com.sg

.- You
=

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual
or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from
disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are
hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly
prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete
the mail. Thank you.



