Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM

Sent: Friday, 7 October 2022 3:27 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SGR 52Y - CHING AH CHOON | DOA : 16/08/2022 | REF. NO. : 202222006204

Dear Steve,
We agree to the finalization amount of $8232 and 4 repair days.
Kindly advise if the Letter of Demand should be sent to you or directly to insurer.

Thanks & Best Regards

Rachel Lai

Claims Department
HP: 8666 7775 & | Office-Tel: 66310707 @ | Fax: 6316
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This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified recipient(s) to whom
it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or
use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 4 October 2022 9:37 pm

To: CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SGR 52Y - CHING AH CHOON | DOA : 16/08/2022 | REF. NO. : 202222006204

Hi Rachel,

Re-finalize.



Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM <CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM>

Sent: Tuesday, 4 October 2022 3:22 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SGR 52Y - CHING AH CHOON | DOA : 16/08/2022 | REF. NO. : 202222006204

Dear Steve,

We refer to your email dated 16/08/2022.

The supplementary that you have calculated has missed out the margin of 10%.
Calculation should've been, $8111.00 + $110 + $11 (margin).

Thanks & Best Regards

Rachel Lai

HP: 8666 7775 & | Office-Tel: 66310707 © | Fax: 6316
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This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified recipient(s) to whom
it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or
use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 4 October 2022 9:12 am

To: CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM

Subject: SGR 52Y - CHING AH CHOON | DOA : 16/08/2022 | REF. NO. : 202222006204

HI Rachel,



Kindly refer our finalize $8221.00 (P/P, before GST). 4 days.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Steven Foong| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM <CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM>

Sent: Thursday, 29 September 2022 5:30 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SGR 52Y - CHING AH CHOON | DOA : 16/08/2022 | REF. NO. : 202222006204

Dear Mr Steve,
Attached are the after-repair photos and supplier invoices.
Please let us have your offer.

Thanks & Best Regards

WMurugesan
Claims Department
HP: 8666 7775 & | Office-Tel: 66310707 @ | Fax: 6316
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b% Please consider the environment before printing this email.

This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified recipient(s) to whom
it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or
use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM <CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM>

Sent: Thursday, 15 September 2022 2:54 pm

To: Steve Chen (stevechen@lkkauto.com) <stevechen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SGR 52Y - CHING AH CHOON | DOA : 16/08/2022 | REF. NO. : 202222006204

Dear Steve,
Attached herewith the before paint photos for your reference.

Thanks & Best Regards

Rachel Lai

HP: 8666 7775 & | Office-Tel: 66310707 © | Fax: 6316
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Reporting Centre Workshop Spraypainting

5 Soon Lee Street 5 Soon Lee Street 1 Soon Lee Street

#01-60, Pioneer Point #01-62, Pioneer Point #06-41, Pioneer Centre
Singapore 627607 Singapore 627607 Singapore 627605

Email: claims@chengauto.com Email: cab@chengauto.com Email: cab@chengauto.com

b% Please consider the environment before printing this email.

This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified recipient(s) to whom
it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or
use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM <CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM>

Sent: Thursday, 15 September 2022 10:06 am

To: Steve Chen (stevechen@lkkauto.com) <stevechen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: SGR 52Y - CHING AH CHOON | DOA : 16/08/2022 | REF. NO. : 202222006204

Dear Mr Steve,
We refer to the above-mentioned vehicle.
Attached herewith the checked item photos for your reference.

Thanks & Best Regards

Rachel Lai

HP: 8666 7775 & | Office-Tel: 66310707 © | Fax: 6316
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b% Please consider the environment before printing this email.

This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified recipient(s) to whom
it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or
use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.



