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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: PP GOH <ppgoh@outlook.com>
Sent: Thursday, 8 September 2022 3:42 PM
To: Lee, Ming-Yao
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Our Ref : 5965237992SG-003 | Accident Involving SGF4411G & FBN2015Y on 

24/8/2022 along Jurong Gateway Road
Attachments: Traffice Police IO Letter.pdf; RE: SGF4411G

Dear Ming Yao, 
 
Today afternoon C&C just emailed to ask for the letter issued to me by the Traffic Police IO and I had emailed. 
Attached is the letter and my email to C&C. 
 
Keeping AIG in the loop. 
 
Thanks. 
 
 

From: PP GOH  
Sent: Tuesday, September 6, 2022 4:11 PM 
To: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com> 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Our Ref : 5965237992SG-003 | Accident Involving SGF4411G & FBN2015Y on 24/8/2022 along Jurong 
Gateway Road 
 
Hi, 
 
Yes they took retain my Driving License. 
 
On 25 Aug 2022 I went to Traffic Police (TP) HQ to meet up with the Investigation Officer (IO) and he informed me 
the case outcome will takes 2-4 months. 
So far Traffic police had not get back to me on the outcome.  
 
For the third party I assumed you refer to the motorist involved in the accident including his insurance claim, so far I 
had no contact with him or received anything regarding his insurance claim. 
 
Once the TP IO get back to me on the case outcome I will email you including the scan copy of the TP letter (if any). 
 
Thanks. 
 
 
 

From: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, September 6, 2022 3:57 PM 
To: PPGOH@outlook.com 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Our Ref : 5965237992SG-003 | Accident Involving SGF4411G & FBN2015Y on 24/8/2022 along Jurong 
Gateway Road 
 
Hi Mr. Chern, 
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We refer to above mentioned accident where we are insurer of your vehicle, SGF4411G. 
 
I am the case handler. Understand from our appointer adjuster, Hsiao Tong that your Driving License was taken by 
traffic police for investigation. 
 
Kindly provide all letters from third party or traffic police in order for us to review the matter.  
 
Should you have any enquiries, feel free to contact the undersigned. 
 
Regards, 
Lee Ming Yao, George 
Complex Claims Examiner – Auto Property Damage Claims 
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
 
AIG Building 
78 Shenton Way, Level 10 
Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1769 
Ming-Yao.Lee@AIG.com | www.AIG.sg 
 
IMPORTANT NOTICE:  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must 
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by 
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and 
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into 
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no 
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or 
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 


