Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Ok we agree

Thanks regards

Tsl Auto <tslautogarage@gmail.com>

Wednesday, 28 December 2022 10:30 AM

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Re: TSL AUTO GARAGE (Waiting for finalise )-SJR 4998G

On Wed, 28 Dec 2022 at 7:38 AM, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

WITHOUT PREJDUICE

We have re-view on the repair cost.

Maintain cost of repair of LS $6400/- with § days of repair, subject to insurance approval.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Tsl Auto <tslautogarage@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 December 2022 2:56 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: TSL AUTO GARAGE (Waiting for finalise )-SJR 4998G

Hi sir

Can we close at $6900 Lump sum 8days repair

On Tue, 27 Dec 2022 at 8:36 AM, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $6400/- with 8 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315



Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tsl Auto <tslautogarage@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 23 December 2022 12:28 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Fwd: TSL AUTO GARAGE (Waiting for finalise )

Hi

Please give finalise

Thanks regards

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Tsl Auto <tslautogarage@gmail.com>
Date: Fri, 4 Nov 2022 at 5:12 PM

Subject: TSL AUTO GARAGE (Waiting for finalise )
To: <sur@lkkauto.com>

Dear sir/mdm

1) SJR 7722R Honda vezel

2) SLM 520 E Honda city

3)SCU 32L mini couper

4)SNC 3336E Mercedes GLC
5)SJV 9006R siroco

6)SLE 2748U volks Wagen Jetta
7)SMR 62887 Avante

8)SMT 6746Z Mercedes C200

9)SKZ 8517G Audi A4



10)SJY 7253R BMW Z4
11)SLF 3843 R mark x
12)SMZ 4263K Bmw
13)SJR 4998 Toyota Vios

14) GBL 4450x NV 200

We are waiting yr revert for these case finalise

Thanks regards



