EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 16 December 2022 8:50 AM

To: MAGGIETAN2018@GMAIL.COM

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE:COST OF REPAIR & RENTAL & DISBURSEMENT / ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 5581P

AND SMS 5929) ON 27/08/2022

Dear Tan Lee Lian Neo Maggie Mrs Sin Boon Wah,
We refer to the above matter and previous tele conversation on 07.10.2022 with our Ms Mei Kwan.

Please be informed that we have received Letter of Demand from the Third Party’s workshop. The claim amount is as
follows:-

Cost of Repair - $1,332.15 (inclusive of GST)
Loss of Rental - S 385.20 (with GST) Replacement car provided during the repairs.
LTA SearchFee - S  2.00

Total - $1,719.35

We will submit these breakdown to your insurer AlG for approval.
If you have any enquiry, pls contact me. (Ms Asher has left our company)
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ezlyna Eng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: Ezlyna@lkkauto.com |

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 1 September 2022 12:27 PM

To: MAGGIETAN2018@GMAIL.COM

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 5581P AND SMS 5929) ON 27/08/2022

Our Ref: CC6/A1G22008446/Kea3

1 September 2022
TAN LEE LIAN NEO MAGGIE MRS SIN BOON WAH
Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 5581P AND SMS 5929J) ON 27/08/2022



We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against
you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be
deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher Sng

Case Handler

DID: 6841 6051

Email: Ashersng@Ikkauto.com

c.C. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)



