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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 19 January 2023 2:32 PM
To: 1688gm@gmail.com
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH2851G(AIG) AND FBS2276J ON 30/08/2022 @ 

11:40HRS ALONG/AT 4 QUEENS ROAD
Attachments: FBS2276J scene photo 1.jpeg; FBS2276J scene photo 2.jpg; FBS2276J scene photo 

3.jpg

Dear Sirs, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We have reviewed the matter and we are of the view that we do not have a good defense towards the claim 
submitted by FBS2276J. Attached here with accident scene photos for your easy reference. Under Motor Accident 
Guide, any vehicle reversing in/out of the parking lot should exercise greater caution. Therefore, we shall proceed to 
negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third-party claim at best to avoid further litigation, which would 
escalate to even more cost. Please be assured that we will do our due diligence to mitigate the cost. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact 
us within 07 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Thank you. 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Thursday, 1 September 2022 4:28 PM 
To: 1688gm@gmail.com 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH2851G(AIG) AND FBS2276J ON 30/08/2022 @ 11:40HRS ALONG/AT 4 QUEENS 
ROAD 
 
Our Ref: CC6/AIG22008442/pa3 
AIG Ref: 1012765092SG 
 
Jia Sen Enterprise Pte Ltd 

Dear Sirs, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH2851G(AIG) AND FBS2276J ON 30/08/2022 @ 11:40HRS ALONG/AT 4 QUEENS ROAD 
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We, LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd has been appointed to act on the behalf of your insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance 
Pte Ltd (AIG) to settle a THIRD-PARTY claim against you for an accident which happened on the above-mentioned 
date and location. 
 
Kindly proceed to lodge your GIA report within five (05) working days of receipt of this letter, giving the version of 
the accident amongst other things related to the accident. The GIA report can be lodged at any of AIG reporting 
centres. You may refer to your Certificate of Insurance for the list of the reporting centres. 
 
We attached here with a copy of third party accident report and scene photo for your easy reference. 
 
If you have any information to add or any amendments to make, please contact the undersigned within five days 
from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that the standing of your insurance policy such as NCD, premium & etc would be affected. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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Claim Audit

 

  AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1 30 Aug 2022
20:02 Clm Dtl Modified Claimant's Name: -> LIH BIAN XUN. Claimant's ID: -> S9411427F. [A] HOW MEI KWAN

2 30 Aug 2022
20:02

Clm Veh Model
Changed (206835) YAMAHA NMAX155 155cc ABS CVT. [A] HOW MEI KWAN

3 30 Aug 2022
20:02 Clm Created Reg No: FBS2276J. Acct Date: 2022/08/30. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: AIG Asia Pa

cific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG). Workshop: Pang Scooter Service (HQ) [A] HOW MEI KWAN

4 30 Aug 2022
20:02 Adj Co Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEI KWAN

5 30 Aug 2022
20:02

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/09/08 [A] HOW MEI KWAN

6 30 Aug 2022
20:02 Adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW MEI KWAN

7 30 Aug 2022
20:02

Clm Ins Co
Changed

[200005] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) -> [203630] AIG Asia Pacific I
nsurance Pte. Ltd. (Express)

[A] Merimen
Administrator

8 30 Aug 2022
20:02 Label Added (20224):Field Survey. [A] Merimen

Administrator

9 30 Aug 2022
20:04 Label Added (19):Fastlane. [A] HOW MEI KWAN

10 30 Aug 2022
20:04

Adj Adjuster
Assigned [None] -> CHEN TSUE YEE [A] HOW MEI KWAN

11 08 Sep 2022
09:12

Clm Registration
Modified Acct Time:11:00:00->12:15:00. Pol No:1900070250->1900070250-03. [I] AIG OneClaim

Integration User

12 15 Nov 2022
18:31

Adj Adjuster
Assigned CHEN TSUE YEE -> MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID [A] HOW MEI KWAN

13 01 Feb 2023
15:04 Adj Rpt Initiated [A] JOANNE LEE KHANG

MIN

14 01 Feb 2023
15:04 Clm Dtl Modified Claim Conclusion: -> 3. [A] JOANNE LEE KHANG

MIN

15 01 Feb 2023
15:04 Clm Dtl Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2021/02/25. [A] JOANNE LEE KHANG

MIN

16 01 Feb 2023
15:04

Clm Details
Notified

[A] JOANNE LEE KHANG
MIN

17 01 Feb 2023
15:12

Adj Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:4258.10:Liability: 100%(B24) *Quantum: $4,258.10(all-in). Pls refer to
adjuster report for details. *For your approval please. [A] CHEW HSIAO TONG

18 03 Feb 2023
17:12

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/09/08 [I] Lee, Ming-Yao

19 03 Feb 2023
17:12 Adj Mandate Set Approved:4258.10. [I] Lee, Ming-Yao

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go

ACTIVITY
[19/01/2023 14:50] CHEW HSIAO TONG:
OI MR TEH CALLED IN. HE WILL LET INSURER TO SETTLE AT BEST
[01/09/2022 15:56] CHEW HSIAO TONG:
Mr Teh (owner)
[01/09/2022 15:54] CHEW HSIAO TONG:
1688gm@gmail.com
[31/08/2022 16:40] HOW MEI KWAN:
OINR. To send out first letter.

Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2836657 30 Aug 2022
20:06:00

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (Express)

FBS2276J GBH2851G 11.00

2907937 01 Feb 2023
15:04:53

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

FBS2276J GBH2851G 11.00

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=103872812&CFTOKEN=9972f9978031a848-9ED77374-DD94-5949-8F6B797CCF125F95&USID=3251&RID=8630297
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=103872812&CFTOKEN=9972f9978031a848-9ED77374-DD94-5949-8F6B797CCF125F95&USID=3251&RID=8630297
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=103872812&CFTOKEN=9972f9978031a848-9ED77374-DD94-5949-8F6B797CCF125F95&USID=3251&RID=8630297
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=103872812&CFTOKEN=9972f9978031a848-9ED77374-DD94-5949-8F6B797CCF125F95&USID=3251&RID=8630297&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D1131567%26extid%3D394029%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=103872812&CFTOKEN=9972f9978031a848-9ED77374-DD94-5949-8F6B797CCF125F95&USID=3251&RID=8630297


2/17/23, 8:19 AM Merimen e-Claims

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_viewhistory&caseid=1131567&extid=394029&CFID=10… 2/2




