Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 3 January 2023 2:07 PM

To: Gabriel Wee

Cc: Admin A

Subject: FW: LOD : JTE 4504 *** LKK REF: CS/11122003564/BTpa3e2-1

Il REF: MFL2022D0001550
Dear Gabriel,
Please refer to third party email below which is self-explanatory. No DS for PD, combine settlement with BI.

In view of this, we will proceed to close file at our end. Thanks.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: MS Group Office <msgroupoffice@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 30 December 2022 1:32 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: LOD : JTE 4504 *** LKK REF: CS/11122003564/BTpa3e2-1

Hi Hsiao Tong,

Understand from our lawyer that Insurer wants to combine both Pl & PD. | will therefore forward our claims to them
accordingly.

Kindly discharge from here.

Thank You and Stay Safe @

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

Cheers,
Yap June
MS Car Auto Pte Ltd

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #01-07



Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875
Telephone: 6385-1838
Fax : 6386-1838

On Tue, Dec 6, 2022 at 12:34 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs,

Please be informed that liability is unclear as our driver reported that traffic light was in green arrow in his favour.

We would like to request for a copy of police investigation result for our review. Thanks.

hons #Tme 14/03/2022, 0145hrs Pesmewl MAMAT

At 1205am while | was driving at Tampines Avenue 10 owards Tampines Avenue 11. At T junction whie
furning right on green kight & molorcycle riding towands me colided with my car. Rider fel on my car

bonet with slight injuries. YWounds &t rght hand and leg
| checked the rider and calm him. | asked passerby to help called the police and ambulance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /

inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.



In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: MS Group Office <msgroupoffice@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 24 November 2022 11:30 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: LOD : JTE 4504 *** LKK REF: CS/11122003564/BTpa3e2-1

Good Morning Hsiao Tong,

Any updates for our LOD sent to you on 17th Oct 2022.

Have the 3rd Party Insurer given any offer ? Please advise accordingly.

Thank You and Stay Safe @

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his
personal injuries.*

Cheers,
Yap June

MS Car Auto Pte Ltd



8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #01-07

Premier @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 415875

Telephone: 6385-1838

Fax : 6386-1838

On Mon, Oct 17, 2022 at 3:48 PM MS Group Office <msgroupoffice@gmail.com> wrote:

BY EMAIL AND POSTAGE

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: JTE 4504

Your Ref: SLT 2746X

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Accident Involving: JTE 4504 and SLT 2746X

Date of Accident:  14th March 2022

Location of Accident: Tampines Avenue 10

JTE 4504 - 3rd Party Report.pdfError! Filename not specified.

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and hereby submit our claim as below, with the relevant documents attached:

Letter of Demand

Proforma Invoice



GIA

Letter Of Authorisation

Thank You and Stay Safe @
*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall

not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his
personal injuries.*

Cheers,
Yap June

MS Car Auto Pte Ltd

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #01-07

Premier @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 415875

Telephone: 6385-1838

Fax : 6386-1838

On Tue, Sep 27, 2022 at 12:43 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

REMINDER

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Kindly forward us (LKK) the following documents our necessary action: -

e LOD.



e Authorisation to Act signed by your client.
e Workshop Invoice.

e LTA/GIA search receipt (if any).

e Police Investigation Report.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 1 September 2022 3:24 PM

To: MS Group Office <msgroupoffice@gmail.com>; motorstopoffice@gmail.com
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Estimate - JTE 4504 *** LKK REF: CS/11122003564/BTpa3e2-1

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,



Kindly forward us (LKK) the following documents our necessary action: -

e LOD.

e Authorisation to Act signed by your client.
e  Workshop Invoice.

e LTA/GIA search receipt (if any).

e Police Investigation Report.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 30 August 2022 10:51 AM

To: MS Group Office <msgroupoffice@gmail.com>; motorstopoffice@gmail.com

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Estimate - JTE 4504 *** LKK REF: CS/I1122003564/BTpa3e2-1

Dear June,



Please email us the LOD.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: June Yap <motorstopoffice@gmail.com:
Sent: Thursday, 25 August 2022 12:06:28 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumipur, Singapore

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com=
Subject: Re: JTE 4504 FINALISE

Okay, We accept the amount of 53550,
When can we send the LOD?
*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his meotor vehicle and shall not

prejudice our client’s claim in respact of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

Cheers,
Yap June
Mater Step Services Pte Ltd

8 Kaki Bukit ave 4 #01-07
Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875

Telephone: 6385-1838
Fax 1 6386-1838

From: MS Group Office <msgroupoffice@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 17 August 2022 4:58 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Estimate - JTE 4504

Hi Meikwan,

Attached here are the docs as per your request.

Thank You and Stay Safe @)



*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and
shall not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his
personal injuries.*

Cheers,
Yap June

MS Car Auto Pte Ltd

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #01-07

Premier @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 415875

Telephone: 6385-1838

Fax : 6386-1838

On Fri, Aug 12, 2022 at 3:14 PM MS Group Office <msgroupoffice@gmail.com> wrote:

Good Afternoon Mei Kwan,

Attached here is the Estimate for mentioned bike JTE 4504 as per your request.

Thank You and Stay Safe @

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and
shall not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his
personal injuries.*

Cheers,
Yap June

MS Car Auto Pte Ltd



8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #01-07
Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875
Telephone: 6385-1838

Fax : 6386-1838
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