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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 22 September 2022 13:51
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Accident involving SJB8881S (Volvo Xc60) & SLV7855X (Aig) on 27/08/2022 *** LKK 

REF: CC6/AIG22008384/ea3
Attachments: SJB8881 REPAIR BILL.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
 
Dear Asher  
 
We submit our claim as follow : 
 
 
Repair cost  S$ 9523.00 
 
Loss of Use S$  500.00 ( 5days ) 
 
Total :  S$ 10023.00 
 
Please let us have your offer to settle  
 
Thank you & Best  Regards, 
Jouis Seow  
Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd 
Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10  
Singapore 539195. 
  
Tel        : (65) 62898126 
Fax       : (65) 62870590 
Email    : jouis@jinauto.com.sg  
  
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 31 August 2022 12:04 PM 
To: JIN AUTO SERVICES <jin@jinauto.com.sg>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: jouis@jinauto.com.sg; jordan@jinauto.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident involving SJB8881S (Volvo Xc60) & SLV7855X (Aig) on 27/08/2022 *** LKK REF: 
CC6/AIG22008384/ea3  
 
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 




