Xin Yu (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 28 September 2022 2:15 PM

To: Xin Yu (LKK Auto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Your Ref: 22/22/22/VP05/026205 - SFJ 8383T / Mercedes Benz GLC250 - Date of

Accident: 26.08.2022

Lonpac External - General

Dear Xin Yu,

Please proceed.

For future motor related matters, please forward to mt_claim@lonpac.com
Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Xin Yu (LKK Auto) <xinyu@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 28 September 2022 2:11 pm

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: 22/22/22/VP05/026205 - SFJ 8383T / Mercedes Benz GLC250 - Date of Accident: 26.08.2022

Dear Gerald,

Kindly have your Approval.

Thanks and Warmest Regards,

Xin Yu

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: XinYu@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Xin Yu (LKK Auto) <xinyu@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 20 September 2022 9:32 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: 22/22/22/VP05/026205 - SFJ 8383T / Mercedes Benz GLC250 - Date of Accident: 26.08.2022

Dear Gerald,

Enclosed preliminary revised (with supplementary) of vehicle SFJ 8383T
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Date of Survey: 02/09/2022

Number of Days (Estimate): 4 Days

Part by Part Repair.
Kindly approve on the supplementary.

Thanks and Warmest Regards,

Xin Yu

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: XinYu@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Saturday, 17 September 2022 9:52 AM

To: Xin Yu (LKK Auto) <xinyu@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Your Ref: 22/22/22/VP05/026205 - SFJ 8383T / Mercedes Benz GLC250 - Date of Accident: 26.08.2022

Lonpac External - General

Dear Xin Yu,

Based on your Preliminary advice, the adjusted repair cost was $4,941.70 inclusive of
checked items.

However, the final bill submitted by the workshop was $5,099.95. If there are supplementary
items, you
are require to seek mandate from us.

Kindly enlighten us on the difference.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@Iaihuat.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 16 September 2022 5:10 pmX

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ionpac.com>

Subject: Your Ref: 22/22/22/VP05/026205 - SFJ 8383T / Mercedes Benz GLC250 - Date of Accident: 26.08.2022

Dear Sir

We enclosed herewith our repair bill, discharge voucher and supplier bill for your office to process payment.
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Thank you.
Kind regards.

Jenny Lim

for LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 64538110

Fax: 64596267



