EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: Gabriel Wee <Gabriel@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 1 November 2022 12:09 PM

To: EzLyna (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: VIDEO FOOTAGE (FRONT & REAR VIEW) [EXTERNAL] - RE: SLP5819X (PRE-

INSPECTION) ; YOUR REF : SLS2960Z (INDIA) ; DOA : 27/08/2022 19:20

Dear Ezlyna,

Liability is clear. Please proceed with direct settlement

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee
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Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 248

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 1 November 2022 12:05 pm

To: Gabriel Wee <Gabriel@iii.com.sg>

Cc: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE:VIDEO FOOTAGE (FRONT & REAR VIEW) [EXTERNAL] - RE: SLP5819X (PRE-INSPECTION) ; YOUR REF :
SLS2960Z (INDIA) ; DOA : 27/08/2022 19:20

Some people who received this message don't often get email from ezlyna@Ikkauto.com. Learn why this is important

Dear Gabriel,

We refer to the above matter and your request dated of 25.10.2022 via Merimen.
Please find enclosed video footages of the accident from SLP5819X’s in-vehicle camera.
Based on the video footage, our insured driver rear end TP (BOLA 27).

Kindly revert on liability.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ezlyna Eng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | email: Ezlyna@Ilkkauto.com |




Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 29 August 2022 11:19 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Gabriel Wee
<Gabriel@iii.com.sg>; Jacelyn Loh <Jacelynloh@iii.com.sg>

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] - RE: SLP5819X (PRE-INSPECTION) ; YOUR REF : SLS2960Z (INDIA) ; DOA : 27/08/2022 19:20

Dear Mei Kwan,
Noted with thanks.

Bhuvaneswari
Motor & Work Injury Claims Department

India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street #04/#05 10B Building
Singapore 049711

Tel: 6347 6100 Ext 231
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From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Sunday, 28 August 2022 10:44 pm

To: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>; Gabriel Wee <Gabriel@iii.com.sg>

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] - RE: SLP5819X (PRE-INSPECTION) ; YOUR REF : SLS2960Z (INDIA) ; DOA : 27/08/2022 19:20

Dear Sir / Madam,

Resend with attachment.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Sunday, August 28, 2022 10:40 PM

To: 'Motor Claim - IlI' <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>; Gabriel Wee <Gabriel@iii.com.sg>

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SLP5819X (PRE-INSPECTION) ; YOUR REF : SLS2960Z (INDIA) ; DOA : 27/08/2022 19:20

URGENT



