EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: Yeo Poh Suan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <PohSuan.Yeo@strides.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 15 November 2022 11:11 AM
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)
Cc: SUR; CS A Team; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: SHB60OOE
Hi,

Amount confirmed as per your recommendation,
thanks.

Thanks & Regards

Yeo Poh Suan

Strides Automotive Services
PohSuan.Yeo@strides.com.sg

STRIDES

AUTOMOTIVE

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 14 November 2022 1:40 pm

To: Yeo Poh Suan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <PohSuan.Yeo@strides.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@Ikkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SHB600OE

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of SMRT. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender and
are expecting the content or attachment.

Hi Poh Suan,
Please refer attached, COR $9372.16, 8 days.
Subject to insurance approval.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Yeo Poh Suan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <PohSuan.Yeo@strides.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 21 October 2022 4:14 pm

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SHB600OOE




