Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, August 23, 2022 11:23 AM

To: ‘Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore)’; Admin A

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: TP DS claim [EXT] Fwd: (PRS) - OUR REF M5823 GBG662D THIRD P VEHICLE

SMS8878C DOA 06/08/2022

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged
Categories: HMK
Dear Shanti,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 August 2022 10:40 AM

To: admin-a@lkkauto.com; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Autolnsure (Claims) <claims01@autoinsure.com.sg>

Subject: TP DS claim [EXT] Fwd: (PRS) - OUR REF M5823 GBG662D THIRD P VEHICLE SMS8878C DOA 06/08/2022

Internal

Your ref: GBG662D
Our ref: 2022 22006018KC-SMS8878C

Dear Sirs,
We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Please download the documents from this link below (For Survey)

File: GBG662D-(TP).pdf, SMS8878C(Ql).pdf
Link: https:/ffilexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=5d40ec28-93d7-41d1-b559-b45035eb3c76-
37286b10ffd8907d




Size: ~ 3 MByte, Download available until: 8/28/2022

Passwords will be sent in a separate email.

Thank you.

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

QQL | Altianz @ | (.
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This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.

&2 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Autolnsure (Claims) <claims01 @autoinsure.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, August 23, 2022 9:05 AM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] Fwd: (PRS) - OUR REF M5823 GBG662D THIRD P VEHICLE SMS8878C DOA 06/08/2022

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear All,

Kindly be reminded that we sent an email date August 08 to conduct a Pre-Repair Survey for the said vehicle
at our premises.
Thank You.

Regards
Mae

did: (65) 3157 2624 / 3157 2628
mobile: (65) 9743 6363
e: claims01@autoinsure.com.sg

Auto Insure Pte. Ltd.
201437380M
6 Marsiling Lane S739145

t: (65) 3157 2626
f: (65) 6368 0081
W: Www.autoinsure.com.sq




g.e: claims@autoinsure.com.sg

-- Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may contain information that is
privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that
any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the

sender and delete the mail.--

Data Privacy Policy Notice: Auto Insure Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes stated in our Privacy Policy. This may
Include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers
and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for our Privacy Policy.

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Autolnsure (Claims) <claims01 @autoinsure.com.sg>

Date: Mon, Aug 8, 2022 at 3:24 PM

Subject: (PRS) - OUR REF M5823 GBG662D THIRD P VEHICLE SMS8878C DOA 06/08/2022
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear All,

Attached for your attention.

Do revert with the SJE appointed for the above matter and conduct Pre-Repair Survey for the said
vehicle at our premises.

Thank You.
Regards
did: (65) 3157 2624 / 3157 2628

mobile: (65) 9743 6363
e: claims01@autoinsure.com.sg

Auto Insure Pte. Ltd.
201437380M
6 Marsiling Lane S739145

t: (65) 3157 2626

f: (65) 6368 0081

w: www.autoinsure.com.sg
g.e: claims@autoinsure.com.sg

-- Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may contain information that is
privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that
any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the

sender and delete the mail.--

Data Privacy Policy Notice: Auto Insure Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes stated in our Privacy Policy. This may
Include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers
and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for our Privacy Policy.



